Wt Fo Fho Teo-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. 1.-33004/99

B
@he Gazette of 1md1a

: EXTRAORDINARY
HIT 1I—daug 3—39-9Us (i)
PART 1I—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

wifter ¥ Wiy
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
|, 4211 , ¢ fooett, SRwufiaw, @ 2, 2015/ ImER 10, 1937
No. 421j NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JULY 2, 2015/ASADHA 10, 1937
S T TS HATT

T< fawstt, 2 5@, 2015

q1.F1.17. 525(37).—x9aril afasy Ay vg vl Suay sfafags, 1952 (1952%; 19) Frara7
1 3777 (1) F AT 9T AT 5 ZIT WET afREAT 7 TENT TG §U R AR TASET S qidey
fafer AT, 1952 § e s weives w2 % o Fefafa Fram st €, oratg-
1. (1) =@ dAT mr&ﬂﬁwﬁf&(mﬁ&rﬁ)ﬁw,zméwmi
(2) g R STy § v i fafer § et g _
2. T wfer Rt A9, 1952 %, ST 72 % AT (7) § ot o, 90 B s vt a%
3, 20 faa" stee quT srsg & witeafoa far smoy
[F1.8. TH-65013/1/2015 wgug-1I]
AT FHTT AT, §LF qH9F |
feoadft: #=ly wfasy R T, 1952%%2%—@1 1952 =1 stfdrg=rT dear arHrf. 1509
mwaqnw,mll,ms,ww()ﬁwﬂa%wwmwm%ﬁvnﬁ
a1z 3 Frerferfy s wreamel grar SRR v, -
L w1415, A 24 Ravas, 1964
1. granfR 1707, i 17 99w, 1965

2928 GI/2013 _ : (B



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

. arELfR. 473, A= 14 w14, 1877
v, grELf. 141, faeie 28 wFadr, 1982

v.  ararf. 449, R 31 9E, 1983

VI #r#Lfa. 188, fRatw 02 w74, 1985
VIL gL, 832, feT+ 23 srgae, 1987
S vl anEL . 421, i 12 |92, 1988

IX. anFnf. 221, @FF 15 914, 1990

X, grarf. 521, fAtw 16 snrer, 1991

X1  "THLR. 405, f2AiF 26 e, 1997
Xil.  #raELfA. 79, fRaiw 25 we=dy, 2000
X1 arErfA. 228(3), AT 22 7, 2007

. . . ~
(30 TodTeE 45 Faaiy
(), 90 15 FHAL

XV. @raF 3360, 4ais 04 75, 2012

Lo : o~ - -
X1V, HT &1 14, 20 2011

LEREA

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
P ' NOTIFICATION
New Defhi, the 2nd July, 2015

G.8.R. 525(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 read with sub-section (1) of section
7 of the Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central
Government hereby makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees” Provident Funds Scheme,
1952, namely :- ' '

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Provident Funds  (Amendment) Scheme,

2015.
 (2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette. -
2. In the Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952, in paragraph 72, in sub-paragraph (7) for the
figures and word “30 days” wherever they occur, the figures and word “20 days™ shall be substituted.
. [F.No. 5-65013/1/2015-S8-IT]

MANISH KUMAR GUPTA, Jt. Secy.

Note : The Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952 was published in the Gazette of India, Part II, Section
3, Sub-section (i) vide notification number SRO 1509 dated the 2" September, 1952 and paragraph 72 of the
Scheme was subsequently agzended vide notification numbers, -

{1) GSR 1415 dated 24" September, 1964

(i) 'GSR 1707 dated 17" November, 1965

(iiiy  GSR 473 dated 14" March, 1977

(iv}  GSR 141 dated 28" January, 1982

(v} - GSR 449 dated 31% May, 1983

(vi)  GSR 188 dated 2™ February, 1985

(vii)  GSR 832 dated 23" October, 1987

(vii) GSR 421 dated 12" May, 1988

(ix)  GSR 221 dated 15" March, 1990

(x)  GSR 521 dated 16™ August, 1991

{(xi)  GSR 405 dated 26™ August, 1997

(xii)  GSR 79 dated 25" February, 2000

(xiii} GSR 228(E) dated 22™ March, 2007

(xiv) GSR 25(E) dated 15 January, 2011

(xv)  GSR 336(E) dated 4™ May, 2012



[P [[-9@Y8 3 ()] T W] TET9S ST 3

arfergEeT
7E Rt 2 9, 2015

1. 526(a7).—FANTE qfer R we ot g s, 1952 (1952 77 19) £ 51T 7
F I7-AT (1) & 19 7T W0 6T FTT wEw aftwat w7 AR g Fve 9 GEgR waEr e
FISAT, 1955 w1 ST Feiree F0r ¥ v FrufafeT Fomr g & a7 - |

1. - (1) B0 TSR FHAT GO (Heee) TS, 2015 FE ST |
(2) ﬁmwﬁ.mwﬁﬁﬁr%wﬁ@ﬁ|

2. sl deg A, 1995 ¥, f?rrrqufrsrgrsﬁeoﬁ:r”maarrqagr“zoﬁ# a= T
gy foaT s o

fer.9. Ug-65013/1/2015 vaug-11]

v :rrr:rr_ﬂ'ﬁ'nv—rw-ﬁ-j—rr 4Qﬂ:=ﬁ- f 199

IS~ v, ==yl - froc] iy HH';n JHGJ—")V,

AT & ON9F, W I, @9F 3, I9-gV% (i) § whrfera 3w war or aur A § O 177 &+
SATEgEAT Wt 9TFLA. 134 fEaTE 28 wradr, 1996 gra a1 § gafiq far mr )

o e e
e

o T T
HrEE ZaIT DT Tt TARMETY ITIT
PSRRI WERD BLSLITH TS0 e

(J‘I

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 2nd July, 2015
G.S.R. 526(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6A read with sub-section (1) of
section 7 of the Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the
Central Government hereby makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees’ Pension Scheme,
1995, namely :-

1, (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Pension {Amendment) Scheme, 2015.
(2) 1t shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.
2. lrr the Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995, in paragraph 17-A, for the words “thirty days” wherever

they occur, the words “twenty days” shall be substituted. :
.[F. No. S-65013/1/2015-SS-11]

MANISH KUMAR GUPTA, Jt. Secy
Note : The Employees Pension Scheme, 1995 was published in the Gazette of India, Part 1, Section 3, Sub-

Section (i) vide notification number GSR 748(E) dated the 16" November, 1995 and paragraph 17-A of the
Scheme was subsequently amended vide notification number GSR 134 dated 28" February, 1996,

R
T4 faeslt, 2 9o, 2015

ar#n . 527(30). —Fard wisr B vy v sudy afafies, 1952 (1952 37 19) &1 arer 7
£ I (1) F AT AT Gy 6 d T Wewr ARt G FOr g7 FF AR W FE
T A AT, 1976 § 4 At gei w2 ¥ Ty el domr g & el |
1. (1) = qISET FF FAATT FeT dgag 97 (Ferde) =T, 2015 31 AT |

2) agwwﬁwﬁmsmaﬁrﬁﬁf%wﬁ@ﬁi

’



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAQRDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3{1)]

3. FATd Rér agag AT Ao, 1976 F, R 24 F 39 (4) F i o, 30 R ase s,
“20 B 53 & wivenfe R s
| (7.8, TH-65013/1/2015 THTH-11]
Aoty FATC THT, mgfﬁaﬁa’
fropeft: wdsT May wEeg S 9, 1976 i Wﬁlﬁ?‘i@[ a1.%7. 4. 488(sr) &ATs 28 TS 1976
I AT % TG, S 11, Ve 3, I9-9v% (i) F wwida fry mr ar arde s fw 24 A
& Frerforfare srfSrgae deavst g deive fray T, - '
I ar#rfA. 873, s 28 Rraw, 1986

. =& 420, Beis 31 sTed, 1992
. arF.f7. 334, R<i= 29 wg, 1997

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 2nd July, 2015
G.S.R, S27(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C read with sub-section (1) of
section 7 of the Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the
Central Government hereby makes the following Scheme further to amend the Empioyees Deposit-linked
Insurance Scheme, 1976, namely -
1. {1) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Deposit-linked Insurance (Amendment)
Scheme, 2015. '
(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Employees’ Deposit-linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 in paragraph 24, in sub-paragraph (4) for

the words “thirty days” wherever they occur, the words “twenty days” shall be substituted.
[F. No. $-65013/1/2015-88-1I]

MANISH KUMAR GUPTA, Jt. Secy.
Note : The Employees” Deposit-linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 was published in the Gazette of Incha Part I,
Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide notification number GSR 488(E) dated the 28™ July, 1976 and paragraph 24 of
the Scheme was subsequently amended vide notification number, -

(i)  GSR 873 dated 28" September, 1986
(i)  GSR 420 dated 31 August, 1992
(it)  GSR 334 dated 29" August 1997

Printed by the Manager, Government of india Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.





