
~ "Bo ito l@o -33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99 

Q:he <!JoLette of 3ndia ... _ .... 

~- 442) 

No. 442) 

~ 

EXTRAORDINARY 
'qJlT II-~ 3~-~ (i) 

PART 11-Section 3-Sub-section (i) 
~ ~ IOICfll~li'l 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

'9'fffi'@f, ~. :wm; 22, 2014/ mcfOT 31, 1936 

NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, AUGUST 22, 2014/SRA VANA 31, 1936 

~ ~ (l;Jt4JJ< 4~1~4 

~ 
<1{ ~. 22 ~. 2014 

m.<fiT.f.t.soa(~ ).-Cfl4"11;[) ~ f.tfu- (p.IT ~ ~u ~ . . 1952 (1952 <fiT 19) eft 

urn 7 eft \311-urn ( 1) ~ ~ ~ urn 5 iiTU ~ ~Tfu:;7[f <fiT ~ m @Q: ~ "fRCfiR 

Qd ~, 'U Cfl4'91 tl ~ f.1fir (p.IT ~ ~u ~. 1952 if 3ltt an1r "ff~rr~ m ~ ~ 

f.it'IR!Rsld ~ ~ ~. ~:-

1. (1) ~ ~ 911 Cfl44:u;Q ~ f.ffir ("ff~rr~)~. 2o14 ~ ~~ 

(2) ~ 01 ffidkl<, 2014 if -sroo~1 

2. Cfl4'91tl ~ f.ffir ~. 1952 if-

(Cfi) t'l<I<JILfl 2 ~~(":if)~ \311 ~ (ii) if~~"~:~~~ "if~- m" 911 ~~ '~ ~ 
m"if~~~; 

<~) t'l<I~ILfl 26 it \311-~ (6) if~~"~:~* qN "if~- m" 911 ~~ "~ ~ m" if 
~~~; 

(1f) t'l<I<JILfl 26<fi it \311-~ (2) it~ if~~"~:~ 3ltt ~"if~- m" ~ ~ 3lffi "@ ~ 
~~"~~m" if~~~~ 

3297GV2014 ( l) 

[w."ff. ~-35012/1/2012 ~-II] 

~~~.a:rn.-~ 



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II- SEC. 3(i)) 

I . 

~: 'h4"'lltl ~ f.mT ~. 1952 ~ 2 ffFtkl~, 1952 ct?r ~ m.<fiT.f.t. 1509 g:ru m«r ~ 
m, ~II, ~ 3, ~ ~ (i) if~ <fiT TJt ~ 3lh: WRr ~-~<it~ if f.h.J~Rsid 
~arr ~ ~!(ITFmr Fcn<rr <m ~:-

,(1) m.<fiT.f.t. 584, ~ 11lf{, 1959 

{2) m.<fiT.f.t. 1522, ~ 16 Rijk!<:, 1960 

(3) m.<fiT.f.t. 201, ~ 81:fKG!ft, 1961 

(4) m.<fiT.f.t. 689, ~ 19 ~. 1990 

(5) m.<fiT.f.t. 326(ar), ~ 41:1{, 2001 

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014 

G.S.R. 608 (E).-In exercise ofthe powers conferred by section 5 read with Sub-section(!) of Section 7 ofthe 

Employees ' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby 
makes the following Scheme, further to amend the Employees' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952, namely:-

! . ( 1) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Provident Funds (Amendment) Scheme, 2014. 
(2) It shall come into force on and from the 1'1 day ofSeptember, 2014. 

2. In the Employees' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952,-

(a} in paragraph 2, in clause (f), in sub-clause (ii), for the words "six thousand and five hundred rupees", the 
words " fifteen thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(b) in paragraph 26, in sub- paragraph (6), for the words "six thousand and five hundred rupees", the words 
"fifteen thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(c) in paragraph 26A, in sub-paragraph (2), in the proviso, for the words "six thousand and five hundred 
rupees", wherever they occur, the words "fifteen thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

[F. No. S-35012/112012-SS.II] 

ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Add!. Secy. 

Note:- The Employees' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952 was published in the Gazette of India, Part II, Section 3, Sub­
section (i) dated the 2nd September, 1952 vide notification number S.R.O. 1509 and the relevant paragraphs 
were subsequently amended as follows:-
1. G.S.R. 584, dated the 11th May, 1959. 
2. G.S.R. 1522, dated the 16th December, 1960. 
3. G.S.R. 201, dated the 8th February, 1961. 
4. G.S.R. 689, dated the 19th October, 1990. 
5. G.S.R. 326 (E), dated the 4th May, 2001. 

3f~{il'11 

<r{ ~. 22 ~. 2014 

m.<fiT.f.t.sog (ar).~ ~ f.tW (f~ ~ m~ ~. 1952 (1952 <fiT 19) <fiT urn 7 
- - - ~ ----- -- - - - - - - - - -

<fiT ~-mn (1) ~ 'ff'8T ~urn 61f ;Rf ~ !(rfWIT <fiT~ m ~ ~ W'hR Cfl4"'llt1 tr!('R~, 

: 1995 if 3lh: ~!(ITu<r m ~ ~ R i>i ~ f€l d ~ ~ ~. ~:-

1. (1) ~ ~ 'h4"'llt1 tr!(R (~!(ITu<r) ~. 2014 Cfl~~I({~AI 

/ 



['11PT IJ - (911S 3(i)] 3 

(2) ~o1 ~. 2014<Fram~~inrm<ft~l 

2. Cflll"''l £l i'f!?R ~. 1952 if (Qd 54 'lid ~ <fr\1RT ~~if~) tl-a-3 ~ \3"11-tlu 2 ~~if Cfl@ 

m 31-R erR-!{~·~~ "Yttr -m m· ~ WR tR": ~~~ ~ m' !{~ ~~-~ ~~ 

3 . ~ ~ ~ ~<I;Jilfl 6 ~ ~ (Cfi) if~!?~, aicf;T ~ 31e-R'f "31~ Cflll"''l£1 ~ f.'tfir ~. 

1952 ~ 27 -Cfi'' ~ "Y"~ ~~~ ~ m ;nr ~ <FT ~ ~ m ~ ~ 31'4CIT Cfil1 ~· !{~ 3N:~ 1 ftl ('j 
~~I 

4. Tf1~~ta 11 if-

(CF) \N-ta<1) ~-m~~~~<;>~Rlf€id ~~~. 1Tl1Cf:-

"( 1) i'f!?R ~ ffi ~ ~ ~ ffi ~ ;:;fl i'f!?R Rm cfiT fl qf4 d I B' m-rm cfiT ~ B' mo 
$ T-f cfiT 3fC.fW if oo cfiT at!?lWft arcmr ~ ~ m ~ ~ arran:$~ Fctm B-~ ~ 
~ m ~ ~ i'f!?R <ITnr m CflT f.t~ o 1 ff1 a kl ~. 2014 -acfl cfiT -rt i'f!?R <ITnr oo ~ ~ 
fl +i I jY i f8 Cfl arran: tR": feti<:rr ~. ;:;fr ~ ~ ~ ~ 3ltt -qt;;r -m m Sl f8 +i I \Z Gm m ~ 
cfiT 3fC.fW ~ ~ 3ffitm ~ ~ m Sl ru +i 1 ~ ~ 31~<rrm ~: 

Gf!?N fct; cFTt ~ i'f!?R f.'tfir cfiT fl qf4 d I m ~ cfiT ~ B' mo ~ ¥ cfiT 3fiffiT ~ ~ 
~ ffi rrW tiT "%f ~err ;nr 3fC.fW ~ ~ ~ ~ m i'f!?R f.tfiT if af!?RR ~ "f!TO ~ ~ 

tt m ~ 3thrcr cfiT ~ B-~ -rt ~. <FT m i'f!?R cfiT 1fURf ~ ~ i'f!?R <ITnr m ~ ~ if lfT'IT 

~; 

("&") \3"11-ta (2) if~ Cfl@ m "12 ~· atCfi ~ !{~ an-q: if m ~ "mo ~· !{~ ~ ~ 

~; 

(lf) \3"11-tl-a (3) if-

Ci) 31~ ~ atCfi ~~~ ~ "Yttr fit mt65oo m· ~ f~ tR": ·~ ~ m· 
~~~; 

(ii) ~~~~~ 

(tr) \3"11-tttr (3) ~ ~. f.i<;>~Rlf€id \3"11-tttr ahr:f~ ~ ~. 1Tl1Cf :-

"(4) 1 ~.2014 cf;T fB:mt ~ 3f¥R ~~;:;IT f.i<liffll ~ Cflll"''l£1 ~ ~ tR": ~ ~ 

"Yttf fit m Sl f8 +i I~ B' 3ffiler ffi ~ 3ITaK tR": af!?RR ~ ~ ~. ~ f.i <li ftll ~ Cflll"''l £1 IDU ~ ~ B' 
~ ~ "fR erR"~~~ arrun: tR": ~ ~ m Slf8 +i I~ B' ~ ffi tR": af!?RR ~ W 
~m~: 

or!?rn fct ~ ~ <FT, ~ ~ m B- affi1efi m ~ cfiT fB:mt if s:tr ~ ~ 

~m ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ Cfl4"'1111:41. IDU ~ atm if B-
3i fci f1:ftl af!?RR ~ ~if 1.16 m!?Td" cfiT ~ B' af!?RR ~ ~: 

Gf!?rn fct ~ ~ CflT ~ 1 ~. 2014 ~ ~ ~ cfiT 3fC.fW ~ '4tcR ~ ~: 
Gf!?rn ~ m fct ~ ~ f.'tfir ~ ¢ ~ if Fcl~ rr~ . arcmr CflT ~ ~ ~ it 

~ 3l<ffu -acfl ~ <rft ~-IDU 'Pffi1 CfiRUT ~!?Thrr 1f<IT ~: 

Gf!?rn ~ m- fct <rR ~ 3Rfu (f4fdlf1:d 31cffiT $). if cFTt ~ <r@ ~ 1f<IT ~err~ 

lfRT ~ fct ~ ;r m cfiT ~ "4TliT B- 3ffiler at!?RR ~ ~ e€t rrW ~ ~ ~ m Ftfti if 
~ ~ cf;T m m+rr ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ at!?rm- <FT <ti4"'1 1£1 ~ Rfu <fr\1RT ~ ~ ~-
wn:r tR": ~ ~ ~ $ ~ ~ ~ f.tfiT tffi1 if~ fet;<:rr ~·I 



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II- SEC. 3(i)) 

5. ~ ~ ~ ~ 12 ~ \311-tu (2) if f.i~R!F€ia ~ ahr:~ ~ ~ rrr+rcr:-

''<r!?Rf fct \3tf ~ cFr ~ lf!{R filil'jqlfdCfl arran:~ 1 ~. 2014 CfCfi ifl?R <fTnr 00 ~ ~ 
%~'1t9mmllfBBI~~~if!?R<ITnrm~atr:m~cfit~~R-Q:~~ 

m Sl rB B 1 ~ ~ 3lfiTm m "{[{ f.t&tfur cfit ~·, 

6. ~~ifttn 14 ~~f.i~R!F€ia ~~Ft<rr~. rn+ra": 

"14. ~ OfiT ~ if!?R~ ~1:fl"';f~ ~ ~oo~~ ~erR-~-m ~ ~ ~ 
00 ~ cfit fcmt q-( ~58 qrt cfit ~ ~ ~ ~. ~ '4t ~ "@', Cfi) tu 12 ~ \N-tn (1) if 

f4 f.l ~I!! 1:fl"';f Ucrr ~ cfit "@', aT ~ ~ d I Rf Cfll '-q' if ~ ~ f.i Cfll J1 CiT~ m cfi'{~PfiT ~ Wm 
~ ~ \3tf fcmt Cfi1 58 qrt cfit ~ ~ <r ~ ~ 31~~ur.r ~ 'f>T ~-'C0'f m "fiB Cf.T ~ ~ 
tfCfiCIT ~: 

- ~!?rn fct DJt Sl'~'(i(O' C1T~ cfit 1fURT ~ ~ -oo ~ ~ tf+PT ~ m ~ m mm 
3fCffir cfit ~ ~ ~ m ~ mftcr ~ ~ ~ ~: 

~~'4tfcf;~~. Cfl4"'liD~if!?R~. 1971 ~~~~00~ 

R-Q: diRfCfll 'Cfi' ~ ~ Sl'~l(i(OI ~-00 ~ <>rrm ~~if qf(CfiRfd Cfm d!R!Cfll · '~' if~ 

Tfcli ~ ~~fU1a at!?RT'ff 'f>T 3ifdR'dl Slfd'fl~ m ~·, 

[1f.T. 'ft. ~-35012/1/2012-~-II] 

~~~.~~ 

fZcq-uft;-~ ~ Cfi1 ~ 16 ~. 1995 cfit ~ ~ m.'f>T.R. 748(31) m-n ~ Ft<rr <rrr 

~ crm ~ ~ ~ ~ 14 ~. 2013 cfit ~ ~ m.<f>T.f.f. 80(31.) ~ 'ft!?ilfucr Ft<rr <rrr 
~I 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014 

G.S.R. 609(E).- In exercise of powers conferred by section 6A read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of the 
Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby 
makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees' Pension Scheme, 1995, namely:-

!. ' (I) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Pension (Amendment) Scheme, 2014. 

(2) It shall come into force on and from the 1st day of September, 2014. 

2. In the Employees' Pension Scheme, 1995, (hereinafter referred to as the principal Scheme), in paragraph 3, in 
sub-paragraph 2, in the proviso, for the words "rupees six thousand and five hundred", wherever they occur, the words 
"fifteen thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

3: In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 6, in clause (a), after the words, figures and letter "or 27A of the 
Employees ' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952", the words "and whose pay on such date is less than or equal to fifteen 
thousand rupees", shall be inserted. 

4. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 11,-

(a) for sub-paragraph (l) and the proviso thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
"(!) The pensionable salary shall be the average monthly pay drawn in any manner including on piece rate basis 
during contributory period of service in the span of sixty months preceding the date of exit from the membership 
of the Pension Fund and the pensionable salary shall be determined on pro-rata basis for the pensionable service 
up to the 1st day-of September,-2014, subjeGt to a maximum of six thousand and five _hundred rupees per_month 
and for the period thereafter at the maximum of fifteen thousand rupees per month: 

Provided that if a member was not in receipt of full pay during the period of sixty months preceding the 
day he ceased to be the member of the Pension Fund, the average of previous sixty months full pay drawn by 
him during the period for which contribution to the pension fund was recovered, shall be taken into account as 
pensionable salary for calculating pension; 

/ 

,, 



['IWT II-<§i'U6 3(i)] 5 

(b) in sub-paragraph (2), for the figures and word "12 months", wherever they occur, the words "sixty months" 
shall be substituted; 

(c) in sub-paragraph (3),-
(i) for the words, letters and figures "rupees six thousand and five hundred!Rs. 6500", the words "fifteen 

thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 
(ii) the proviso shall be omitted. 

(d) after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely:-
"(4) The existing members as on the 1'1 day of September, 2014, who at the option of the employer and 
employee, had been contributing on salary exceeding six thousand and five hundred rupees per month, may on a 
fresh option to be exercised jointly by the employer and employee continue to contribute on salary exceeding 
fifteen thousand rupees per month: 

Provided that the aforesaid members have to contribute at the rate of 1.16 per cent on salary exceeding 
fifteen thousand rupees as an additional contribution from and out of the contributions payable by the employees 
for each month under the provisions of the Act or the rules made thereunder: 

Provided further that the fresh option shall be exercised by the member within a period of six months 
from the I '1 day of September, 2014: 

Provided also that the period specified in the second proviso may, on sufficient cause being shown by 
the member, be extended by the Regional Provident Fund Commissioner for a further period not exceeding six 
months: 

Provided also that if no option is exercised by the member within such period (including the extended 
period), it shall be deemed that the member has not opted for contribution over wage ceiling and the 
contributions to the Pension Fund made over the wage ceiling in respect of the member shall be diverted to the 
Provident Fund account of the member along with interest as declared under the Employees' Provident Fund 
Scheme from time to time. 

5. In the principal Scheme in paragraph 12, in sub-paragraph (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:­

"Provided that the members' monthly pension shall be determined on a pro-rata basis for the pensionable 
service up to the I '1 day of September, 2014 at the maximum pensionable salary of six thousand and five 
hundred rupees per month and for the period thereafter at the maximum pensionable salary of fifteen thousand 
rupees per month". 

6. In the principal Scheme, for paragraph 14 the following paragraph shall be substituted, namely: -

"14. Benefits on leaving service before being eligible for monthly member's pension.- If a member has not 
rendered the eligible service specified in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 12 on the date of exit, or on attaining 
the 58 years of age, whichever is earlier, such member shall be entitled to a withdrawal benefit as laid down in 
Table 'D' or may opt to receive the Scheme certificate provided on the date he has not attained 58 years of age: 

Provided that for calculating such withdrawal benefit, the wages at exit shall be the weighted average 
of his wages at the end of every wage ceiling period: 

Provided further that an existing member shall receive additional return of contributions for his past 
service under the Employees' Family Pension Scheme, 1971, computed as withdrawal-cum-retirement benefits 
as per Table 'A' multiplied by the factor given in Table 'B' ". 

[F.No. S-350 12/l/20 12-SS-II] 

ARUN KUMAR SINHA,Addl. Secy. 

Note: The principal Scheme was published in the Gazette oflndia, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide 
notification number G.S.R. 748 (E), dated the 16th November, 1995 and last amended vide notification number G.S.R. 
80(E) dated the 14th February, 2013. 

3{~«"'1'11 

ort ~. 22 31lffif, 2014 

m.~.f.f.610(aT): Cfi4"'11£1 ~ ·f.ffit a:?.IT ~ ~u ~.- 1952 (1952 CfiT 19) cfiT 
mu 7 cf;T ";j<f-URf (1) ~ m~ ~ mu 61f m-u ~ !(~ CfiT ~ m ~ ~ ~ 
Cfi4"'11£1 f.tW:r~oo~. 1976 ~ ~ tt!?oo m ~ ~ f.ll?!Rqf€1ij ~ q;:mff ~. ~=-

1. (1) ~ ~ q:;t:f;:n£1 f.t~~oo (tr!?Trurr) ~. 2014 Cfi~&ll~iAI 

3)-97 c;;;;,~-)_ 



: 

6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II-SEC. 3(i)] 

' (2) ~ 1 ~. 2014 if "SfliTCft ~I 

2. <h~hnD f.t~ ~ oo mrrr, 1976 ~ (~a~q<ia ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~) ~<ltlllfl7 ~. ~ 

~ <.ltlllfl(1)~"%~mffim' !?~;p~"R "~~m' !?~~fclict~i 
3. ~m-rrr~ ~<ltlllfl22 ~. ~-~z'~'lfl (3) ~. -

("oti) ~ (i) ~. "% ~ lft:9 ffl ~, !?~ ;p ~ 1R "~ ~ m · !?~ ~ ~ 

~; 

(lSI") fq~i:f)(OI if."%~ 1:ff:q m m ' !?~ ~ ~ 1R "~ ~ m ' !?~ ~~ fclict 

~I 
4. ~ mrrr ~ ~Zitl l lfl 22 ~. ~-~(l{lllfl (3) ;p ~. f.i~~Rsia ~-~'U1Jilfl ahf:~ ~ ~. 
rrn:J(f:-

"(4) ~ m-rrr ~ ~ ~.Clzrtlllfl 22 (1), (2) ~ (3). tm m ~ w. ;p ma-~ 
"0Tm ;p anncrf ~ iffi "Sffit!?Rf ~ R<lT ~I" 

[tfiT."ff. ~-35012/1/2012 ~-II] 

~~~.3l'R.~ 
~: <h4"'liD f.t~-~ oo m-rrr. 1976 ~ 28 ¥rt. 1976 ~ m~<fiT. f.t . 488(31Hrr~Pn~ ;p 

~. 31m~. ~ II, ~3. ~~ (i) ~~ofit1ftm~~~~f.i~ l~fl i Z "ff!?Trfmf~ 

..-r:rr ~: -

(1) m.<fif.f.t. 1788, ~07. 12.1976 

(2) m.<fif.f.t. 648, ~ 01 .05.1977 

(3) m.<fiT.f.t. 329, ~ 20.02.1978 

(4) m.<fif.f.t. 369, ~ 14.07.1978 

(5) m.<fif.f.t. 67, ~ 23.12.1 978 

(6) m.<fif.f.t. 1013, ~ 12.09.1980 

(7) m.<fiT.f.t. 548, ~ 03.10.1981 

(8) m.<fif.f.t. 828, ~ 14.08.1985 

(9) m.<fiT.f.t. 873, ~ 29.08.1986 

(10) m.<fif.f.t. 228, ~ 02.03.1989 

(11) m.<fif.f.t. 354, ~ 22.05.1990 

(12) m.<fiT.f.t. 30, ftrticf; 28.12.1990 

(13) m.<fif.f.t. 321, ftrticf; 16.08.1991 

( 14) m.<fiT.f.t. 420, ftrticf; 31 .08.1992 

(15) m.<fif.f.t. 176, ~07.03.1994 

(1 6) m."<hT.f.t. 334, ~ 29.08.1997 

(17) m."<hT.f.t. 238, ~ 13.06.2000 

(1 8) m."<hT.f.t. 523(31), ~ 18.06.2010 

(19) m."<hT.frr. 9(31), ftrticf; 08.01.2011 

(20) m.<fif.f.t. 83(31), ~ 11.02.2011 

,' 



['IWT II-~ 3(i)] 7 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014 

G.S.R. 610 (E). -In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C read with sub-section ( 1) of section 7 of 
the Employees ' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby 
makes the following scheme further to amend the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Schei?e,1976, namely:-

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance (Amendment) Scheme, 2014. 

(2) It shall come into force on and from the 1'1 day of September, 2014. 

2. In the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Scheme), in 
paragraph 7, in sub-paragraph (1), for the words "six thousand five hundred rupees", the words "fifteen thousand rupees" 
shall be s.ubstituted. 
3. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, in sub-paragraph (3),-

(a) in clause (i), for the words "six thousand five hundred rupees", the words "fifteen thousand rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

(b) in the Explanation, for the words ''rupees six thousand five hundred", the words "fifteen thousand rupees" 
shall be substituted. 

4. , In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, 
namely:-

"( 4) The benefit under this Scheme shall be further increased by twenty percent in addition to the benefits 
admissible under sub-paragraph (1), (2) or (3) of paragraph 22, as the case may be.". 

[F. No. S-35012/1/2012-SS.Il] 

ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl. Secy. 

Note:- The Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, 
Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i); vide number G.S.R. 488 (E), dated the 281

h July, 1976 and subsequently amended as 
follows:-

(1) GSR 1788, dated 07-12-1976 
(2) GSR 648, dated 01 -05-1977 
(3) GSR 329, dated 20-02-1978 
(4) GSR 369, dated 14-07-1978 
(5) GSR67,dated23-12-1978 
(6) GSR 1013, dated 12-09-1980 
(7) GSR 548, dated 03-10-198i 
(8) GSR 828, dated 14-08-1985 
(9) GSR 873, dated 29-08-1986 
(10) GSR228,dated02-03-1989 
(II) GSR 354, dated 22-05-1990 
(12) GSR 30, dated 28-12-1990 
(13) GSR 321, dated 16-08-1991 
(14) GSR420,dated31-08-1992 
(15) GSR 176, dated 07-03-1994 
(16) GSR 334, dated 29-08-1997 
(17) GSR 238, dated 13-06-2000 . 
(I 8) GSR 523(E), dated 18-06-2010 
(19) GSR 9(E), dated 08-01-2011 
(20) GSR 83(E), dated 11-02-2011 

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- I I 0064 
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 


