I Ho o Teio-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of Iudia

EXTRAORDINARY
HET [I—@U8 3—3U-EUs (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

Wi | gt
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
| 442] =3 Taoeil, YEhaR, 3TTET 22, 2014/ €07 31, 1936
No. 442] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, AUGUST 22, 2014/SRAVANA 31, 1936

; ¥ T AN {197
e aferg=T

S 7% feeell, 22 aTed, 2014
'm.fﬂ.ﬁf.eoé(sr )—Fgara wfesy f{fa qur whiot Sugy sfaRTE, 1952 (1952 &1 19) #
T 7 @ ST-"RT (1) % I Ufsd 4T 5 T WeW ARRAl # YAM FA EU F GHR
TaET sHER afEsy [Afy g vt sueg afaffaw, 1952 § o oo "eaw w9 % fow
Fefafea emT aaT §, Fuiq:-
1. (1) =& qeET 7 FHAE sy [fE (Feram) s, 2014 Fg7 91U
(2) == 01 sy, 2014 & wwrdt Erf
2. FHaTd wfasy @ FsEn, 1952 -
(F) TATE 2 F @O (F) F ST GUE (i) § M1 “F: T AT G0 G TG FT A58 “Trxg g
T & wivenfia BT sro;
(@) TXTE 26 F IT-UR7 (6) H o “F: I AR qIH €I TG HT 5% “UrRg A FAY” T
gfeearfaa T s,

() &wwzw%w-ﬁrr(z)%wﬁsrﬁ“wWﬁ?ﬁ?ﬁ@%”ﬁg’rﬁaﬁﬁﬁ
9158 “Irag 9 ¥98” § wiaeatua f&Far oo

[®1.9. Tg-35012/1/2012 wawa-1I]
20T FH (A, af~a

3297G1/2014 )



2

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

el

froqufy:

Q)
(2)
3)
(4)
(5)

FHeERT wiasy [AfY FoEr, 1952 feais 2 Rawax, 1952 &1 g&dr 9r.%1.f7. 1509 g1 9=a F
o, 9T 11, |@ve 3, I7 @ue (i) § g @t g oft sfw @9 R-urhn &1 9re # Rufafae

STfereEATSI gy genterg T s o
qr.#r.fA. 584, f&=i= 1195, 1959

qr.aLA. 1522, oA 16 Rg=, 1960
qr.71.f3. 201, AT+ 8 wadt, 1961
ar.#1.07. 689, A% 19 sragax, 1990
1.4, 326(3), famis 4 7€, 2001

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 608 (E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 read with Sub-section(1) of Section 7 of the

Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following Scheme, further to amend the Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952, namely:-

1.

(1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Provident Funds (Amendment) Scheme, 2014.
(2) It shall come into force on and from the 1* day of September, 2014.

In the Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952,-

(a) in paragraph 2, in clause (f), in sub-clause (ii), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupees”, the
words “ fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) in paragraph 26, in sub- paragraph (6), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupees”, the words
“fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(c) in paragraph 26A, in sub-paragraph (2), in the proviso, for the words “six thousand and five hundred
rupees”, wherever they occur, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

[F. No. S-35012/1/2012-SS.11]
ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl. Secy.

Note:- The Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952 was published in the Gazette of India, Part II, Section 3, Sub-

section (i) dated the 2nd September, 1952 vide notification number S.R.O. 1509 and the relevant paragraphs
were subsequently amended as follows:—

1. G.S.R. 584, dated the 11th May, 1959.

G.S.R. 1522, dated the 16th December, 1960.

G.S.R. 201, dated the 8th February, 1961.

G.S.R. 689, dated the 19th October, 1990.

G.S.R. 326 (E), dated the 4th May, 2001.

S e

Ffg=ET
7 faeett, 22 aTed, 2014

A1H1.1.609 (). — a1 ey Rfey am wfiod gwder sifrfiam, 1952 (1952 77 19) A a7 7

£ Ju-7T (1)%mqﬁaaffr6v ST Y& IRRaT &1 TART 3 T Frg GYHTE HHATLT G4 T,
- 1995 ¥ ST HereT F47 ¥ forg Fwfertea Fromr aard &, safq-

1.

(1) =g A1 T Yo (Feirere) AorT, 2014 FATT



[am [I-T7s 3(i)] HRA <hT TSI @ SHHETHRIT 3

2.

(2) =g 01 fAdar, 2014 FT qT ITF IT8 § THTE gIMT

FHATE TorT IS, 1952 § (TAGILIT HA ATSAT & &9 H H9q) F0-3 F I9-97 2 % 94gH H Fal

oft 3T FTe ereat ‘g BT Ui &Y ¥ 3 TITA UL “URE g TUY” 957 WiawdTiaa. R e

3.

T AT F ITATE 6 F @I (F) F YIF M1, i1 UF el “9ar FH=rdt wiasy [fEr e,

1952 & 27-F" & TATq ‘7 ora®1 a7 39 [y Fr 958 g9 T F IUE J997 749 81 061 Ja.eq19q
T STa

4.

A TTSTAT % 87 11 F —

(F) ST-I3T (1) X395 T & fore fAwfertaa sfaenfia e STosr, 9 -

“(1) Yo IR I A9T AT AR a9 g S G =y F geemar 7 FEeft S aie | 916
TR TF #T Sty & a7 £t sterardy srafer % S e 2 F sname gfga & Ay & sgha stea
AT 399 21T 3T 999 AR Jq7 &7 [Faior 01 faws, 2014 7% i 7S J99 a9 #4971 % fou

HHTITAS e 92 fEar s, Sy fF sfesan g g9 ST 9 |97 'Y GiaqTg 39T 394 91

1 73fg F forg srfgaaw 9og g% 799 iOATg & seardfig g
Ford T3 Frs aaeq Yo [ & qaegar gwmw g9 £ 7Y § 91 718 @ 1 7@y F e
T2 9a Tl 97 T@T g ar 39 Jaty & e Ses forg 399 Yam [ § steram fOeq 9o e F

X 999 & SAET A aC § TYAT TS ofY, FT Iq9F GorT F TUAT F {7 GOF IRT Iq9 F ®F § A7
ST,
(@) IT-9T (2) § T gl | “12 WIg” 37 ¥ 91e2 AT FI 37+ (T “A78 A" A8 Ghaedruq o

-~

STTUT,
(1) 39-9<T (3) H -
@) qHX A dF “Gg T TiH AT T94/6500 THA” F AW 9 “UEg g T
wfaera g Sra;
(i)  a%ege ger oA s

() 39-8%7 (3) F weaTa, Rwforfa su-S= st eenfoe T STos, a9 -
“(4) 1 frdaz,2014 $t Rafy ¥ sraame 390 w207 1 R 0F FHE F T W g a9

T AT F0F YTAATE 8 ST8E aa9 & A7 9% HqaT & @ ¥, T (AT uF FHAR g7 446 « T
m%mmwm%mmwmmmmamwmfmwm
9 Hhd g.

Fd % ITYT qIE F, THE X w9T § A(AF A9 g 4 Pafy F @ afytHEaw F
ST AT THS AT FAT TU [HFHT & Hqq Feds A1 & (o7 FAATET g7 oF Fq9 F §
FTARh steram % &9 § 1.16 iaerd ¥ 5T & feraT 347 20T

Ford T 91 AT F1 ¥4 1 f{day, 2014 & =g 91g it sty & ofiox s

FoF 77 +ff FF iy sy By s gAY woegE # R safy #7 fer gz w® &
HAATE AT TF FL FT< G2 I TITF FT07 2907 797 2

Ford ag A % 7f2 3 wafy (Reafa s=fa w29), § w1 BFer 980 397w &y & Tar
HTAT ST % #2699 HF Sgaw A7 & qfaF st F @y v 981 97 & 77 doe Ay &
I qEE FT gaq {HT & A18% F forg e v sterar #r w=<T wiasy [fd Fiomr F satq a99-
Y 9T JAT 919q 479 died gae7 & wiasy Afd @ & s o s



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

5. e A 3 ARy 12 ¥ 390y (2) # P aegs sienfid R Smed A
“geord fo 3T gaeq Fit AT ForT gHIATAS SR 9 1 fdeay, 2014 9% GO A7 q41 F U
T ZIT I |1 20 YIAATE F Afdsaw Ta7 % J99 X 37 39+ a1 &l o7afy 5 fow 93g o
03 ITqATE & ATIHan aaq 92 et i ST’

6. T AT § 837 14 F forg Rmfortee & sfaenfla B s, Jre:
“14. gEg F7 9IS G99 F forg ar g & Uge H4T S 97 e are arv- IR 8 5567 e
a1 Breq F Ay 9% srorar 58 v & sy T g 1), S oft vge &, & 9w 12 F 309 (1) H
fafAfEe ar a7 7 £ 2, 97 78 geeg arferar ¥’ § 7o RfFe Al &y #37 #7 gFa grm
AT 95 39 (A F7 58 F¢ Ff g T T FA F Teqef {7 AT FT THIIT-TF 76 F7 F1 faheq

HHAT B
Ford o UH TeATgLor A F¥ T F T 9T FiET F G997 ITHT 99 T dH 99 AT
Y ¥ FHTTH 9% IqF 9q9 % WG ed F I T

q%eq Tg A B ada gee, FHET afa Yo gsmEr, 1971 F savta st et dar

fere arfersT ‘F F AgER TATew gg-aar gy At F =9 § oo qur @ifeswr @ # i
T 217 Briore shersmt &7 srfafRes wiassr wma #3’)

[#71. 9. TH-35012/1/2012-780H-11]

o TR A e af=e

feoqofte- 9= FromT i s 16 7997, 1995 ¥ sfdgsaT gear ar.a.f. 748(3) gy wifrT oy maw

o7 77 foeft a8 39 faA7s 14 w2adt, 2013 € stfdgean dear avan.f5. 80(3r.) g wenfaa B
ol

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 609(E).— In exercise of powers conferred by section 6A read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of the
Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995, namely:—

I. " (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Pension (Amendment) Scheme, 2014,
(2) It shall come into force on and from the 1* day of September, 2014.

2 In the Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995, (hereinafter referred to as the principal Scheme), in paragraph 3, in
sub-paragraph 2, in the proviso, for the words “rupees six thousand and five hundred”, wherever they occur, the words
“fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 6, in clause (a), after the words, figures and letter “or 27A of the
Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952”, the words “and whose pay on such date is less than or equal to fifteen
thousand rupees”, shall be inserted.

4. - In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 11,-

(a) for sub-paragraph (1) and the proviso thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
“(1) The pensionable salary shall be the average monthly pay drawn in any manner including on piece rate basis
during contributory period of service in the span of sixty months preceding the date of exit from the membership
of the Pension Fund and the pensionable salary shall be determined on pro-rata basis for the pensionable service
up to the 1** day of September, 2014, subject to a maximum of six thousand and five hundred rupees per month
and for the period thereafter at the maximum of fifteen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that if a member was not in receipt of full pay during the period of sixty months preceding the
day he ceased to be the member of the Pension Fund, the average of previous sixty months full pay drawn by
him during the period for which contribution to the pension fund was recovered, shall be taken into account as

pensionable salary for calculating pension;



[sm 1-@7g 3(i)] - NI 1 U99A : HAETHRO 5

(b) in sub-paragraph (2), for the figures and word “12 months”, wherever they occur, the words “sixty months” -
shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-paragraph (3),-

(i) for the words, letters and figures “rupees six thousand and five hundred/Rs. 6500”, the words “fifteen

thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) the proviso shall be omitted. ;
(d) after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely:-
“(4) The existing members as on the 1* day of September, 2014, who at the option of the employer and
employee, had been contributing on salary exceeding six thousand and five hundred rupees per month, may on a
fresh option to be exercised jointly by the employer and employee continue to contribute on salary exceeding
fifteen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that the aforesaid members have to contribute at the rate of 1.16 per cent on salary exceeding
fifteen thousand rupees as an additional contribution from and out of the contributions payable by the employees
for each month under the provisions of the Act or the rules made thereunder:

Provided further that the fresh option shall be exercised by the member within a period of six months
from the 1*' day of September, 2014:

Provided also that the period specified in the second proviso may, on sufficient cause being shown by
the member, be extended by the Regional Provident Fund Commissioner for a further period not exceeding six
months: :

Provided also that if no option is exercised by the member within such period (including the extended
period), it shall be deemed that the member has not opted for contribution over wage ceiling and the
contributions to the Pension Fund made over the wage ceiling in respect of the member shall be diverted to the
Provident Fund account of the member along with interest as declared under the Employees’ Provident Fund
Scheme from time to time.

5. In the principal Scheme in paragraph 12, in sub-paragraph (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that the members’ monthly pension shall be determined on a pro-rata basis for the pensionable
service up to the 1* day of September, 2014 at the maximum pensionable salary of six thousand and five
hundred rupees per month and for the period thereafter at the maximum pensionable salary of fifteen thousand
rupees per month”.

6. In the principal Scheme, for paragraph 14 the following paragraph shall be substituted, namely:-

“14. Benefits on leaving service before being eligible for monthly member’s pension.- If a member has not
rendered the eligible service specified in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 12 on the date of exit, or on attaining
the 58 years of age, whichever is earlier, such member shall be entitled to a withdrawal benefit as laid down in
Table ‘D’ or may opt to receive the Scheme certificate provided on the date he has not attained 58 years of age:

Provided that for calculating such withdrawal benefit, the wages at exit shall be the weighted average
of his wages at the end of every wage ceiling period:

Provided further that an existing member shall receive additional return of contributions for his past
service under the Employees’ Family Pension Scheme, 1971, computed as withdrawal-cum-retirement benefits
as per Table ‘A’ multiplied by the factor given in Table ‘B* ™.

[F.No. S-35012/1/2012-SS-11]
ARUN KUMAR SINHA,Addl. Secy.

Note: The principal Scheme was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide
notification number G.S.R. 748 (E), dated the 16th November, 1995 and last amended vide notification number G.S.R.

80(E) dated the 14th February, 2013.

T Redt, 22 T, 2014
ar.#.4.610().—wd=ra 9fasy [Jfy qur vl Sugy sfaffgw, 1952 (1952 &1 19) it
g7 7 ® SY-gRT (1) F ATT 9fsd °RT 67 mmsemaﬁrwmg‘q%am
FAST aT Tgag 97 51, 1976 § A dara" A % g [uferen Aiomr aardr 8, a9i:-
1, (1) TE T FAAG AET agag 9T (Ferge) e, 2014 FEATO
2297 4':7;9—2_




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(2

7g 1 fAdsx, 2014 & wwrdt grm

2. FHAT R8T ggag 97 FieETn, 1976 & (TIgUeid HET A19AT & &9 H dafid) Wnms 7 8, 39
TTUTE (1) § “Tg §9E 19 1 9L S[ea] & €79 UL “Tag g €94 orex WiaeArioq &y o
3. A ST § GATE 22 H, I7-97TE (3) H, -
(F) @Y (i) ®, “Tg AT 7T dF TG Teal & &Y I “U5g AR e94 9req wioenfua fFo
WT@;
(@) FIEFT H, “TYg TAX T & TIA° geal & ©IF U “U5g AL TG 9s8 yiaeurva o
ST
4. q AT # s 22 #, 3T-UrE (3) ¥ g, Fufefed sy-imms siaenfie G s,

qIHT -

"(4) TH ST F S ATH,IATE 22 (1), (2) F¥ET (3), SEv oft ATHT g1, % siava qqwed
AT o SreATaT ST S wiaera e T sroam”

[®1.9. ©H-35012/1/2012 THUH-11 ]

froquft: F=TE Perg-dag FiT e, 1976 R 28 SIS, 1976 HEAT AT, 488(3) T WA F
TSI, FHTLT, 9H7 11, &@0€ 3, I7 U (i) § WHriarg it ¢ oF 3w 38 a1 § Fumgane gentaa G

AT AT
&)
2)
)
(4)
®)
(6)
€.
®)
)
(10)
an
(12)
(13)
(14)
(15)
(16)
a7
(13)
(19)
(20)

qr.#1.59. 1788, 271 07.12.1976
qr.#1.19. 648, f&71F 01.05.1977
qr.#.A. 329, A1+ 20.02.1978
qr.#1.19. 369, fa=i= 14.07.1978
ar.&.[. 67, faAi% 23.12.1978
q1.#1.59. 1013, f&=7= 12.09.1980
qr.#1.17. 548, AT+ 03.10.1981
qr.#1.f4. 828, &=+ 14.08.1985
Tr.#1.fA. 873, fRAT+ 29.08.1986
ar.#1.f4. 228, AT+ 02.03.1989
q1.%1.59. 354, fRi 22.05.1990
q1.%1.53. 30, fa=7% 28.12.1990
qr.#.f. 321, AT+ 16.08.1991
qr.#1.. 420, &A% 31.08.1992
qr.&.[. 176, fRATF 07.03.1994
ar.#.A. 334, A% 29.08.1997
q1.#1./4. 238, fa=7% 13.06.2000
ar.#1./. 523(z7), 2=+ 18.06.2010
q1.%7.53. 9(37), f2A7% 08.01.2011
qr.#1.17. 83(s1), =% 11.02.2011



»

[wmli—@vg 3(i)] A &1 TS9H : STEERT g

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 610 (E). —In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of
the Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following scheme further to amend the Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme,1976, namely:-

Il (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance (Amendment) Scheme, 2014.

(2) It shall come into force on and from the 1* day of September, 2014.
2 In the Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Scheme), in
paragraph 7, in sub-paragraph (1), for the words “six thousand five hundred rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”

shall be substituted.
3 In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, in sub-paragraph (3),-

(a) in clause (i), for the words “six thousand five hundred rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be

substituted;
(b) in the Explanation, for the words “rupees six thousand five hundred”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”

shall be substituted.

45 In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted,
namely:-

“(4) The benefit under this Scheme shall be further increased by twenty percent in addition to the benefits
admissible under sub-paragraph (1), (2) or (3) of paragraph 22, as the case may be.”.

[F. No. S-35012/1/2012-SS.11]
ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl. Secy.

Note:- The Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,
Part 11, Section 3, Sub-section (i); vide number G.S.R. 488 (E) , dated the 28" July, 1976 and subsequently amended as
follows:- .

) GSR 1788, dated 07-12-1976
Q) GSR 648, dated 01-05-1977
3) GSR 329, dated 20-02-1978
() GSR 369, dated 14-07-1978
) GSR 67, dated 23-12-1978
(6) GSR 1013, dated 12-09-1980
) GSR 548, dated 03-10-1981
(8) GSR 828, dated 14-08-1985
9) GSR 873, dated 29-08-1986

(10) GSR 228, dated 02-03-1989
(1n GSR 354, dated 22-05-1990
(12) GSR 30, dated 28-12-1990
(13) GSR 321, dated 16-08-1991
(14) GSR 420, dated 31-08-1992
(15) GSR 176, dated 07-03-1994
(16) GSR 334, dated 29-08-1997
(17) GSR 238, dated 13-06-2000 -
(18) GSR 523(E), dated 18-06-2010
(19) GSR 9(E), dated 08-01-2011
(20) GSR 83(E), dated 11-02-2011

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Dethi-110054.



