No. A-12030/03/2017-CLS-11
Government of India
Ministry of Labour & Employment

ER RS S

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.

Dated 05.09.2017
To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court/National Industrial Tribunal, Mumbai-I.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC)/National Industrial Tribunal (NIT) at Mumbai-I is to
be filled up shortly in accordance with the provisions contained in Sections 7 & 7B of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (relevant extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to
these provisions, the post can be held by a judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of a
High Court. A serving Judge can be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term.
A retired Judge can be appointed on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of
appointment of a Judge to the post of Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The
Presiding Officers of the Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries,
Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service) Rules, 2015].

2 The pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC/NIT, Mumbai-I is
Rs.80,000/- (fixed) per month.

3. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who are willing to be appointed
as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC/NIT, Mumbai-I and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may
please be furnished so as to reach this Ministry within a period of one month from the date of
issue of this letter i.e. by 04.10.2017 for selection of a suitable officer. The Bio-Data of each
officer may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-III to be filled by the concerned
officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General.

4, It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the requirements, as
mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on terms and conditions mentioned
in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be furnished to this Ministry along with
Annexure-III.

5. It is urged that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas and the
last date of sending of applications may strictly be adhered to. It is informed that only the
nominations with complete proformas (Annexure-III) received on/before
04.10.2017 will be considered by the Ministry. The matter may kindly be treated as
urgent.

Continued on Page 2



s
s

It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours fa('tfﬁfutly, P
s 02
(S. K. Sirfigh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India

Tel. No. 011-23766903
Copy to:

1. Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC/NIT,
Mumbai-I may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2. All Deputy Chief Labour Commissioners (Central) with the request to take up the matter
with the Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.
i >
Encl: Annexure-I, II, III. (J“LU[: c Bq\ k
(S. K. Singh)

Under Secretary to the Government of India



¥

ﬂ\ 1'\'11” x '\.J xe

The Industrial Disputes Acl, 1947 19

A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
- stries in a specified area or for one or more specifed industries and
her permanently or for a limited period.

5. Boards of Conciliation.—{1) The appropriate Governmen! may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gezette constitute a Board of
Conciliation for promoting the setilement of an industrial dispulte.

(23 A Board shal! consist of a chairman and two or four other members, as
the appropriate Government thinks fil.

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the partics to the
dispute and any person appointed to represent a party shall be appointed on the

recommendation of that party;

Provided that, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the appropriate Covernment shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent that party.

{4) A Board, having the prescribed gquorum, may act notwithstanding the
absence of Lhe chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that if the appropriate Government notifies Lhe Board that the
services of the chalrman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has
been appointed,

6. Courls of Inquiry.—{1) The appropriatec Government may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitule a Court of Inquiry for
inguiring into any matter appearnng to be connected with or relevanl o an
industrial dispute.

(2) A Court may consist of one independent person or of such number of
independenl persons as the appropriate Government may think [it and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the
chairman.

{3) A Courl, having the prescribed gquorum, may act notwithstan
nece of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in

the
wumber:

Provided that, if the appropriate Government notifies the Court that the
services of Lhe chairman have ceased to be available, he Courl shall not act until
a new chairman has been appointed.

!17. Labour Courts,—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour Courts for the adjudication
of-industrial disputes relating*to any-matter. specified in the Second Schedule
and for-performing-such other functiors as may be assigned to them-under this
At

(2) A Labour Court-shall- consist of one person only to be appointed by the
appropriate Government.

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 [w.e.F. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 7 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, see. 3 (w.ef. 26-6-1951).




20 The Industrial Disputes Acl, 1847 [Sec. 7

{3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as _the presiding officer -
of a Labour Court, unless— T Ze
ffa) _he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or~
(b) he has, for a period of not Jess_than three years, been a District Judge ..
or.an _Additional District Judge; or S dTE

Zf."\] —— ey

or ==
3[(e)] he has been lhe presiding officer of a Labour Court constituted,
~under any Provincial Act or State-Act for not less than five years.]
“[(f) he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.(Central) or
Joint Commissioner of the State Labour Deparbment, having a
degree in law and.at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department including three years of experience as Conciliation
Officer: "=~
Provided that no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or
Joint Labour Commissioner shall be appointed unless-he. resigns.
from the 'service of the Central Government or State Government, as
the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; orl
“(g) he is an.officer of Indian Legal Service in Grade I1I with three years’

:"I[l;fj] he has held any judicial office in India for not less than seven years;

experience in the grade,] ™~ 7 e - i s

STATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause {a) Inow re
lettered as clause {d!], for the words “seven 3”, substitute the words “three years™
[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.l. 29-4-1964

Goa—In section 7, in sub-secton [3), after

namely:—

"(d1) he has practised a5 an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
itigh Court or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law for the tfime being in force; or

(d2) he holds a degree in ‘fnw uf a university established by law in any part of India
or an egquivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Depuly Registrar of any Industrall Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituted under any law for the time being in force {or not less than five

ears; or

(d3) he holds a decree in law of 2 uruversity established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner of Labour under a State Government or a
Uniun territory administcalion for not less than five years; or™

IVide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).]

Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-sechion (3),—

i) in clause (b), after the words ~Additional District Judge”, insert the wozds “or a

~ Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”;

{ilg in clause (d), for the words “seven years” substitule the words “five years”;

(i) in clause (e}, for the words “five years” substitute the words “three years” and at
the end of the clause, insert the word “or”;

{iv) after clause (e}, insert the following clause, namely:—

“(f) hre has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or any Court subordinate therelo ur in any Industrial Court or
Industria! Tribunal or Labour Court constituted under any law for the time being
in force.”
1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).
Clause () omilted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f 21-B-1984).
. Clauses (a) and (b) reletlered as clauses (d) and (e} respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f.
15-12-1964),
4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, scc. 4 (w.ef 15-9-2010).

41

use (d), insont the following clauses,

W

Sec. 7] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gujaral Act 28 of 1977, sec, 2)
Harvana.—n section 7, in sub-section (3),—
(i) for clause (b), substtute the following clause, namelvi—
“{b) he is qualified for appoiniment as, is or has been, a Dustrict Judge or an
Additional District Judge or; ang”
(ii} after clause (¢), insert the following clause, namely:—
"(cc) he has been a Commissioner of a division o an Admninistrative Secretary to
Govertument or an officer of the Labour Department not below (he rank of a foint
Labour Commissioner for a period of no! less than two years; or”
[Vide Flaryana Act 39 of 1975, sec. 2 (weef 12-8-19756)]
Madhya Pradesh.—In scction 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
namely—
“(1A) In adudition lo the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Lahour Court shall
ffi unishable under thus Act and the Acls specified in Part B of ¢

aa7 1

) )

1Act 43 of 198!, sec. 3 (guosed

{Vide Mad

In section 7, sub-section (1A}, as inserted by Machya Prad
above), has been onmitted

1Vide Madhva Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellancous Provisions Act,
of 2003).)

Maharashtra.——In section 7, in sub-section (3), afler clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:—

*(d1) he has pracised as an advocate or atlorney for not less than seven years in the
High Cuurt, ar any court subprdinate thereto, ar any Induatrial Covrt'or Tribunal
or F%.a.huur Coutt, constmuted under any law for the thme belng In foree; or

(d2) he holds a degree in law of & university established by law in any patt of India
and 18 holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fivgyears; or".

[Vule Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2.}
After clause (d2), insert the following clavse, namely:—

“{d3) he holds a degree in law ufg:. university established by law in any past of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistanl
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than five
years, or”

[Vide Maharashira Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.ef 27-5-19756).]
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), aller clause (o), insert the
fullowing clauses, namely—
“c) he is or has been a District Judge; or
{d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate
Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Disputus (Appellace Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribopal for a period not less than two years,”
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1956 (w.ef 1-11-1966}.]
Ed. The above said amendiments were made prior lo the amendmenls made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.ef 21-8-1984). i
Uttar Pradesh.—In section 7, alter sub-section (3}, msert the following sub-secion,
namely:—

“(3A) In relation to indusmial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clae
clause (a) of section 2 or in secSon 4 of the Indusirial Disputes (Banking and
Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shall have
effect as if—

(a) after clause (c) the following new clauses {d) and (¢) had been added:—
“(d) is or has been a Magistrate of the firs: class for a period exceeding two
years;
(e) 14 a person possessing more an two years’ practicsl experience of
adjudicati:\g or settling industrial disputes”; )
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)” the words “or clause {d) or clause
(e)" had Leen added”.
1Vide Ullar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f 26-6-1951) ]
Ed—The above said amendments were made prior lo the amendmeénts made by the
Central Act 34 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.c.f. 15.12-1964) and ‘Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-5-1984),
West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for ‘clause (b) substitute the following
clause, namely— ¥ .
“(b) he'is, or has been, a District Judge or an Addifional District Judge; or”
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 3 (w.c f. 22.1-1989) ]

3




22 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

COMMENTS
Right of Labour Court
Tae Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest of justice to seck
prope assistance anc grant ‘leave’ o a party before it is represented by a lewal
praciiioner; T.K Viargiwse v. Nichimen Carperation, (2002) 1V LLJ (Supp) Bom 1018
tI?A'-"l'riln.n'ka.hu—(l,! The appropriate Government may, by notification in
the Official' Gazette, constitute 'oneor ‘more-Industrial--Tribunals -for - the
adjucication of-industrial disputes rclating to any matter, whether specified in
the S:wcond- Schedule-or_the Third Schedule ?{and for performing such other
functons as may be assigned-to themi under this Actl.— —~  ~ o
(9-A Tribunal-shall-consist-of-one- person-only-to be_appainted by the
apprcpriate Government.
(%) A person shall nol be qualified for appointment as the presiding officer
of a Tribunal unless— '
{a)..-he is, or has been, a-Judge of a High Court; or"
(aa) hehas, for a period of not less than three-years, been a District Judge
or.an Additional District- Judge; 4[***])
'I(®). he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or
Joint ,Commigsioner_of the State labpur Depargment,. having a
degree in law and at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department -including<three-years' of~experience- as- Conciliaton
Officer:
Provided .that no. such Depuly Chief Labour Commissioner .or
Joint Labour Commissioner-shall..be appointed unless he resigns
from the sexvice of the Central Government or State Government, as
the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
Ilc) he is‘an officer of Indian Legal Service in GradeTII-with three years'

experience in the-grade.]’
(+ The ‘appropriate-Government may, if it sg thinks fit, appoint two persons
as asstssors.{o.advise-the. Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

STATE AMENDMENTS
Asiam.—In seclion 7A, in sub-seclion (3), after clause (a) insert the following clause,
namely —
“[m) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Adiditional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court
Provided that the appoinunent to a Tribunal of any persof qualified under this
clause shall not be made without consultation with the Assam High Court; or”.
[Vile Assam Act § of 1962, sec. 2 (w.el 30-5-1962).)
Bilar.—In scction 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the following clause,
namely:— L ¥
“{as) he has worked as a Disirict Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years:

Provided that the appointment to’a Tribunal of any person qualified under this
clause shall be made in consultation with the High Court of the State in which the
Tribunal has or is intended to have, its usual place of sitting; or”.

[Vice Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec. 2 (w.ef. 7-7-1959).)

Irs. by Act 35 of 1956, scc. 4 (w.ef 10-3-1957).

Irs. by Acl 46 of 1982, sec. 4(a) {w.e.f. 21-8-1984),

Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.ef 15-12-1964).

Tre ward “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f, 21-8-1984).

. Ins, by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f, 15-9-2010). Earlier clause (b) was onutied by Act 46 of 1982,
set, 4 (w.ef. 21-8-1984).

6. Ini. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010),

O W

Sec. 7A| The Industnal Disputes Act, 1547 23

In section 7A, in sub-secuion (3), for clause (aa} substitule the fullowing clauses,

(D) he s, or has been, a District Judge, or

fc) he has, for a penod of not less than Uiree years, been an Additional District Judge
or an Assistant ]m.’ﬁ:, ur

(d) he is.qualified for appomtment as a Judge of the Iigh Cours”,
[Vide Gaa Act 5 of 1U87, sec. 3 (weed 21-10-1987) )

Gujarat.—Ls section 7A, in sub-section (3),—

(1} i clause (aa), aller the w “an Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or

a Joint Judge or an Assi Judge”

it} in clause (b) JEd use (b} has been omitted by Central Act 45 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.!
21-8-1984}], insert the word “or” at the end;
{in} after clause (b), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(¢) he has for not less than five years been the presding offieer of o Labour Courl
constituted under any law for the tme bemng in force”
[Vule Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.)
In sechion TA, in sub-sechon (3), atter clause I¢), insert

tire following clause, namely —

“{@) he holds a degree in law of a University ostat d by law in any partof India and
5 holding or has heid an office not lower rank than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under te State Government for not less than tsa years”
[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, see. 5 {w.ef 1-8-1981).]
Ed. The above satd amendments wese made prior to the amendments nude by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.el. 21-8-1084).
Haryana.--In section 7A, in sub-secton (3),—

(i) for clause (an), substilute the following clause, rumely —

“(aa) he is qualified for appointment as, is or hes been, a District Judge or an

Add:Honal District Judge; or”; and

(i1} aher clause (an), insert the foilawing clause, namsly:

“(amn) he has been a Comumissioner of o division or an Adrinistralive Secretary to
Governmient or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of o
Joint Labour Cormmussioner for a period of not less than two years; or’
IVl Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 {(w.ef. 12-8-1976) ]
Kerala.—In section 7A, In sub-section (3), for clause {a}, substitute the following clause,
ey —
“{a) he is, or has been, a judicial officer not below the rank of a District Judge, or is
gualified for appoinument as a Judge of a High Court; or”
{Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 {(w.ef. 27-7-19461)!
Madhya Pradesh,—In secton 74, for sub-seciion (3), substiite e fullowing sub-section,
namely—
“3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the Presiding Officer of a
Fribunal unless—
(2} he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or
(b} he is eligible for being appointed a Judge of a High Court; vr
{¢) he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue or
{d) he has worked as a member of the Board of Revenue for a period of not less
than three years; or
(¢} he has worked as Commissioner of Labour for a penod of not less than three
Years, or




24 The Indusinal Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7A

{5y he has worked as
"4

section 9 of the

for a period of not h ears,’
I wwa Pradesh Act 1V of sec: 3 (weell 15-1-108%) |

Maharashtra.—In section 74,
High Court™, insert the words “or a Diswict Judge or a person ou
Tudpe of'a Lhph Court”,

'Wide Maharashira Act 2 ol 1963, see 2 (weel 43-1963).)
sction 7A, in sub-section [3), in clause (aa), for e words “an Additional District

In st

Judge”, substinate the words "an Ad nial District Judge or an Assistant Judge or”.
After clause (), [Ed, Clause { 1€ been omitled by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w el

21-8-1984)], insert the following clause
residing officer of a Labour Courl

“{c} ke has for not less than five ve
4 foree.”

sttuted 1

arashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2]

r clause () inserr the fol

-_‘,: established by law in any part of Ludia
ice not Jower in rank than that ol
e Shale Government for nol less than ten

degree i law of ¢
is helding or has
Assistant Commissioner
years,”
[Vide Maharashtra Acl 22 of 1976, sec. 3.
Mysore (Karnataka).—({1) L1 section 7A, in sub-section (3), after claase (a}, insert the
fullowing clause, namely:-

i he is, or has been, a I

Fthe words “Distoct Judge”®,

i of nol less than three y

£ 12121963

Vids Mysore Act 25 of 1963, scc. 2 {w
Ed The above said amendments were made prier to the amend ments made by Cantral Ac
46 of 1582, sec 4 (wee [ 21-5-1984},
Orissa.—In section 74, in sub-section (3], after clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:—
“lan) he has been a member of the Orissa Supertor Judicial Servive Tur a periad of not

less than seven years.”

| Vide Crissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (wef 17-3-79803]
West Bengal.—In section 7A, in s
Court”, msert the wards “or a Distiict Jud
[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec

In section 7A, in sub-section (3

“{ae) he 15, or has beei, # Dist

[Vide ¥

est Bengal Act 35 of 1939, se

COMMENTS
Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal

Seciion A empowers the appropriate Government o constilule one or mare
irdustrial Triburals for adjudication of the disputes relaling o any maller specified in (he
Schedules, The Second Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matlers whiels fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial ‘Tribuns i Jagdssh Narain Sharmn v, Rajasthian Patrike Ltd., 15994
LLR 265 (Raj).

Sec. 7C) The Indusirial Disputes Act, 1947 25

[7B. National Tribunals.—({1) The Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Nationa! Industrial Tribunals for
the adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opinion of the Centra!
C.inve_rnn‘_en'_., involve guestions of national importance ar are of such a nature
that mdustrial establishments situated in more than one State are hkely {0 be
inferested in, or affected by, such disputes,

{2) A National Tribunal shall cons
the Central Government.

st of one person only to be appointed by

(3} A person shall not be qualified for appomtment as the press

of a National Tribunal *[unless he is, or has been, a Judge of a Hi

{4} The Central Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint iwo persons as
assessors 10 adyise the National Tribunal in the procee ng beiore it}

[7C. Disqualifications for the presiding officers of Labour Courts,
Tribunals and National Tribunals.—No person shall be appoinied o, or
continue in, the office of Lhe presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or
Nationa! Tribunal, if—

B officer
zh Court)

&°

(a) he is not an independent person; or
(b} he has attained the age of sixty-five years.]
STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam.—-In section 7C, in clause (), inser: the following proviso, namely—

idied that where such presiding
attains the age of sixt
©  proceecings pending before him,
such Government public interes
penod not exceeding six months for cemplebon of the proceed
{Vide Assam Acl 3 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.ef 30-4-1 562). ]

Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7C, for clause {b), substinute the following

clause, namely — i :

officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
five years before the campletion of any

the

“(b) he has atwained the age of sixty-seven years”,

[Vide Punjab Act B of 1957, sec. 3 {wedf 3-6-1957) and the Central Act 31 af 1966.)
West Bengal.—Ln section 7C, in clause (bY, insert the following proviso, namely:—
“Provided that where such presi
Goverminient attains the age of sixty
pending before the State Government may, if
Govemment pu nterest so requires, order his continua

not exceeding six months for completion o

[Vidde West Bengal Act 11 of 1959, sec. 3 (w.e

ing officer of a Tribunal appointed by the Sate
¢ years before completion of any proceedings

n the opinion of such

ce in office for a period

proceedi

f. 27-10-1959).)
SECTION 7D

Gujarat—After section 7C, insert the following seclion, namel Yi—

“7ID, Certuin District Judees gualificd for appointuents on Tribunal constitubed
by Siake {Jaur:rm.':a';rf.---,’\;'ntwi:hstanc!ing anything contained in sub-section (1) of
section 7A,— ' : '

(1) The State Government may constitule an Industrial Tribural under that sub-
section for perfurming such other functions as may be assigned to it under this Act

{2) Where the State Government constituies a Tribunal under secdon 74 ihe

Ea
Tribunal may consist of a person who is, or has been, for a period of not less than

L. Ins by Act 36 of 1936, sec, 4 {w.ef. 10-3-1957).
2. ‘Subs. by Act.46 of 1982, sec. 5, for certain words (w.e.l. 21-8-1984).




26 Tha Indusinal Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7C

Joint District Judge and
of section 7A but subject

appointment as the

ars, istrict Judge or an Additional
contained i c
X L Al be deened
presidng officer of the Tribumal
(3} The appointment of a person qualified under clause {2 ) shall be made after
corsultation willy the High Court”

[Vide Gujaral Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e f. 9-8-1962) ]

![8. Filling of vacancies.—lf, for any rcason a vacancy {other than a
.c"—rnﬂr ahsence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a ] :nbo_u Court,

Tribuna! or National Tribunal or in the office of the Chairman or any other
membe-.r of a Board or Courl, then. in the case of a Nationa! Tribunal, the Central
Government and in any other case, the appropriat I_ Governument, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Ac! Lo fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at wiu ch
the vacancy is filled.

9. Finality of orders crmshlulmg Boards, ete.—{1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appoinling any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the pre..h_. o
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or Natiopa! Tribunal shall be cal led in
question in any manner; and no act or procec dmb before any Boar d or Court
shall be called in question in any manner on the r.ruurn. mcw'v of the exislence
of any vacancy in, or defect in the constitution of, such Board or Court

{2} No settlement arrived at in the cou
be invzlid by reason oaly of the facl ts
expiry of the period referred to in sub-section (

of section 13, as the case may be.

e of a concilialion m-me(’&_u";. shall
sottlement was arrived at after the
&) of section 12 or sub-section (3)

Where the report of any ment arrived at in the course of conciliation
procee.cmo before a Fm..m s HI\'neL. by the Chairman and all tw other members
of the Board, no such ‘clllemu‘t hall be invalid by reason only of the casual o1
unforeseen ahsence of any of the members (including the Chajrman) of the Board
during any stage of the proceeding|

HCHAPTER NA
NOTICE OF CHANGE
9A. Notice of change.—No, emplover, w 'n--r oposes to effect any ‘:Euﬁgc in
the cenditions v' service applicable to any workman in respect of any matter
specified in the Fourth Schedule, shall effect such change,—

(3) without giving to the workmen likely to be alfected by such change
a nolice in lhe preseribed manner of the nature of lhe change
proposed to be effected; or

(b) within (wenty-one days of giving such notice:
Provided tha! no notice shall be required for effecting any such change—

L. Subs by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 8 was substituted
b-_,- Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.ef 26-6-1951) .

2 ubs for section 9 (w.e.f, 10-3-1957} Earler section 9 was agvended
LI\. Act 40 51, sec. 5 (w.e.f 26-5-1951)

3 Chapter UA (conaining sections 9A and 9B) ins. by Act 36 of 19 36, sec. & (w.ef 10-3-1857)




Aymexyye - 11

S Eo o U 33004499 REGD. NO. D). 1.-33004/99

ASTUA

ahT $1J
Che Gazette of India

[T
EXTRAORDINARY
H}eT H—HEvg 3 34-@ve (i)
PART H—5cction 3 Sub-section (i)
nfusr @ wartye
PUBLISHED “\_' AUTHORITY

| 275) 73 feeett, srwmfaan, sy« 30, 2015 /avm@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937
T A TSI AT
st

a3 =1, 6 494, 2015

ar#L[. 336(H).—=11 Fr, wenfas (A afafaem, 1947 45 g 38 41 sy (1) &
w7 (W) 2191 92 Af=at a1 v 404 2w Fatataa Aoy gad 2, i —

1. aferg qvr sl s —(1) =+ Tt & d@fam am aw sena, srenfis g sy adia afimen
(AT, 9 =0y =1 AT F Faegq @ oord) Frerm, 2016 2

(2) 71 FTATA § 34 TATRT & AT A 99T B
2. qfvarare —(1) 24 [t & st a6 3 wmed 7 gerar aofae 7 20—
() “afafiaa” 7t iznfive Fare 4030w, 1947 (1947 31 14) 4fa9q 2 ;

(4) “Trrfa gt a afbfeag £aer 7, 990 75 9r a9 73 F edta deefe alaard T e
% fope =1fs afaua 2

(2) 3 wr=Af si? 92T F, W oed FoEt 5 owgen @ A afraiiia 53 2 wiq afafem i afaia 2
T A2l 44 & o1 39 Afafar 5 amen @7 2

3. wrdE—ET A st fofeefm gt v e i st o, afafaets i oaat
arrerar A4 At 1 2ot @i aartEs serefter f 200 Bt a3t o 9w F e 2nft)

920 GI20LS il



(25

THE GAZETTL OF INDIA | EXTRAORDINARY [PART 11850 301))

4. FAga.—1) 1181 b 3 firefe afasd = 399 80,000 = (Faq) affme 41 g == 7 2
A7 o daid dara avefiar f zon § afqfeats e b anfaga smefiei 1 e § e Goe
d131

(2) A = an st abaaem % fiaefa atasd a1 75 B 2o —

(i) Fvar =rrmftor (af4t2 =57) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 *.

(i) $5v1 =rrmedtor (49 4mft) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 .

(iii) Fret =rerfrer (sfas a7m) - 70,290-1540-76,450 #.

afd w12 & Aaa 7 e dee, o e A aer aafaaia w wee o E o gl o

wie g Phferefe afasrt F s d e s ) gt a8, soenbia e ar sy gem g
APY (AFETT) AT V1 AT e TR R e A dartager 2 iy B daa i 75 00 Bef aafaats
F R AL WA e 2 o g FF vE 2 a4 o A7 4 Ao gme @ e 2, feptm afasd F ooy
e Fam 71 srg o F 29y 1 7 52 oy s
5. wgms At —1grr sfdaenr g et gt dgard amr 39 v 3 450 57 55 AT 4
aATTA =it w1 a3 2
(2) a9 =AvrnAa A At atEee & fenfia albatar 41 42 aagea dzarE a3 w379 4
ZHaTT 0 Sl AT T F aaz ) At ger wvenrr 1 aizba Ben o smoem 2 oA
Afdaraa A1 a4fd F Fvm aefa sgatai 6 za dus F oA a7 Beoad F ud F aendia
A
6. T HRIEE war—(1) 71 abrFem & diefm al4ntTi 21 4z e afdges gm e Zrm e oo
ATl F =il w1 %3 20
(PR T e e T v e A O e e o (B Y P | A DT A N R T R A R R R AR T
e o et Tt A e A e gl falerfa 2
7. Tt Ravga —ader g & deefia afda iy F o wwfer gear sy arsan £ afagn
% ATt A e we gvereg Tl A el B AT AT G W AL 2, AR 0 T FAP 3
(Fafareerr afr=rh) fan, 1944 § a7 3watia aEFain a9 & Ao g 4
(2) =9 =remaAn At denfis gt 3 ofeefia afdafe & fan, B afaair w= e
F gz AtrEfT F oran Ay fadi F b Ffming 2of
8 g&t—din afirwrn & faefia wftmfn 5 B gd a s sma o e G aared
~erfior 41 AT e N
(2) aw =rvarAn o A@nfrs g & et atemien 5 Be, i b @ty ama s=3im
argTe F aye F ARt foear A e & afi fafaafaa 2
9. W frEr war.—(1) e sl & fimefta @t o B g qafEa Al
ar wetfeafa g ea i for afqem £ g T Frn a1 w0 a4 e s

(2) =m =T e drenties atren F ofeefe afaefal ¥ B sl aere 5 T
a1t & Foao sprr e s B wAn ar wAa Fon s



[ %7 -2 3(1) ] G B TSI ¢ STAIE

s

10 ATAT 'qa'[__‘i\]:l_)l-:ﬂ-."{ d‘lﬁj_c}:]{—;m\ ke Eﬁl— a9 :—#—r r{qi'_.iu-l e "*' HgT O q_]_{]_ﬁ T3 d1|,.| ,'.'{,L,:{}‘T EF i} - -
HAT F FHAT B4 | AT AT
11, gt ar R —(1) w1t affiasm & darflr i & f wefon g b agay aoff # foro
AT AT F0 Aile e o Ter et aren Pavana 20
(2) am FrT A s atrreor F Terfa atbata F fogh aen P devim st
A1t F e o Feafs F ave i 2l 2 Ay G i Bt e
by —(1) a1 e % farfta afdaatoan ® =g e e e At
41 7 Fora 73w % w0 H arga a1 F7 wde By s
(2) 4 PAPT A st i afaeor & dreete afgaifed 510z B w3 a3 awdi
#ilaﬁ o ‘,T’.] 0 'F-F ir‘q ]-. AR 1Y u—-r_a'- AT ﬂ—[m ATEA & q—Ji\M l’”‘:“__”? TET f“fm T|'T'1: T ﬁi['d; f_{é_\lq
BT HY
13, TIET ATAT WAr—(1) T8 2490 F wvaadl da4i F B srgerr wasiaen g ot sienfis
FEFATI AL A4H SITITAT T AP 404 & [0 g F 3enaa a9 ol agdRdd 4 A 2 T
HEA 3 42 A AT FATATAI ATAT ST F
(2) 49 #rorEa an s afigen F deefm attmtea % @ eaaiaom s g
At & e 2 Rafte # aras wttm =il 4 o st wwe F o A e T
FAHT? 21 |
14. sfd=rd ‘ﬂﬁm—lam Fﬁq._.-ﬂﬁjl?ﬂ';{ st a1 wharh afreafaf o0 i Gadi a
ATAATSA A 9l 4 Al SER F w20

15. 9= AT F.—34 qraelt 41 araa Brerr g § 708 afasren sy 9850 a9 a3 e a1 a9
qawt £ At F Pyt v a4t a q4dfaa sl £ 34 avn ® B 5 Qo ag smras, sientE
o a1 ardr e g FEm Fr i, v =i e w1 3 e AR A 2e
16. FrfErer & &t orfRp.—F41a wwr i 2 Fat F Gl saer a0 Bl oy wasd o s i ama
forfaer avq 1 afsn 26 |
[7F. 57%-26025/05/201 3-T{irAT1-2]
‘Kﬂm ﬂ_;q 7, :'i ’1}% ¥ i 3’]

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhs, the Gt April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(10),—In cxcercise of the powers conferred by clavse (eb of sub-section(1) ol Section 38 of the
Industrinl Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Govennment hereby makes the Tollowmg rules, namely . —

[, Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding OFficers ol e Labour
Coun, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions wf Service)
Rules. 2015

(23 They shall come mto furee on the date of thein poblicaten in the Ol Gazetle
2. Definitions.—( 1} In these rules, unless the contest otherwise reguires, -

Gy AT means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947).



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA | EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1—-Ste, 3]

(b “Presuding Otteer”™ means a person appomted as presuwliog officer under Seetions 72 7A or Section 7B
of the Act,

{2 Al other words and expressions used g not detined e these rules but defined e the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned (o them an the Act

3. Duration.—In ¢ase of appointment on deputation ol servinge judges as presiding olhicer, the nenal period
of appeintment shall be for a pertod of three years and in case of retired juclges, the appomtment shall be Gl the age of
65 years

4 Salary.—( 1} 'The Pay of the Presiding Ofhicer of National Tribunal shall be fixed o Rs 80,0004~ (Higed)
per month and this shall include the deputaven allowance in case of serving judges and gross pensien i case of retired

Judpes

(2 The Sulary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Cout or Industreial Tribunal shall be-

(1) the District Judee (Entry Leveh Re, 515501 230-38.9 31 380-63,070
(i) the District Jidge (Selection Grndey - Rs 5770041 230-58.930- 1 380-67,210
(1) the District Judge (Super tine Scile) = Rs. 70,290-1540-76. 450

per month inclusive of gross pension., pension equivalent or other retirement benefits. if any

Provided that i the case of an appumtment ol a person as o presiding officer, who has retired from Indiceal
Servive uras Depoty Chiel Labour Commissioner (Ceitral) or Jomt Commissioner of the State: Government and who
1 oan receipt of o has received or has Becume catitled 1o receive any retirement benelit by way of penswon, the pay of
presiding oflicer shall be reduced by the gross amount ol Penston Trom the Pay so Tixed.

5. Dearness Allowanee.

(L3 The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the demess allowance
at the rate as admissible o the serving judges of the High Cowt,

(2} The presiding olTicers of the Labour Court or ddustrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowanee as
applicable to Group- A7 Officers ol the Central Government drawing o equivalent pay brom time fo fime
subject 1o the condition that rehed ol pension s deducted Trom the emolument deawn durmg 1he pepod of

re-eimployvinent.
6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1} For presiding ofhcers of National Tobunals: the vity vompensatory
allowance shall be as admissible o the serving judses of High Conrts,
(21 Tar presdimg officers of Labour Couet or Industrial Tribunal, the aity compensatory  allowanee shall be
regilated under the rules as applicable w the Group =A™ (Ol icers ol the Central Government
7. Medical Conecession.—i 1 For presiding elficers of e Nationad Tribuoal, the Centeal Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be avinlable at the station of posting wnd where the Central Government Hlealth Scheme s not i

uperation, they shall be entittled (o the facilties as provided i the Central Services (Medical Atiendanee) Rules, 1944,

(2) Ly prosiding officers of the Lihour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilities shall be regalated

under the rules as applicable to the Group-" A™ Officers of the Centeal Government.

8. Leave—(1) For presiding officers of the Natomal Tribunal. the matiers relaung to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges ol the High Courts.
(21 For presiding officers of the Labour Comrt or - Industrial Trihunal, the matters relitig 1o Teave shall be

regulated under the tules as apphcable o the Group- SAT OMTeers of the Central Government,

9 Honse Rent Allowance —i 13 For the presiding oflicers ol the Natonal Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommudation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowanee at the rate of thirty per cent ol the
hasic pay.

(21 For the presiding ofticers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House

Rent Allowsanee as admissible to the Group-=A" Officers of the Central Governtnent

1. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shadl be entitled the ravelling allowinee as per themr

entitlement on the rates al the time of ther rescemployment.



[ 501 =73 3] WA 1 TS o ST 5

11, Leave Travel Concession.—( 1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribwnal, the Teave ravel
concession lor seltand family shall be as admissible 1o the ighest grade m the Cenral Government

(2 For the presidimg officers o the Labowr Count or Industial Tobunal, the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as apphcable to re-cmploved person i respect of Presidimg Officers
appuinted on re-empluyed basis

12. Conveyance Allowance —(1) For the presading ofthicers of the National Tribunal, there shall be pravided
the conveyance allowance m the form o a fixed amount 1o be decnded by the Central Goverment from tme to tie

(2 The presiding officers of the Labour Cowt on Industoal Tribunal iy have an option either 1o have o
stall car for official purposes or use ol own vebiele with a grant of seventy live hitres of petrol per
month

13, Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The tmnsfer travelling allowance shall he as admissible oo
Government Servant ol the highest prade from home town to hemdguarters Tor joining the National Industrial Tribunal ot
Labour Courtand From headauarters i home town al the end of the assianment

(23 For the presiding offwcers of the Labour Covet ov Industesad Tribunal, the transter travelling allowinee
shall be as per Central Government rules as appheable to re-employed person i respect of presiding

ulTicers appointed on re-employed basis

14.  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled 10 join Comtnbutory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules dunng the pertod of recemployimen

15, Other Conditions of Service.—Mutiers relatimg to the terms and condimons of service of the Charperson
or other Members with respect s wiich no express provisions has been made i these rales, shall be retereed by the
Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal o the Central Government lor its decision, and the decision ol the
Central Government thereon shall be binding.

16.  Power to relax—The Central Government hive power (o relax the provision of any ol these rules m
respect vl any class or categories ol persous.

[Nu 2225025057201 3-CLS-11 |

IMIEERA) KUMAR. I Seey

Printed by the Manager. Government of India Press. Ring Road. Mayapuri. New Delln-110064
aned Pubilished by the Controller of Publications. Dethe- 110031



S

o

5. | Details
in
respect
of last/
current
post

1. | Name (in full)
2. | Date of Birth

3. | Educational Qualification

' Date of appointment to

Annexure-III

Proforma for Bio-data

(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
High Court Judge

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Name of the last/current post

last/current post
Date of retirement
Scale of pay
Last pay drawn

6. | Address for communication

8. | E-mail address

Date:

Place:

7 ' Phone no.

' (Office)

_ (Residential)
| (Mobile)

Signature:

Name:




