No. A-11016/4/2016-CLS-1I
Government of India
Ministry of Labour & Employment

AR KKK
Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.

Dated the 21* November, 2016
To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, New Delhi-II.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC) at New Delhi-II is to be filled up shortly in
accordance with the provisions contained in sections 7 & 7A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947
(extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to these provisions, the post can be held
by judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of High Court or who have rendered not less
than three years service as an Additional District Judge or a District Judge. A Serving Judge can
be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term. A Retired Judge can be
appointed on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of appointment of Judges to the
post of Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and
Conditions of Service) Rules, 2015].

2 The scales of pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC are as
follows:

(i) Distt. Judge (Entry Level) * Rs.51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070/-
(ii) Distt. Judge (Selection Grade) - Rs.57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210-1540-70,290/-
(iii) Distt. Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs.70,290-1540-76,450/-
3. It is requested that a panel of names of Judicial Officers who are willing to be appointed

as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC at New Delhi-II and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may
please be furnished to this Ministry within a period of two months from the date of issue of this
letter, for selection of the suitable officer. A set of three (03) proformas (Annexure-III, IV &
V) is to be included with each application. A check-list (copy placed at Annexure-III)
regarding the documents/copies enclosed may be sent with each application. The Bio-Data of
each of the officers may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-IV to be filled by
the concerned officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General. The
nomination of each of the officers may be forwarded along with an abstract of ACRs (if
applicable to the officer) of the last five years duly certified in the proforma placed at
Annexure-V, along with the ACR dossiers and vigilance clearance (if applicable to the officer).
Continued on Page 2

U%Q
.



.

4, It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the
requirements, as mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on
terms and conditions mentioned in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be
furnished to this Ministry along with the proformas (Annexure-I1II, IV & V) enclosed
with each application.

5 It is urged that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas may
strictly be adhered to. It is informed that the nominations only with complete proformas and
verified copies of ACR dossiers (if applicable) will be entertained by the Ministry. The matter
may kindly be treated as urgent.

6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours fa’irfhfully,

w/;{;l/
VY
(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India
Tel. No. 011-23766903
Copy to:

i Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC, New
Delhi-II may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2 All Dy. Chief Labour Commissioners (C) with the request to take up the matter with the
Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

\
( | ( '
Encl: Annexure-I, II, III, IV & V. - ) t
g 7 \/V\A/\)'Z’\\\.\ )

(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India



Anne xwre - T

Sec. 7) The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 19

(2) A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for a limited period.

5. Boards of Conciliation ~—(1) The appropriate Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Board of
Conciliation for promoling the settlement of an industrial dispute.

" (2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four oLher members, as
the appropriate Covernment thinks fit.

(3) The chairman shall be an' independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and any person appointed to represent a parly shall be appointed on the
recommendation of that party:

Provided that, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the appropriate Government shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent that parly. )

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding the
absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that if the appropriate Governmeiil notifies the Board that the_
services of the chairman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has
been appointed.

6. Courts of Inquiry.—(1) The appropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazelte constitute a Court of Inquiry for -
inquiring into any matter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute.

(2) A Court may consist of one mdependcnt person or of such number of
independent persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appoinled as the
chairman.

(3) A Court, having the prescribed quorum, may act no!wuh.standmg‘
the absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its
number:

Provided that, if the appropriate Government notifies the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be available, the Court shall not act until
a new chairman has been appointed.

!{7.-Labour Courts.<(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour.Courts for the adjudication;™
of-industrial“disputes- re!am1g*to~any‘matte:.,spec1ﬁed, in_the Second Schedule
and for-performing-such.ather. fmenons as may be assigned-to-them-under-this ¥
Aet—

(2)-A-Labour"Court-shall-consist of..nne RETson o ogy to be gppgi:x_tg_d_ by.the
appropriate -Government. A=eE

1. Subs, by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 (w.e.f. 10—3 -1957). Earlier section 7 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951).




%

A«/\u;cwrz

20 The Industrial Dispules Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

(3) A.pexson shall not be qualified for appointment as. the presiding officer -

of.a Labour Court, unless—=-=~""

e

[(a) _he is, or has been, a Judge of a High C;Juhrl; ors

(b) hehas, for a pexiod of not less.than three years. been a District Judge

in_Additional District Judge; pr’

s g L

tm

*((d)],_he has held any judicial office i India for ot less than seven yea
T or = 5o L s

! s,
L .ob-‘—&._\.—n-i‘:-;-_;__..".'

3[(e)] he has been the presiding officer of a Labour Court constituted »
“Tander any ‘Provincial “Act or State“Act for-not Jess‘than five years.]
4[(H he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.(Central) or
Joint Commissioner of the State Labour Department, having a
degree -in-law-and- at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department including three years of experience..as Coneiliation
Oitiear =T s AN 0y e et
Provided thal no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or
Joints Labour Commissioner-shall be*appointed-unless-he. resigrs/
from-the-service-of the Central- Government.or State Government, as
the case may. be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
“4(g) he is an officer of I_ndian.Lﬂl?eﬁigj‘é"iﬁ"Gtéde‘ 11T with three years’
-experience in the Al A A N e it
" STATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-
lettered as clause (d)], for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”,
[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 29-4-1964).] :

?oa..—ln section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), msf:rt the fql.lawi.ng‘ clauses,
name

“(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in lwo or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Cour
constituted under any law fYJr the time being in force; or :

(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university estaglished by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not' lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of any Industrail Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituted under any law for the time being in force for not less than five -

ears; or
(d3) Kc holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner of Labour under a State Government or a
p Union territory administration for not less than five years; or”.
[Vide Goa Act’5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).] © 1
Gu{'.a.ra_t.—m section 7, in sub-section (3),— - ! !
) in clause (b), after the words “Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or a
__ Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”; ' ) i\ A
(.gg in clause (d), for the words “seven years” substitute the words “five years”;
(iii) in clause (e}, for the words “five years” substitute the words “three years” and at
__ the end of the clause, insert the word “or”;
(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:— ) '
“(f) he hascpomctiaed as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
JHi urt or any Court subordinate thereto or in any Industrial Court or
!n_fuslrla] Tribunal or Labour Court epnstituted under any law for the time being
in force.” 7 “e

. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, scc. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).
Clause (c) omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
. Clauses (a) and (b) reletlered as clauses (d) and (e) respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f.
15-12-1964). A
4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

WP

Sec. 7) - The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.]
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),~
('3 for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namelg:— .
“(b) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District ]ug e or; and” ’ 3
(ii) after clause (c), insert the ollow'm%_ clause, namely:—
“(cc) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a Joint
Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana -Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]
Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— : 2 i .
y “(1A) In addition 1 the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall
' try offences punishable under this Act and the Acts specified in Part B of the
Second Scheclule.” - 2
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.e.f, 26-1-1982).]
In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted
above), has been omitted. . '
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellaneous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).] L
Maharashtra.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— { ! . i ’
4 “(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the
High Court, or any court subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal
or Labour Court, constitutéd under any law for the time being in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
- and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fiyg:ycars; ox”.
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2. .
After clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely:— o
“(d3) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than five

- years; or”.
[Vide Magarashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-5-1976).]
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namely:—
' ”(c% he is or has been a District Judge; or " i 8 -
(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate
Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Dispytes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two years.” .
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 2 {w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1966 (w.e,f. 1-11-1966).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
Uttar: Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following .sub-section,

¥ “(3A) In relation lo industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i) of
clause.(a) of section 2.or in section 4 of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shall have
effect'as if— - : . ‘ .
(a) after clause (c) the following new clauses (d) and (e) had been added:—
_*(d) is or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding two
ears;
(e) 1ys a person possessing more than two, ya\:arsf practical experience of
' adjudicating or settling industrial dispntes”; S
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)E' the words “or clause (d) or clause
(e)” had been added”. ' il el
[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f. 26-6-1951).]
Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior to the amendmenls madg by the
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f, 21-8-1984).
West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for'tlause (b) substitute the following
clause, namely:— . : b T i i
“(b) he’is, or has been, a District Judge or an' Additonal District Judge; or”, -
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-1-1989).] ‘ "




22 The Industiial Disputas Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

COMMENTS
Right of Labour Court i
The Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest of justice to seek
proper assistance 'and grant ‘leave’ to a party before it is represented b egal
practiioner; T.K. Varghese v. Nichimen Corporation, (2002) 1V LL] (Supp) Bom 018

'[7A=Tribunalsi—(1) The. approprl;ite Government may, by notification in”_.

the--Official *Gazette;* consti * one*"or " more=Industrial-.Tribunals -for - the
ad]udmatlon—of*mdustnal disp tca relating to any matter, whether specified in
the-Szcond-Schedule-or. the_ Thud. Schedule 2[and for | pexforming sus summa
“functions-as-may-be-assigned-to-them under” this Act].” e
(2)- A-Tribunal -shall-consist-of -cne- person-only—to b&appointed..by..the
apprepriate-Government.
(3) A person shall. not bg_qggh_f_gg fo appomr_ment as t_h_e p;es;dmg_nﬁmer
of .a Tribunal-unless—
(a).~he is;‘or-has been,a-Judge-of-a. High Court;-o oree
%(aa) .. hehas, for a period of not less than threg:years, b been a District Judge
or_an Additional- sttmct*]udge, [a)
s[(b)_he s Q:m&hﬂmg_ep_l._lty (;'luef Labuur Comunissioner (Central) _gr

degree m law and at Ieast seven years expene.nce in the labour

g:-}ﬁa.th:nenb mludmg~three"years-~ of'expencnce-“ as—~Conciliaton
cer:

Provxdt.d“that,no such Deggty ngf Loug Commissioner.or

Joint LabQuLConmussmnerqsha]l-be._appomLQd__uQ!ess he resigns

from the. sa:_y_l,ce of the Central Government! or State. ‘Government, -as-

the case may be, b “before : being appomted as the presiding officer; or]
"{c) he is"an officer of Indian, Legal Semce ine Grad&IH—wﬂh -th:ee years’

experience-in-the-grade.]
(4) The appropnate—Govenmxent may, if it so rhmks m appo L two persons. .
.as_assessors-to.advise-the. Tribunal in the pmceedmg before ,;L]_-

STATE AMENDMENTS '
Assam.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the following clause,

zu) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Add.monal District Judge or as both for
a total period of nat less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court:
Provided that the appointinent to a Tribunal of any persoh qualified under this
clause shall not be made without consultation with I.Ke Assam’ ngh Court; or”.
[Vile Assam Act B of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962).] i &

iy

Bnha.r—._ln se:t;m 7A, in sub-section (3), af!er clause (a) insert Il‘ur' ollowing clause,

namel %
{BI) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Add.monal sttru:t Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years: '
Provided that the appointment to a Tribunal of any person qualified under this
«clause shall be made in consultation with the High Court of the State in which the
Tribunal has or is intended 1o have, its usual’ place of mtu.ng; o
[Vide Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec. 2 (w.e.. 7-7-1959)] - :

" Ins. by’ Act 36 of 1956, su: 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

Ins. by Act 46 of 1982, sec, q(a) (w.e.f 21- 3-1984)\

Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964). '

The word *or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

. Ins, by Act 24 0f 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010): Easlier clause (b) was omilted by Act 46 of 1982,
see. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010),

O N

Sec. 7A] ) The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23

Goa.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitute the following clauses,
namely:—
“(b) he is, or has been, a District judge, or
(c) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
., or an Assistant Judge; or ;
(d) he isqualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
[Vide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).]
Gujarat.—In section 7A, in’ sub-section (3),—
(i) in clause (aa), after the words “an Add;lmnal District ]udbe insert the words “or
a Joint Judge or an Ass:stant Judge”;
(ii) inclause (b) {Ed. clause (b] has beeq om.xtted by Central Acl’46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)], insert the word “or” at the end
(iii) after clause (b), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(c) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force”. ) .
© [Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.] .
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after c]ause (c), insert, the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of Asszs;am
Comumissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years
[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 1-8-1981).] .
Ed. The above said amendments were made pno; to the amendments made by the Cenl:ral
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.c.f. 21-8-1984).
Haryana.—In section 74, in sub-section (3),—
" . (i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa} - he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional Dis;riét Judge; or"; and E
' (ii) after'clause (aa), insert the following clause, namclyw
“(aaa) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a
Joint Labour Cormumissioner for a period of not less than Iwo years; or”
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).)
Kerala.—In section 74, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), substitute the following clause,
namely:— r
“(a) he is, or lms been, a ]urj:cm! officer not beiuw the rank of a Ds:.lr:ct Iudge or is
qualified for appomtment as a Judge of a High Court; or”.
[Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-7-1961)]..
Madhya Pradesh.—In sectlon 74, for sub-sechon (3), substitute the following sut»secuon,
namely:—
“(3) A person shall not be quahfied for appomunent as the Presiding Ofﬁcer of a
Tribunal unless— :
(a) he is, or has been, a Judge of' a "High Court, or’
(b) he ig eligible for being appointed a Judge of a High Court; or
(c) ‘he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or
(d) he has worked as a me.'mber of Ilu:Board of Revenue for a penod nf not less
© “than three years; or
< {e)" he has worked as Cum.mmmner of Labour for a period of not leas than uuee
years; or




ﬂrmxex wy e "_.L

24 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. TA

(f) he has worked as a member of the Industrial Court constituled under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),
for a period of not less than five years.” : ’

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-1-1989).]

Maharashtra.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “Judge of a
High Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or a person qualified for appointment as a
Judge of a High Court”. i h X

[Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 4-1-1963).]

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (aa), for the words “an Additional District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an’ Assistant Judge or”.

After clause (b), [Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)], insert the following clause, namely:— ‘

“(c) he has for not less than five years been a presiding officer of a Labour Court,

constituted under any law for the time being in force.” °
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3]
Alfter clause (¢) insert the following clause, n_ameiy;—
“(d) he holds degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India

and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank’ than that of.

Assistant Cornimissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten
(o yearsflt , . v '
[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3.)
Mysore (Karnataka).—(1) In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the
following clause, namely:— i 8
“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge, or”.
[Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 31-1-1963).]
(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, aller the words “District Judge”
insert the words “for a peried of not less than three years.” -
[Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-12-1963) ]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f, 21-8-1984), ) i
Orissa—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:— . ! ‘ )
“(aa) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of not
less than seven years.” i
[Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960) ] -
West Bengal.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or an Additional District Judge”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-9-1958).]
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following clause, namely: —
“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4.)

COMMENTS
Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal

Section 7A empowers the appropriate Government to constitute one or more
Industrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any matter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matlers which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Sharina v, Rajasthan Patrikn Lid., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

Sec. 7C) . The Industrial. Disputes Act, 1947 25

X 7B, National Tribunals.—(1) The Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Industrial Tribunals for
the adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opinion of the Central
Government, involve questions of national importance or are of such a nature
that industrial establishments ‘situated in more than one State are likely to be
interested in, or affected by, such disputes. e '

" . (2) A National Tribunal shall consist of one person only to be appointed by
the Central Government. e _ B R

~ (3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the preéid_ihg officer
of a National Tribunal ?{unless he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court].
(4) The Central Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons as

assessors to advise the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

“[7C. Disqualifications for" the presiding officers of 'Labour Courts,
Tribunals and’ National Tribunals.—No person shall be appointed to, or
continue in, the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or
Nationa! Tribunal, if— Sl e j

(a) he is not an independent person; or
(b) he has attained the age of sixty-five years.]

STATE AMENDMENTS ,
Assam.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely—

“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before the completion of any
proceedings pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of
such Government public interést so requires, order his continuance in office for a

z period not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”
[Vide Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec, 3 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962) ] . o ‘
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7C, for clause (b), substitute the following
clause, namely:— ) 3 i b LT W
“(b) he has attained the age of sixty-seven years”. ’
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the-Central Act 31 of 1966.] * -
West Bengal.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—
“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before completion of any prpceedings
pending before himy, the State Government may, if in the opinion of such
Govermment public s'n_tereat 50 requires, order his continuance in office for a period
nat exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.” ‘
[Vide West Bengal Act 11 of 1959, sec. 3 (w.ef, 27-10-1959).)

2 ; ; © SECTION 7D
Gujarat.—Alter section 7C, inser! the following section, namely:—

“7D. Certain District Judges qualified for appointinents on Tribynal constituted
by State Government.—Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) of
seclion 7A,— ) . ' o

(1) The State Government may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
section for performing such other functions as may be assigned to it under this Act.
) .{2) Where the State Government constitutes a Tribunal under section 7A, the
Tribunal may consist of a person. who is, or has been, for a peripd of not less than

- L Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). ‘

' 2. 'Subs. by Act-46 of 1982, see. 5, for certain words (w.e.f 21-8-1984).




26 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Sec. 7C

5 years, a District Judge or an Additional or Joint District Judge and
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appointment as the
presiding officer of the Tribunal. :
(3) The appoimmém of a'ptrson qualified under clause (2) shall be made after
* consultation with the High Court.”

[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f, 9-8-1962).) .

I[8. Filling of vacancies.—lf, for any reason a vacancy (other than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal ‘or' National Tribunal or-in the office of the Chairman or any other
member of a Board or Court, then, in the case of a National Tribunal, the Central
Government and in any other case, the appropriate Government, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Act to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Courf, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is filled.] ) f il

2[9. Finality of orders constituting Boards, etc.—(1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appoinling any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or National Tribunal shall be called in
question in any manner; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court
shall be called in question in any manner on the ground merely of the exislence
of any vacancy in, or defect in the constitution of, such Board or Court.

(2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason only of the fact that such'settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in sub-section (6) of section 12 or sub-section 5)
of section 13, as the case may be. .. '~ - ' ? 3

~ (3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course of conciliation
proceeding before a Board is signed by the Chairman and all the other members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or
unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the Board
during any stage of the proceeding.] o ' ‘ ol !

3[CHAPTER lIA
. v NOTICE OF CHANGE e
- 9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes lo effect any change in

the conditions of service applicable to any workman in respect of any matter
spgciﬁ::d in the Fourth Schedule; shall effect such change,— Vi

(a) without giving to the workmen likely to be affected by such change
a nolice in the prescribed manner of the nature of the change
~proposed to be effected; or , ; :

(b) - within'twenty-one days of giving such notice: i yly
. Provided that no notice shall be required for effecting any such change—

1. Subs.by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section B was substituted
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951). - « 0 -t Sy

2. Subs. by'Ac: 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 9 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.l. 26-5-1951), ’

3. Chapter [IA (containing sections 9A and 9B) ms. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (\;v.e.f. 10-3-1957). E

)

§
i
¥
{
:
3
H

| e




AMnE.X wre

o=t o o UH0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

MR £ AST9A
Che Gazette of Iudia

EXTRAORDINARY
YT [I—avg 3 39-Tvs (i)
PART II—Section 3 Sub-section (i)
YRt | WehTTyre
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| 275] 7% faeelt, ggwfaar, 3We 30, 2015/99M@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

g A AT
FrfEeT
7% fawedt, 6 @l 2015

AL, 336(:r).—F= 1T qERIT, ArefE farg s, 1947 91 grr 38 9 gy-ar (‘1) £
@ () gIRT e AR F1 3 w7 gu At Faw e 8, saiq —

1. G| T < . —(1) =7 et 1 @it w7 99 =rares, denfis gfdssor 8w gt afgeor
(3, 9 ST orvg et F FAeeaa o o) gy, 201581

(2) 3 T § % GHAF & drdld F agd giv |
2. qfararg.—(1) 57 Rt & s o & aesd & saun aufda a 8—
() “afaffay & dhenfi= Fare afafaw, 1947 (1947 %7 14) afia 2

(@) “fareta aftsmrd & affay i a7, g 74 a1 g 79 F adfiw derfa g & =
¥ g aaftw afvla g 1 '

(2) I 9T i< wat ¥, Sfv 79 i § waws & qur gfvaited 9 § uig sl § afvariva 2
I% Al a4 § S I afaffay § wwa: I g |

3. FwE.—H e At fi feafy afiwrd F =0 § sfafraie 6§ zard, sl et
YTt i a9 1 gRt e Farfagw =i f gar § Ryl Tae ad &t g a6 % g gl |

1926 G1/2015 (1)

X




Aanexwre —IL

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

4. Fga.—(1) wdta aftmor F fowa affwrd 1 @ 80,000 = (Faq) sfarg £t Faa e & g
4 e sianta qarea =radtat § gom § wffgRe s o iR =it § gar § a5 o
dT g |

(2) W =T A1 snfE o F derdia aftwrd 1 Faw e e —

(i) Forar mmarsfier (afaf? w<) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 =.

(ii) Frar =mamefier (w72 4vft) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 =.

(iii) ForaT =araefter (arfasrer 3+) - 70,290-1540-76,450 =.

9l AT F Faw § wae Yo, Yo quqed a1 =g Garfgit F s o€ ¢, g #1188

yiq 9 & ferfm sifdwdt & =v § o3 s 6 Fghe 1 g 8, S =nfEs dar ar 9 geg 990
TG (Frald) AT TST TLHT F Y6 g & U2 § qarfgsr g < e Tom 6 Oft gro Bl s
¥ HIAR F WTH AT § A7 W F TET E AT WIH #74 & 90 gaare g AT g, ferd afimd ¥ o iy
e aaw & g aa % aera? f g 79 7 fR2ar s
5. HgiTs wAT—rgra sferor & ferfta dftwmrd dgard w39 & § yiw 87 S 359 JEed §
Hard Fargdie #T3FE | |

(2) = FarATe AT e At & fordia aftmtell £ 98 aaged qge 9w 9 #19

FFAIT B A F719 GLHIT & 995 'F AGFAT g GH9F-099 U Aqgia & o @1 & S

qAfAarsE 1 safar F S srefa susfeudt § wea Yov & 9 3¢ i o9 % oad F swaefiq

g |
6. FC wiiges war—(1) Tgig aftwor F forfia aftmft 1 9g 7 sfogs 9o 3 grm st 9=
AT F ~FTaTefien #1539 ¢ |

(2)%WWWW,%WW%WW@WW%

g & et £ gon g Faat % gdia RfREafaa g
7. TfEer Ramme—ad aftewo & ferdla aftmfat % o =y g e s 6 giEum
IAF dATA F T UT Iuersy YT ST StEl ey T ST y=eT § 987§, 98f 9% 9 dwalg 84T
(Frfrear afi=at) fam, 1944 8 2 gudfe gfawiv a9 & o gse g

(2) W =TT AT ARF st F fowia st ¥ fr, Rt afii 6T e

¥ wyg ‘& afgwigt & 797 @y Fawt F adi= ffRgtEe g
8. ga.—ug afdswr ¥ ferfm afdmfat & fu, gft & d4fda qmwe 3g =@t & farg
=TaEier FT 9T T BT |

(2) =9 =ETed 4 sirenfid afawor & ferda aftwmfa F o, gh & 969fta ame w5

TEHFIL F GHE F AtaEii £ @9 an) Rt ¥ aefm Bfafha &

9. whr R wat.—(1) Wi sfder F forfia afamfat F fog B aar gafse am-gho
a1 Fvieafa got Sa+ &1 g witers £ ax & g o w=n &1 gey fhar s

(2) =9 =Ty @i sEntiE it F fode afteiat F B =g a@) § 99 F
FHATRCT % ForT 7o epqaia wantal e syt 1 wely i St |




: Hhnexure —1

[ 9 -7 3(i)] Y 1 UST9F @ STEYR 3

10. graT Wt —fewiw aftfat €1 ga% WwiHaes & aug 9v ar @ o aud gaardl F Sqar aren
AT F FHRTT BT |
11. gt aran R —(1) adt siftsor F ferfia aftmfat F oo =g awww  sgaq 2o ¥ fag
97 AT T4 ST Few F ore g gvan R g |
(2) =% =TT S @i afgwor F forfm attwtaEt F P g amn Raag ferfa afdwfar
F¥ gt & enen o= R F avea g sl A gar ang St F a9 A gem
12. =g waT.—(1) e sfteer & Sewfa afmian F o wwiT g g avg aag e fafafsm
1 7% ad @0 & w9 F arga 997 &1 way G s |
(2) =9 =rare ar @it aftsn F el affwmiat §1 98 Feer @ &F a1 3 aed
ﬁﬁ?ﬁm%ﬁmmwrﬁmaﬁwwmwﬁmmﬁﬂwmﬁa%ﬁ
BT &Y |
13. TG AT AaT—(1) I=9aq i F qeardl G951 F O aeg sa=iaor 991 agE d=iE
ATAFCT AT A AT FT FEUGT FA F [0 AT § GeATHT qF AT GHIAT F GHTA gl 9T
EATE & [ AL qF T SATT @00 ATAT AT 1T |
(2) =® =g 4 @enfE aftwor % fere it F fo sEieer aEr g9
qefeaTe & e a A fRe & araa g s F g Sl geae & a7 an Raat F
AHTL ET |
14. sferl whRw-f_RfE Sfw—ferfa aftwmiEl @ abeel sEe-ER ofm 8 R F agan
AT F1 safer F o A 1 EF gn |
15. F=F VAT AF.—37 TTHA T araq s ar § Fr¢ AfSeqw U6 qgi a1 0 ¢ ALqe T a9
wewt F1 9T F Fagat 07 ot & gt st @ FE goee ¥ At F fro aw aare, st
sf¥aor a7 gt sfior gy AR g smad, s Seive e 1 9w ax At avesrd g o

16. Fife st Y aRr—F=07 avaR #7 57 Fant & Bt sudy =1 fFET v aryadt F afwat £ arEd
farfarer s i afze 2rfT o '
[€. §=-25025/05/2013-HT0eqH-2]

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(1) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(a) “‘Act” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);



Avnexure - |

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(b) “Presiding Officer” means a persen appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4. Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/- (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2) The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) - Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(ii) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
(iii) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450
per month inclusive of gross pension, pension equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer, who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed. ‘

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A™ Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals, the city compensatory
- allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courts.

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —“A” Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
vperation, they shall be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944,

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilities shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-* A" Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.—(l) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissible 1o the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government.

9.  House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“A" Officers of the Central Government.

10. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.



AVW\Q—‘K Wre —1_

(9T 11-@vE 3(i)] YA 61 TSIYA ¢ STEHR 5

11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time o time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a
staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13, Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance
shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14. Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

15. Other Conditions of Service.—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the
Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the
Central Government thereon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-11]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-| 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.




Annexure-III

Check-list for each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, New Delhi-II

Name of the Officer:

SI. | Document Status of enclosure
No. of document

Y -Yes

N —=No

NA — Not Applicable

1 Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer
during the last five years

2 Vigilance clearance of the officer

3 Integrity certificate of the officer

4 Annexure-1V
(Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)

5 "Annexure-V
(Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer)

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General
of the concerned High Court)



Annexure-IV

Proforma for Bio-data
(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Name (in full)

Date of Birth

Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
Additional District Judge or equivalent post

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details Name of the last/current post

in Date of appointment to
respect | jast/current post

of last/ Date of retirement
current :
post Scale of pay

held Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no. (Office)
(Residential)
(Mobile)
E-mail address
Date: Signature:

Place: Name:




‘ | Annexure-V

Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years of each
judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
Central Government Industrial Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, New Delhi-I|

Name of the Officer:

SI. | Year/Period |Details of | Details of | Details of

No. Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
Authority & | Authority & | Authority &
Grading ‘Grading Grading

1

2

= .

4

5

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)



