No. A-11016/6/2016-CLS-II
Government of India

Ministry of Labour & Employment
sk sk ok ok ok

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.

Dated the 21* November, 2016
To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Chennai.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC) at Chennai is to be filled up shortly in accordance
with the provisions contained in sections 7 & 7A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (extract of
the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to these provisions, the post can be held by judicial
officer who is, or has been, a Judge of High Court or who has rendered not less than three
years’ service as an Additional District Judge or a District Judge. A Serving Judge can be
appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term. A Retired Judge can be appointed
on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of appointment of Judges to the post of
Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The Presiding Officers of the Labour Court,
Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions
of Service) Rules, 2015].

2. The scales of pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC are as
follows: '

(i) Distt. Judge (Entry Level) - Rs.51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070/-
(i) Distt. Judge (Selection Grade) - Rs.57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210-1540-70,290/-
(iii) Distt. Judge (Super time Scale) - Rs.70,290-1540-76,450/-
3 It is requested that a panel of names of Judicial Officers who are willing to be appointed

as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC at Chennai and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may
please be furnished to this Ministry within a period of two months from the date of issue of this
letter for selection of the suitable officer. A set of three (03) proformas (Annexure-IIIL, IV &
V) is to be included with each application. A check-list (copy placed at Annexure-III)
regarding the documents/copies enclosed may be sent with each application. The Bio-Data of
each of the officers may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-IV to be filled by
the concerned officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General. The
nomination of each of the officers may be forwarded along with an abstract of ACRs (if
applicable to the officer) of the last five years duly certified in the proforma placed at
Annexure-V, along with the ACR dossiers and vigilance clearance (if applicable to the officer).
Continued on Page 2

\ﬁ(}/



P

4. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the
requirements, as mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on
terms and conditions mentioned in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be
furnished to this Ministry along with the proformas (Annexure-III, IV & V) enclosed
with each application.

5. It is urged that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas may
strictly be adhered to. It is informed that the nominations only with complete proformas and
verified copies of ACR dossiers (if applicable) will be entertained by the Ministry. The matter
may kindly be treated as urgent.

6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours f(ziFhquy,

\ ‘\
A

W
(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India
Tel. No. 011-23766903
Copy to: :

1. Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC, Chennai
may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2. All Dy. Chief Labour Commissioners (C) with the request to take up the matter with the
Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

\
\

|
Endl:  Annexure-l, IL, I, IV & V. | UM%\\.\L

(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India



Sec. 7] The Industrial Disputes Acl, 1947

(2) A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and

either permanently or for a limited period.

5. Boards of Conciliation.—(1) The appropriate Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Board of

Conciliation for promoling the settlement of an industrial dispute.

"(2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four other members, as

the appropriate Government thinks fit.

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and any person appointed to represent a party shall be appoinled on the

recommendalion of that party:

Provided that, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the appropriate Government shall appoint such

persons as it thinks fil to represent that parly.

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding the
absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that if the appropriate Government notifies the Board that the
services of the chairman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has

been appointed.

6. Courts of Inqmry .—(1) The appropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Court of Inquiry for -
inquiring into any matter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an

industrial dispute.

(2) A Court may consist of one independent person or of such number of
independent persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the

chairman.

(3) A Court, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwuhstandmg
the absence of the c!m:rma.n or any of its members or any vacancy in its

number:

Provided that, if the appropriate Government notifies the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be available, the Court shall not act until

a new chairman has been appointed.

Y[7:-Labour Courts.=+(1) The appropriate Government may, by nolification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour.Courts for the.adjudications~
of-industrial“disputes’ relating“to~ anyAmatteLspeciﬁgd in the.Second Schedule. o
and for-performing:- sunh.othgg ﬁmctlons as may be. a&‘ilgned -to-them-under- this ¥

Aet—

(2)-A-Labour Court‘shall consist of.one_person only Lo be appointed by. the ~

appropriate- Goven'unent

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 (w.e.f. 10—3-1957) Earlier section 7 was amended

by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951).

19




A,N,L KWL —*_I

20 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

(3) A person shall not be quaﬁfigainggi_qhn_ggm_mg_p_;gs_@‘i_ng officer »
of.a Labour Court, unless=5-——""" ; TR

e ie

[(a) _he is, or has been, a Judge of a High ,C‘c:lg;rt; oLy

- (b} hehas, for.a period of not less than three years, been a District Judge ..

oran, Additional District Judge; or,
J

2‘[-1)]

3((d)], .he has held any judicial office in India for not less than seven years;
Lhe 5000 lega

*[()] _he has been the presiding officer of a Labour Court cqnst_ituteﬂ/
© T inder any Provincial ‘Act or State*Act for'not less'than“five ‘years.]
“[() he.is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.(Central) or
Joint Commissioner of the State Labour Department, having a
degree -in-law-and- at least seven years’:experience in the labour
department including three years of experience..as:Concilidtion
Offieery =, Th ey w0 e S e .
Provided that no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or
Joint- Labour Commissioner.shall be" appointed-unless-he resigrs/
from-the'service-of the Central Government.or State Government, as
the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
“[(g) he is.an officer of Indian I:.eﬁal Service in Grade IIT with three years’
experience in (he grade,J™ ==t
7 7USTATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-
lettered as clause (d)), for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”.
[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 20-4-1064).] ;
e(.!;oa.ﬁln section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:—

“(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under an{ law for the time being in force; or ) 1

(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of any Industrail Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituted under any law for the time being in force for not less than five -

ears; or
(d3) Ke holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner of Labour under a State Government or a
Union territory administration for not less than five years; or”.
[Vide Goa Act'5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.ef. 21-10-1987).] :
Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),— ;
ei) in clause (b), after the words “Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or a
... Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”; ) s
(ng in clause Ed), for the words “seven years” subslitule the words “five years”;
(iii) in clause (e), for the words “five years” substitute the words “three years” and at
. the end of the clause, insert the word “or”;
(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:— 2 ’
“(f) he hascgrac-tised as an advocale or attorney for not less than seven years in a
H.lgh urt or any Court subordinate thereto or in any Industrial Court or
In {ustria! Tribunal or Labour Court constituted under any law for the time being
in force.” - .

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964). ‘
2. Clause (c) omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
" 3. Clauses (a) and (b) reletlered as clauses (d) and (e) respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f.
15-12-1964). 3 .
4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, scc. 4 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

Sec. 7] n The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.]
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—
('3 for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(b) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge or; and” - ;
(ii) after clause (c), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(cc) he has been a Commissioner c§ a division or an Administrative Secretary to
. Gevernment or an officer of the Labour Department not below Lhe rank of a Joint
Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana -Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]
n‘m]';hdhyl radesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
naj — : .
z “(1A) In addition to the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall
‘ try offences punishable under this Act and the Acts specified in Part B of the
Second Schedule.”
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-1-1982).]
In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted

. above), has been omitted.

. [Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellaneous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).] )
; ]\iaaharashtm.---ln section 7, iny sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— . 2 L ' ' ’
-y “(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the
High Court, or any court subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal
or Labour Court, constituted under any law for the ime being in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
- and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fiyg.years; or".
{Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2.)
After clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely:— : i A
“{d3) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
.and is holding or has held an. office not lower than that of Assistant
Comumissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than five
years; or”. A g g )
- [Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-5-1976).] .
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namely:—
: “(¢) he is'or has been a District Judge; or : 3
(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate
Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Dispytes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two years.”
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1966 (w.e,f. 1-11-1966).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-B-1984).
lilttar- Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— 4 :
“(3A) In relation to industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i) of
clause.(a) of section 2.or in secton 4 of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shall have
effect as if— 2 d
(a) afler clause (c) the following new clauses (d) and (e) had been added:—
“(d) is or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding two
ears; .
(e) r.ya a person possessing more than two years’ praclical experience of
) adjudicating or settling industrial disputes™; * ~ .
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (bf"' the words “or clauge (d) or clause
(e)” had been added". : s i Y
[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f. 26-6-1951).]
Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior lo the amendments made by the
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for‘‘clause (b) substifute the following
clause, namely:— : e WEE Al
“(b) he’is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”. -
- [Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 3 (w.c.f. 22-1-1989).] :




AN XAV — _L—

¥

22 The Industiial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

COMMENTS
Right of Labour Court
The Labour Court/Tribunal hag an mherent right in the interest of justice to seek
rope assistance and grant ‘leave’ to a parly before it is represented by a legal
practitioner; T.K. Varghese v. Nichimen Corporation, (2002) IV LL]) (gupp) Bom 1018.

[7A #Tribunals.~(1) The. appropriate Goyernment may, by notification in*.

the--Official~Gazette;~constityte * one*"or * more-*Industrial--Tribunals - for-the:

adj udeabon—okmdusdemp‘-szarﬁlgnng tg any matter, whether specxf_agd.m

Lhe Second-Schedule-or the Third Schedule *[and for per[orm&ﬂcb‘gmer
-functions-as-may be-assigned-to them under this Act]. ™~

(2)- A-Tribunai-shall-consist-of-one* person-only-to- be__appmn.ted-..by.ihe--

apprepriate-Government.
(3 A.person shall.not he guah,__g.:@_»or _appointment as | r.he pr,A;bng_fomer
of a-Tribunal-unless—
(a).~he-is;or-has been,-a-Judge-of-a-High Court; or=~ 3
%(aa) .- he-has, for a period of not less than three:years, been a Dist Dlstnet_mdge
or.an. Additional District. ]udge, A[aea])o
’[(bL_ e, is or.has been.a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Centr__) .or
- Joint Commwlonezmgi..nthe_state..ha_bgm Department..lmaymg A
degree in law_and at least seven years’ experience in the labour
dc:_cgatu:nenbwmdudmg athree’years--of'expenenc? as-Conciliation
Officer:
Provided .that.no. such Depl,_ll’y Ch.:ef Labour, Commissioner.or
Joint LabcmL.Comm;ssxoner*shall-be .apppmtgd_g_xﬁesa he resigns
from_the service of the Central Governnient or State Government;-as-
the case may be, b before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
I(c) heis an c.\fhcernflndlan Legal Semce ﬂerde III*wath-th:ee years’
experience-in-the-grade.] o

(4) The appropriate-Government may, if it s0 Lhmka fit appomt two persons:.,

as assessors-to-advise-the Tribunal in the proceeding before.it. l=

STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam,—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the folluwm;J clause,

namel
Ku] he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District ]udge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court:
Provided. that the appointment to a Tribunal of any persoi qualified u.nder Llus
clause shall not be made without consultation with Lﬁe Assam H:gh Court; or”
[Vile Assam Act 8 of 1962, sec. 2 (w. e.f. 30-4-1962).] i i
?ﬂm‘ —In sech.on ?A. in sub-gection (3), nfl.er clause (a} lnsert" Lhe following clause,
name! ;

%:u) he’ has worked asa Dmtnct Judge or as an Add.monal sttrlct Iudge or as both for
a total period of not less than LEICE years:
Provided that the appointment to a Trihunal of any person q'uahﬁed under this
«clause shall be made in consultation with the High Court of the Szate in which the
Tribunal has or is intended to have, its usual p!am qf sattmg, or”.
[Vide Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 7-7-1959).] - :

Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

Irs, by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4(a) (w.e.f. 21:8:1984),

Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964). )

The word “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

Ins, by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010). Earlier clause (b) was omitted by Act 46 of 1982,
sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

N

o

Sec, 7A] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23
Goa.—In séction 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitute the following clauses,
namely;— .
“(b) he is, or has been, a lell'lct ]udge, or
(c) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
. oran Assistant Judge; or L5
(d) he is.qualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
[Vide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21- 10-1967).]
Gujarat.—In section 7A, in "sub-section (3)—
(i) in clause (aa), after the words “an Addmonal District Judge”, insert the wnrds “or
a _!nml: Judge or an Assistant Judge”;
(ii) in clause (b) ! {Ed. clayse (b) has bee;\ omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)], insert the word “or” at the ‘end;
(iii) after clause (b), insert the fnlluw:ng clause, namely:—
“(c) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force”.
* [Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.]
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (c), mserl. the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law of a Universily established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of Aasmant
Conunissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years
|Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w. e.f. 1-8-1981).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.[. 21-8-1954).
Haryana.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3),—
. (i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is qualified for appomtmen! as, is or has been, a District ]udbe or an
Additional District Judge; or”; and
(i) after clause (aa), insert the followmg clause, namely:—
“(aaa) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a
Joint Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than wo years; oc”
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976 sec. 3 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]
Kerala.—In section 74, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), substitute the following c!ause,
namely:— e
“(a) he is, or has.been, a ;uclmal officer not below the rank of a Dl:,lnct Judge, or is
qualified for appointment as a Judge of a High Court; or”
[Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 (wie.f. 27-7-1961)].. :
Madhya l'radesh —In sec:mn 74, for sub -5eC lmn (3), substitute the fol.luwmg aub-sectxon
namelyi—
“(3) A person shall not be qua.hf‘ ed for appomtment as the Presiding thcer of a
Tribuna! unless—
(a) he is, or has been, a ]ur:lge of a High Court; or i
“(b) he is eligible for being appointed a Judge of a High Court; or
“ (c) 'he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or
(d) he has-worked as a member of the Board of Revenue for a penod of not less
“* " than-three years; or i
- (e) he has worked as Comrm.samner of Labour for a period of not leas than three
years; or




24 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7A

(f) he has worked as a member of the Industrial Court constituled under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),
for a period of not less than five years.”

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec, 3 (w.e.f. 15-1-1989).]

Maharashtra.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “Judge of a
High Court”, insert the words "or a District Judge or a person qualified for appointment as a
Judge of a High Court”. : .

[Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 4-1-1963).]

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (aa), for the words “an Additional District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an Assistant Judge or". -

After clause (b), [Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)), insert the following clause, namely:— . ' :

“(c) he has for not less than five years been a presiding officer of 'a Labour Court,

constituted under any law for the time being in force.”
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3.]
After clause (¢) insert the following clause, namely:—

“(d) he holds degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India
and -is holding or has held an office not lower in rank’ than that of
Assistant Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not ‘!z_:lss than ten

. years[” . : ik

[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3.)

Mysore (Karnataka).—{1) In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the _

fullowing clause, namely:— !
“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge, or”.
[Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f, 31-1-1963).]
(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, after the words “District Judge®,
insert the words “for a period of not less than three years.”
[Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-12-1963).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
Orissa—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:— g
“(aa) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of not
less than seven years.” )
[Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960).] :
West Bengal.—In scction 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a Distict Judge or an Addilional District Judge”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-9-1958).] 5
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he 35, or has been, a District Judge or an Additiona! District Judge; or”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4.]

COMMENTS
Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal

Section 7A empowers the appropriate Government to constitute one or more
Industrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any matter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schecule enumerates the matiers which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Sharma v, Rajasthan Patrika Lid., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

Sec. 7C) . The Industrial. Disputes Act, 1947 25

'[7B. National Tribunals.—(1) The Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Industrial Tribunals for
the adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opinion of the Central
Government, involve questions of national importance or are of such a nature
that industrial establishments situated in more than one State are likely to be
interested in, or affected by, such disputes. i

{2) A National Tribunal shall consist of one person only to be appointed by
the Central Government. ) -

(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the presiding officer
of a National Tribunal ?[unless he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court).

(4) The Central Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons as
assessors to advise the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

7C. Disqualifications for the presiding officers of Labour Courts,
Tribunals and National Tribunals.—No person shall be appointed to, or
continue in, the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or
National Tribunal, if— 57 A .
(a) he is not an independent person; or
(b) he has attained the age of sixty-fiye years.]

STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—
“Pravided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal a ppointed by the State
- Government attains the age of sixty-five years before the completion of any
proceedings pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of
such Government public interést so requires, order his continuance in office for a
period not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”
[Vide Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec, 3 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962)] '
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh—In section 7C, for clause (b), substitute the following
clause, namely:— sakd 5 { . .
“(b) he has attained the age of sixty-seven years”, '
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the Central Act 31 of 1966.]
West Bengal.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—
“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before completion of any proceedings
pending before him, the Stale Government may, if in the opinion of such
Govenument public interest so requires, order his continuance in office for a period
not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”
[Vide West Bengal Act 11 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.ef. 27-10-1959).)

4 i SECTION 7D
Gujarat.—Alfter section 7C, inseri the following section, namely:—

“7D. Ceriain District Judges qualified for appointments on Tribunal constituled
by State Gavermm'nt.--Npmithslanding anything contained in sub-section (1) of
seclion 7A,— ) ke " ) '

(_1) The State Government may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
section for performing such other functions as may be assigned to it under this Act.

) .(2) Where the State Government constitutes a Tribunal under section 7A, the
Tribunal may consist of a person who is, or has been, for a period of not less than

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

" 2. *Subs. by Act.46 of 1982, sec. 5, for certain words (w.e.f. 21-8-1984),




26 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7C

5 years, a District Judge or an Additional or Joint District Judge and
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appointment as the
presiding officer of the Tribunal. ) o
(3) The appointment of a person qualified under clause (2) shall be ‘made after
" consultation with the High Court.” '

[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, scc. 2 (w.e.f. 9-8-1962).)

1[8. Filling of vacancies.—If, for any reason a vacancy (other -than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal ‘or’ National Tribunal or in the office of the Chairman or any other
member of a Board or Court, then, in the case of a National Tribunal, the Central
Government and in any other case, the appropriate Governument, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Act to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is filled.] ‘ il

2[9, Finality of orders constituting Boards, etc—(1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appointing any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or National Tribunal shall be called in
question in any manner; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court
shal] be called in question in any manner on the ground merely of the existence
of any vacancy in, or defect in the conslitution of, such Board or Court.

(2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason only of the fact that such settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in sub-section (6) of section 12 or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be.’ . : ;

~ (3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course of conciliation
proceeding before a Board is signed by the Chairman and all the other members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or
unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the Board
during any stage of the proceeding.] '

S[CHAPTER lIA
PN . NOTICE OF CHANGE )
- 9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes to effect any change in

the conditions of service applicable to any workman in respect of any matter
specified in the Fourth Schedule, shall effect such change,—

(a) without giving lo the workmen likely to be affected by such change
a notice in the prescribed manner of the nature of the change
-proposed to be effected; or lao T
(b) within twenty-one days of giving such notice:"
_ Provided that no notice shall be required for effecting any such change—
1, Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.£. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 8 was substituted
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.c.f. 26-6-1951).  « Lh 4 581" .

2. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 9 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951). ’

3. Chapter IIA (containing sections 9A and 9B) ins, by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

e s

{;

e

g i, ey g A




e —

}Q‘lﬂ\-u nwre ——“’

o=t Ho Eto UHe-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
"I 1I—@vg 3 39-JUs (i)
PART 11—Section 3 Sub-section (i)
i § wemierd
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 275) =% feoelt, Seelfaam, 3w 30, 2015/49m@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

HH AT AN A0
FfRgeAT
7% fawdt, 6 @iier, 2015

ALHLR. 336(a).—FHT TR, defiE R aftfiaE, 1947 # g 38 € Irawr (1) F
e (1) 1T wad aftrat # g #3d gu Rt fag aard g, safq e —

1. fem 7 ) arew.—(1) = [Fawt & |t qm g9 s, denfie aftmor S aga afgsor
(39, 99 i< 97 a7 & Fava @i od) Fag, 201581

(2) T TSI9 § I THIA & AT F 9gd gid |
2. qfwmarg—(1) 37 A=t & st @ & gasf & seaar sfea 78—
() “afaffag” & denfas fAear afafgm, 1947 (1947 @7 14) afdva €

(H)‘“ﬂ?ﬁﬁ?ar@m‘&"ﬁaféﬁwraﬁamlum?aﬁaTWYE%aeﬁ?ﬁaﬁﬁ?{a%ﬁ%w
% ¥ fAg =fr afwa g |

(2) 37 wr=at #fe waEl ¥, off o= Pgdt & wywh § qur wfvanfig 9f § wiq wfafas § gfvarfua 2
IF Fal o9F g ol I Afafaad § #HT: ITF € |

! 3.  wrEE. T dara i B Serdia aftwd ¥ s § gfFaRe 7 o d, sfafRgie i aafa
ATTOEET i A T gt ol FanfRee mraefter i zon # fgfe $ae ad 6 srg a9 % o g )

1926 G1/2015 (n



I Lleiilie Lbte) K 14 LBk Lkl bkl kishle Lubk D % Lhaflb b
A, 2Bb k 2k2h plgek D) % kgl BRIl % lkhlle SRl e bbbl b (2)
| Lriilie Lite] BEK 1 Lk Iklade] blbh 1 25 |4 BIsBIK BIP 1k bbe bR Blkallkk Lk
IRg|h-ple Pisibb 1o lblee] D) Ibpllehlle BlIHeLL & kRl RIER (100 IbG] blek 6
| 12 Dlajbile) kigle e ikl Tl Lok Lk Lby)leBle &, 2B & 2lk2h
blfat bilk DRl & 138 D b lyleale kol f kgl il Lk kblkibs b (2)
| 112 216 1kk 1% 5l Rk1Es
il B lebleike Ee phie gk b G2 D & bylenie blpiel & eyl bE—G8 g

| Ue12 Blelbislll Blfle & Lkl Bl Lk 1 \p3sRlle &, 2hb &

k2 kit DI 1Bl DB % IbyleRle kipIelh & kGl Sl Lk kBlelbs bt ()
| )2 20263 Dia) e bl DIBEIR BRIERS Lkk &t PYEL ttkk) ((kk2lh 1Bielk)
1k Plgek b 2h 12k 2 Qb b bilkK lbiolb bailbs kg 1200 2l (22 Bobh® 2h bl & IPIBD Gbe
DURELE L Lbinlk fedles 21b2b kgl D) % 1R21eRYE BIRICL % IndbElle RIRR— BRIk} IDGlR] )

| 112 Blajbilll bRl d Lk T Lkk 1k b2kl & 2hb

N f 21k bl R $0RRIK 2ok e LRIkl BIRIRLL & ‘bRl LRl 1k kbbb bt (2)

| | 2 k2 Lk I5(Rlk1bs & [hblklks
kot o L2 b2 1t ©2RBIK 2k 2k Lk 2kl BRI & bl RIR (L)—10k $2hRlK 2k g
| 12
ElRbale % Pls % bl DY) 2 bk 4 blth B30 IkRslbhe B2l bIb % Blbke b kislkpish
Lo 2 12> lis lkdp) D221k 2h khb-khb I8 |3 1ERle b, 205 % kb kg Lo 112 21bk2
% bk BIK Ik 3103k kabih 2b Ik 3|1l bipIolh % lodglle kiRl Lk kilblks b (2)
. | 2 k2 Lk ls1RklE: D2 1R
% bblklks baf s L3t BIK 1 22 Be 1Rk 3103k QlbGlle blRICh 1k lnxbglle RIZ0—10k 3Bl G
I el L] 2t hte btk (4 2elel b blsh bbb bbbk Phb|
B0 hij % Bleglle BlRIelh 2 Lkl 12 252 D) % kb RIK 1k 2 122 24 BIK 1k 2 1kt BIK I 2klh &
RiBpilel (k) 1215 PR 1 kish bhis) 2lie 2 BBR|Ibk B Dt Dkl DR % 21620 ko> 1k (bif) LRl
bt kol he Ik 1bk bhlks s 'k L2 13 9Bk 14 Rike B0 1 he & pleglle BRI %) 2k Db
P12 3Lk 2k 2 Ut 2Rl & RIBLIIER hele L koBhh kish ‘kish bbb i kb b 21k BIK
"2 0G¥'92-0VG1-062 0L - (bR blkp|le) lsliklks Lo (1)
'2012'29-08€1-0£6'85-0£21-00£°LS — (Unks kkE) 15|RlR1E- Liais] (1)
"2 0£0'€9-08€1-0€6'85-0€Z1-0GG'LS - (212 Blblk) WIRElks Lksls) (1)
L2 btk DR Lt [Pkl bipIolh t Ikl il Lk Rilbiks bl (2)

| 2L
bloh bbb b Lse 1 UsiRblbs BELUEE 2 1ok RBLIBIK b La> I UblRklR: Balbl Blble ki) 2
112 1 22 Drk) 1 2lblk (kb)) 2 00008 bk Lk [plbklle blpIolh & Ikl RIFD (L)—kbe b

[ "oa8—I1 L¥vd] AVNIQIOVILXH : VIANI 40 HLLAZYD HHL G

\HH.I Q.&.Suﬁdi(\d\




Fnnexure —l-

[4rT 1I-EvE 3(i)] HRd &1 UF9H : AFHR] 3

10. FraT war.—dizrdta afdanfat 1 sa% Wiy & a9g 92 9 @3 T 90T gFAr F S
AT % gHITC 21 |
1. g ara Ramaa.—(1) T srfdreror ¥ e aftmifat ¥ R Sedta avar ¥ sgaw aoft ¥ fg
AT AT T 7 FgE F forg gt arn R 26 |
(2) =9 =rrarey & sEnfis afwor F forfiv aftwia F fo gd amr ey forfa aftmiar
T qAfS & s ax g F araa g e sl o aur ang Rt F gt BRafha ga
12, TTIE-THHT.—(U@WW%WW%WWHWMWHM a7 uT fafafam
&1 15 Faa @ F w9 F a1 a7 gy Bt s |
(2) = =rarEa 41 s afgsor  ferfia sttt 91 ag Beeg @ & ar 3 aeade
FTAT F TAIST ¥ (0 T2 F1 & 47 J94 9184 F1 5407 gfaurg ye+ &y a0 v=gat e i
BRI FX
13. ST AT WAT.—(1) Svwaq Aoff F Gt Gaai & o aq@g e\ sur g dentiE
T AT AR ATATAT HT FTRIGY FA F (A0 J@aE & gearad ad A€ quqa F g9 g e
HEATAY F [ AV qF HT TTA LT JTAT T 0T |
(2) =9 =g Tr st afdwr F ferde st § oo wmiEor g@=r g9
qAfAarS % s 97 AgfRE & arad @iHae v % o ey awaw F 29 ang Rt F
AT ET |
14. sfverdt whs-RfEy efm—derdn aftmiat @ afeed afeeffe & & Pl § aaar
qAfRaTSA it wafe ¥ S e 1 gw g |
15. &7 qaT 4. —=7 AHer 7 g GaE aw F 71 dfSeaw Iudy 9E0 a9 T E qeas 91 a7
weedt 1 a1 F Fayat @ a9t & d4fia qmat 31 7897 @ F Ffeg F P gy smaey, defs
ST a1 g st g FEfe fg s, i i g 1 9q 9w e avesrd g

16. ffRe s s —F=ira g &1 o7 Foawt & fdt awde a1 Bl & ar vant F srfwat 1 area
farferer e i arfer @ity |

[¥. $12-265025/05/2013-H1UeTH-2)

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(1) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context vtherwise requires,-

(a) ‘*‘Act” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);



Annexure =T

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(b) *Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4. Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/~ (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2) The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) - Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(ii) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
(iii) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450
per month inclusive of gross pension, pension equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer, who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A™ Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals, the city compensatory
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courts.

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —*A” Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operation, they sha_l] be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944.

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilities shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-"* A" Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.—(l) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A" Officers of the Central Government.

9. House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“A” Officers of the Central Government.

10. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.



[T 11-@vE 3(i)] I K1 TS : STHER 5

11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or.Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a
staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance
shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14.  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

15. Other Conditions of Service.—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the
Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the
Central Government thereon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-11]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.

Annexunre — L




Annexure-III

Check-list for each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, Chennai

Name of the Officer:
Sl. | Document Status of enclosure
No. of document
Y —Yes
N —No
NA — Not Applicable |
1 Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer

during the last five years

2 Vigilance clearance of the officer

3 Integrity certificate of the officer

4 Annexure-IV
(Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)

5 Annexure-V
(Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer)

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General
of the concerned High Court)



Annexure-IV

Proforma for Bio-data
(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Name (in full)

Date of Birth

Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
Additional District Judge or equivalent post

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details Name of the last/current post
in Date of appointment to
respect | |ast/current post

of 1ast/  ["pate of retirement

current

post Scale of pay

held Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no. (Office)

(Residential)

(Mobile)

E-mail address

Date: Signature:

Place: Name:




Annexure-V

Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years of each
judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
Central Government Industrial Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Chennai

Name of the Officer:

SI. | Year/Period |Details of | Details of | Details of
No. Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
Authority & | Authority & | Authority &
Grading Grading Grading

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)



