No. A-11016/1/2017-CLS-II
Government of India
Ministry of Labour & Employment

Kk ok ok ok ok

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.

Dated 08.03.2017
To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Dhanbad-1.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC) at Dhanbad-I is to be filled up shortly in accordance
with the provisions contained in Sections 7 & 7A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (relevant
extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to these provisions, the post can be held
by a judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court or who has rendered not less
than three years’ service as an Additional District Judge or a District Judge. A serving Judge can
be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term. A retired Judge can be appointed
on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of appointment of a Judge to the post of
Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The Presiding Officers of the Labour Court,
Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions
of Service) Rules, 2015].

2. The scales of pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC are as
follows:

(i) Distt. Judge (Entry Level) - Rs.51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070/-
(ii) Distt. Judge (Selection Grade) - Rs.57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210-1540-70,290/-
(iii) Distt. Judge (Super time Scale) - Rs.70,290-1540-76,450/-
3. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who are willing to be appointed

as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC, Dhanbad-I and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may
please be furnished so as to reach this Ministry within a period of two months from the date of
issue of this letter for selection of a suitable officer. A set of three (03) proformas (Annexure-
III, IV & V) is to be included with each application. A check-list (copy placed at Annexure-
III) regarding the documents/copies enclosed may be sent with each application. The Bio-
Data of each of the officers may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-IV to be
filled by the concerned officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General. The
nomination of each of the officers may be forwarded along with an abstract of ACRs (if
applicable to the officer) of the last five years, duly certified in the proforma placed at
Annexure-V, along with verified copies of ACR dossiers and vigilance clearance (if applicable).

j Continued on Page 2




-2-

4, It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the requirements, as
mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on terms and conditions mentioned
in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be furnished to this Ministry along with the
proformas (Annexure-III, IV & V) enclosed with each application.

2 It is requested that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas and
the last date of sending of applications may strictly be adhered to. It is informed that only the
nominations with complete proformas (Annexure-III, IV and V) and verified copies

f ACR iers (if licable) receiv n/before 07.05.2017 will be considered b
the Ministry. The matter may kindly be treated as urgent.

6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours fafthfully,

(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India
Tel. No. 011-23766903
Copy to:

W Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC,
Dhanbad-I may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2. All Deputy Chief Labour Commissioners (Central) with the request to take up the matter
with the Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

3. The Director, NIC, Ministry of Labour & Employment, New Delhi with the request to
upload the circular on the website of the Ministry.
Encl: Annexure-I, II, III, IV & V.

(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India



a
5

Sec. 7] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 19

(2) A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for a limited period

5. Boards of Conciliation.—(1) The appropriate Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Board of
Conciliation for promoling the settlement of an industrial dispute.

(2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four other members, as
the appropriate Government thinks fit.

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and any person appointed to represent a party shall be appointed on the
recommendation of that party:

Provided that, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the appropriate Government shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent that parly

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding the
absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its number

Provided that if the appropriate Government notifies the Board that the
services of the chairman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has
been appointed

6. Courts of Inquiry.—(1) The appropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazeite constitute a Court of Inquiry for
inquiring into any matter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute

(2) A Court may consist of one independent person or of such number of
independent persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the
chairman.

(3) A Court, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding
the absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its
number

Provided that, if the appropriate Government- notifies the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be available, the Court shall not act until
a new chairman has been appointed

![7. Labour Courts.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour Courts for the adjudication

of-industrial“disputes relating“to-any-matter. specified in the Second Schedule .
and for-performing-such.other functions as may be assigned-to-them-under this ¥

Act~~

(2) -A-LabourCourt-shall-consist of -one_person. only to be appointed by the #

appropriate -Government.

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 7 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.c.f. 26-6-1951).




-
!
3
<

%

20 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as. the presiding officer ~
of a Labour Court, unless— =" T i
If(a) _Heis, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or»

(b) hehas, for a period of not less than three years, been a District Judge ..

or.an Additional District Judge; or
2[»&]} ; '“""""‘"'“-—----«_‘--T.‘,:.. i :
()] l'f?jf—_s__t_‘_ild any judicial office in India for not less than seven years;
or e i - U LI W SRS
3(e)] he has been the presiding officer of a Labour Court copstituted,
*""“\inder any Provincial ‘Act or State‘Act for not less’than five years.]
4[(H he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.(Central) or
Joint Commissioner of the State Labour Department, having a
degree -in-law-and-at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department including three years of experience .as:Conciliation
Offiver: HHo T min = a T oLt - :
Provided that no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or
Joint: Labour Commissioner-shall be appointed*unless-he. resigris/
from-the‘service-of the Central Government or State Government, as
_the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
“[(g) he is an officer of Indian Legal Service in Grade IlI with three years’
experience in the gradeJ” "t il
7 TSTATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-
lettered as clause (d)], for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”.
[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 25-4-1964).] }
Goa—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,

¥ “#(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High t or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
rdinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law f}c;r the time being in force; or i '
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university es';aglished by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of any Industrail Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituted under any law for L{le time being in force for not less than five

- years; or
(d3) Ke holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner of Labour under a State Government or a
Union territory administration for not less than five years; or”.
[Vide Goa Act'5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).] g
Gu}aml.—ln section 7, in sub-section (3),— :
i) in clause (b), after the words “Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or a
Joint Judge or an Assislant Judge”; iols
(ii; in clause (d), for the words “seven years” substitute the words “five years”;
(iii) in clause (e), for the words “five years” substitute the words “three years” and at
the end of the clause, insert the word “or”;
(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:— X '
“(f) he has C};xactised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
o ngh urt or any Court subordinate thereto or in any Industrial Court or
In f|.u;t1’ial Tribuna) or Labour Court constituted under any law for the time being
in force.” :

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.ef. 15-12-1964).

2. Clause () omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

3. Clauses (a) and (b) relettered as clauses (d) and (e) respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f.
15-12-1964). J

4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 4 (w.e.f, 15-9-2010).

Sec. 7] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.]
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—
a for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(b) he is qualified for agpoi.ntment as, is or has n, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge or; and”
(ii) after clause (c), insert the following clause, namely:—

-*(cc) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a Joint
Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.

[Vide Haryana -Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]

Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— * ) :
! “(1A) In addition to the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall

try offences punishable under this Act and the Acts specified in Part B of the
Second Schedule.”

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 0f 1981, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-1-1982).]

In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted
above), has been omitted. : :

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellaneous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).] .

Maharashtra.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— ;

5 4 “(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the

x High Court, or any court subordinate thereto, ar any Industrial Court or Tribunal
or Ei.abcour Court, constitutéd under any law for the time being in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fiyg:years; or".

[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2.]

After clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely.— '

“(d3) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than five

ears; or’. -

[Vide Malz’arashrra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-5-1976).]

Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
followini clauses, namely:—

“(c) he is or has been a District Judge; or :
(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate
Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Dispytes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two years.”
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab Kct 31 of 1966 (w.e.f. 1-11-1966).]
Ed. The afche said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-B-1984).
gttar Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— ;
4 “(3A) In relation to industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i) of
clause (a) of section 2.or in section 4 of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
h;fwancefc.'ompames) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shall have
effect as if— - il : )
(a) after clause (c) the following new clauses (d) and (e) had been added:—
“(d) is or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding two
ears; ‘
(e) !u a person possessing more than two, years’ practical experience of
..~ adjudicating or settling industrial disputes™; ' 2 .
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)” the words “or clause (d) or clause
(e)” had been added”. 2 WAY o i
[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f. 26-6-1951).]
Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
. West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for'‘clause (b) substitute the following
clause, namely:— : . Wi o8 S e
“(b) he’is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”. -
+ [Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989,-5«.% (w.e.f. 22-1-1989).] ¥ oo



o 22 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

’i COMMENTS

] Right of Labour Court

bt The Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest of justice to seek

> proper assistance and grant ‘leave’ to a party before it is regrescmted by a legal
\\\t practifioner; T.K. Varghese v. Nichimen Corporation, (2002) IV LLJ ( upp) Bom 1018.

'7A=Tribunals.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification in"_.

the--Official~Gazette;“ constitute - one* or *more~Industrial -Tribunals -for - the

adjudication-of-industrialdisputes relating tg any malter, whether specified in

the--Stcond-Schedule-or_the Third Schedule ?[and for performing such other
~functions-as-may- be-assigned-to-them uinider this Act].>

(2 - A-Tribunai~shall-consist-of-one- person-only-to.be_appainted_by. the-

apprcpriate Government.
(3) A person shall.not he qualified for appointment as the presiding officer
of a-Tribunal-unless—
(a).-he-is; or-has been,-a-Judge-of -a-High Court;-or®~
%I(aa) . he-has, for a period of not less than three-years, been a District Judge
or.an. Additional District.Judge; 4[***]]:.
“[()._he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or
: Joint Commissioner. .of the State Labour Department, having a.
degree in law and at least seven years’ experience in the labour
d(}ga.th.nenb-i:-’wluding*three*years--of‘experience’*as-{-‘_’onci.liation
Officer:
Provided..that no. such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.or
Joint Labour. Commissioner-shall-be_appointed unless he resigns

from the service of the Central Government or State Government, -as-

the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
llc) he is an officer.of Indian Legal-Service-in-Grade Ill-with-three-years’

experience-in-the-grade.]

(4] The"appropriate-Government may, if it sg thinks fit, appoint two persons. .

as assessors-to.advise-the-Tribunal in the proceeding before it.] ..

STATE AMENDMENTS
I]Assam.—ln section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the following clause,
namely—

"gu) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court:

Provided.that the appointment to a Tribunal of any person qualified under this
, clause shall not be made without consultation with the Assam High Court; or”.
[Vide Assam' Act 8 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962).] WG
I?l-iha;.—ln section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert’ t[§.e‘followmg clause,
mmE 2 i . . I dile
"Xm) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years: it
Provided that the appointment toa Tribunal of any person qualified under this
clause shall be made in consultation with the High Court of the State in which the
Tribunal has or is intended to have, its usual place of sitting; or”.
[Vide Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 7-7-1959).] :

Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

Ins. by Act 46 of 1982, sec, 4(a) (w.e.f. 21-8-1984),

Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964). )

The word “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). .

. Ins, by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010). Earlier clause (b) was omitted by Act 46 of 1982,
sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.ef. 15-9-2010).

LN SRl o

Sec, 7A] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23

Goa.—In séction 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (az), substitute the following clauses,
namely:—
“(b) he is, or has been, a District Judge; or
(c) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
, or an Assistant Judge; or :
(d) he isiqualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
[Vide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).]
Gujarat.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3),—
(i) in clause (aa), after the words “an Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or
a Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”;
(i) in clause (b) [Ed. clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)), insert the word “or” at the end;
(i) after clause (b), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(c) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force”.
[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (c), insert, the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years”.
[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 1-8-1981)]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
Haryana.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3),—
(i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge; or”; and
(ii) after'clause (aa), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(aaa) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a
Joint Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]
Kerala.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), substitute the following clause,
namely:— . .
“(a) he is, or has been, a judicial officer not below the rank of a District Judge, or is
qualified for appointment as a Judge of a High Court; or”.
[Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-7-1961)).
Madhya Pradesh.—In section 74, for sub-section (3), substitute the following sub-section,
namely:— : '
“(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the Presiding Officer of a
Tribunal unless—
(a) he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or
(b) he is eligible for being appointed a Judge of a High Court; or
(c) he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or
(d) he has worked as a member of the Board of Revenue for a period of not less
than three years; or ¥
(e) he has worked as Commissioner of Labour for a period of not less than three
years; or




o

N ExL

An

M

24 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7A

(f) he has worked as a member of the Industrial Court constituted under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),
for a period of not less than five years.”

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-1-1989).]

Maharashtra.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “Judge of a
High Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or a person qualified for appointment as a
Judge of a High Court”. ; ;

[Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 4-1-1963).)

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (aa), for the words “an Additional District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an Assistant Judge or”.

After clause (b), [Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)), insert the following clause, namely:— =

“(c) he has for not less than five years been a presiding officer of a Labour Court,
constituted under any law for the time being in force.” -

[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3.]

After clause (c) insert the following clause, namely.—

“(d) he holds degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank' than that of
Assistant Comunissioner of Labour under the State Governument for not less than ten
years,” j -

[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3.]

Mysore (Karnataka).—(1) In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the
following clause, namely:— ;

“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge, or”.

[Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 31-1-1963).]

(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, alter the words “District Judge®,
insert the words “for a period of not less than three years.”

[Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-12-1963).]

Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). 2

Orissa—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:— : £ J

“(aa) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of not
less than seven years.” i

{Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960).] : :

West Bengal.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or an Additional District Judge”.

[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-9-1958).]

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (2a), substitued the following clause, namely:—

“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”.

[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4.] »

COMMENTS
Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal

Section 7A empowers the appropriate Government to constitute one or more
Industrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any matter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Sharina y. Rajasthan Patrika Lid., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

Sec. 7C) ‘ The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 25

1[7B. National Tribunals.—(1) The Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Industrial Tribunals for
the ‘adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opinion of the Central
Government, involve questions of national importance or are of such a nature
that industrial establishments situated in more than one State are likely to be
interested in, or affected by, such disputes. e i

(2) A National Tribunal shall consist of one person only to be appointed by
the Central Government. E e

(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointrﬁent as the preéiﬂing officer
of a National Tribunal ?[unless he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court].

(4) The Central Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons as
assessors to advise the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

| [7C. Disqualifications for the presiding officers of Labour Courts,

Trxb}malg and’ National Tribunals.—No person shall be appointed to, or
continue in, the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or
National Tribunal, if— Sl

¢ oka) he is not an independent person; or

~ (b) he has attained the age of sixty-fiye years.]

STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—

“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before the completion of any
proceedings pending before him, the State Government may, if in_the opinion of
such Government public interést so requires, order his continuance in office for a

% period not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”
[Vide Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec, 3 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962).]
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7C, for clause (b), substitute the following
clause, namely:-— )2 - i PR LR
“(b) he has attained the age of sixty-seven years”. :
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the Central Act 31 of 1966
West Bengal.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—

“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Gowpunent attains the age of sixty-five years before completion of any proceedings
pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of such
Government public interest so requires, order his continuance in office for a period
not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”

[Vide West Bengal Act 11 of 1959, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 27-10-1959).] '

g ! SECTION 7D :
Gujarat.—Alfter section 7C, insert the following section, namely:— ;

“7D. Certain District Judges qualified Jor appointments on Tribynal constituted
by State Government.—Notwithstanding anything contained in’ sub-section (1) of
_section 7A,— . ' ' A

3 (_1) The State Go.vernmmt may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
section for performing such ather functions as may be assigned to it under this Act.
-{2) Where the State Government constitutes a Tribunal under section 7A, the
Tribunal may consist of a person who is, or has been, for a period of not less than
_ 1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). 2 -2
2. 'Subs. by Act.46 of 1982, sec. 5, for certain words (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).




26 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7C

5 years, a District Judge or an Additional or Joint District Judge and
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appointment as the
presiding officer of the Tribunal.

(3) The appointment of a person qualified under clause (2) shall be made after
consultation with the High Court.”

[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 9-8-1962).)

I[8. Filling of -vacancies.—If, for any reason a vacancy (other than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal ‘or National Tribunal or in the office of the Chairman or any other
member of a Board or Court, then, in the case of a National Tribunal, the Central
Government and in any other case, the appropriate Government, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Act to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is filled.] :

%9, Finality of orders constituting Boards, etc—(1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appointing any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or National Tribunal shall be called in
question in any manrer; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court
shall be called in question in any manner on the ground merely of the existence
of any vacancy in, or defect in the constitution of, such Board or Court.

(2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason only of the fact that such settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred 'to in sub-section (6) of section 12 or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be. :

(3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course of conciliation
proceeding before a Board is signed by the Chairman and all the other members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or
unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the Board
during any stage of the proceeding.]

3[CHAPTER 1IA

NOTICE OF CHANGE

- 9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes to effect any change in
the conditions of service applicable to any workman in respect of any matter
specified in the Fourth Schedule, shall effect such change,—

(a) without giving to the workmen likely to be affected by such change
a notice in the prescribed manner of the nature of the change
proposed to be effected; or

(b) within twenty-one days of giving such notice:"
Provided that no notice shall be required for effecting any such change—

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section B was substituted

by ‘Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951). " :

2. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 9 was amended

by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951),
3. Chapter lIA (containing sections 9A and 9B) ins, by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

:
1
1
4
(=1
il
|

i




A—M@c wre =1

Tt Ho Elo Uelo-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Py m o~
Che Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
AT [[—@Ug 3 IU-WUS (i)
PART I1—Section 3 Sub-section (i)
WIferh I | weRiyTe
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| 275] 3 feoott, sewfaar, arier 30, 2015/8vm@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

I AT A HATHT
At
73 faeft, 6 i+, 2015

qraL . 336().—F=T avFE, sdEntis Gaw afiffam, 1947 $i g 38 & 3w (1) F
T () T WE Afehal FT T4 Fd g0 Awfofea Fam aardt g, 99—

1. @fRm 7 ol s —(1) =7 Rt & wfe am g =, senti aftemor s agi afds
(A9, W 3T 9vg qAT F FAawua 6w o) Faw, 20152

(2) & T § I TRI9H & AT & 99 i |
2. qftarere—(1) &7 FRadi & 519 a% & w2d & geram e 7 80—
() “aftrfag” & denfis Pare aftfmm, 1047 (1947 &7 14) s g

(@) “frarefiT afterrdy” & afefes f grer 7, g 76 a1 owr 79 F aefiw fewi afbwe & =1
¥ fAopen =af=r afsa 21

(2) I o==T AT T2 F, ST 24 Pt § wyen & qan afvafa 79 § wig st # efvafea 2
% a2t a € S 3% aferfaay J§ wHe: 39 2 |

3. rdenre.— et daa =refver £ fewa st ¥ =v # gfafagfe £ zar 4, sfaf@gie f @t
Tt A1 a9 Ft gft i Jargs sradfier £ zom # FfRe T ad £ arg a9 ¥ o Zeft

1926 G1/2015 (1)



st

t}mmr el

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

4. Aga.—(1) TEr afgFer F ferf affw #1397 80,000 = (Fraa) gfime £ fag a2 & 2em
A forrs siata Jara =rraefiat £ zeon & sfafgie awmn o Fanfigs amsfet f zar § w9 do
qTE |

(2) = =TT At st & feria aftesmr # aqr A gem —

(i) foram =mrefier (xfaf® =) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 %.

(ii) fSrerm =rrrmsfter (7aw AvfY) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 =.

(iii) ForeT =aTerefter (srfasrer 3a+) - 70,290-1540-76,450 .

9id /T2 F Aqq § ket Gord, Wor awqed a1 o7 Jartaafey F wrag ot 2 afy # ar

Tiq 7g o frerfT st % = & 0 saftn it Fegfe £ qan & 5 =l G a1 v ger 0w
AR (Fes 1) AT TS FEHTT F 6 geh & Uz F Jarfge 2 diw B dor £ AfF grer Beft Fanfagf
& B F 9 BT A1 I F7 w@r § A i FA & g gwew & a2, ferha afdwrd ¥ o o
e 3w & et Yord % avrat §F TR & w2 fear s |

5. s WATL—Er sfdaeor it Frerdie affw i g2ard a=r 39 2 & I F$9 Sy 39T AT F
HaTd =aefe #T T |
(2) =9 =rravery 4t siEnfE st & fonfm aftmat £ a2 aages gge 9= 9w #7299 %
EHATL B ST Fed 1T AEHIT F THg ‘F ATFIET 5T 9a-a8q7 9T arghia B o w@r & o
qAfige &t @ty F dw aeia susfeat & vga aa F 59 % Ry s F a9 F gqegdia
gt |
6. TR TRYEE wAT.—(1) T sfdawor & ferta afdmtat w5 ag e aftww a9 37 20 S 9=
ATl % FTETeter £ 3T |
(2) = =raTEy A sttt & e sftmfat & e afinws o w0 5w F
A F AT F a97 A Hant F et fatataa 2
7. Tt Ramre.—odir after & ferfa aftrfe % o S g aresy grsmr i gy
IR AATAT & T UL IqA= TEAT S TRl Fea 1 Ty AT T § Al 2, 787 9% 7 Fea T 41
(Frfrear afi=mat) Fam, 1944 & wuar swefea giraio &= F forg gha g6
(2) =\ =TE 4 st stfeor F derdia sftemien F oo, fffre g w0 awwr
& TE ‘F AteERaE wr gar an At F sadiw Gfate 2t
8. gg—ug wfdsvw F derfta safgwiat ¥ oo, ggt @ d&6fiq qmer 3g = § 9T
FATIETI T TAT AT BT |
(2) @9 =TT ar st afdgor F e aftmte F o, gh & @646 ama w2
ORI o G¥g ‘F' ATIFTAT & 747 AR) Fodt F srefie frieatoe g
9. w T wr.—(1) T st F o aftmfat F T G a=r gatsra am-gier
AT FATRAT F AT AT A8 TrALTe = &2 8 Hehr oheram qm o7 Taer fHm S

(2) =g =raTed @7 senfis aftmr F ferftn aftwmhat F o = awr F a9g '+
FHATICAT % o7 T97 srara g Cherar s 1 wee G s |



[9r 11-8vE 3(i)] WL 1 19 ¢ SETH

10. FrET wr.—flerfia afawiRat i 37 AfFas & THT 9% A0 G T AT gFAE F ATH ATAT
T & gHAT BT |

1. @&t arr Ramaa.—(1) gt sifdere & frorfta sfdsmfat & for s geeme o sgaw =oft F o
T AT T S Fgra & forw gt v Rarar gnft

(2) =¥ =T & et aftemr & S aftmta F oo gt amn form fere gttt
T QAT % Arer o e arare qAfartora =ifce i a9r @ Faw F et ARt 2
12. &g wat.—(1) Ter stfdee & frerfi sfdmfa F P dwdr g g agg aug o RfRte
F TS e T % T H aTgA ST &7 e B s |

(2) =g 7T AT St et & drareita gttt wr ag Fewew v & ar a amd
FAT & TSI o TN €T H1T 76 I7 9 ATEA FT TR0 qfcw1g w2 o 1u g=gae e G
T &L |
13. SAFIGQT AT FGT—(1) I==aq 2off F aeardt Gaai F &0 e eaiaer 997 e d@iteg
AT AT AW FATATAT FT FAAGT FIA F (A0 @ GRATAT TF AT GHAAT F FATA B TX
HEATAT % [ AT qF T TATATAL0T JTHT HAT 51T |

(2) =W T A srenfE afiwr F fentw aftmiat F Fo e = a9
A % e 97 FRE F araa witate sfte F o F=ha awe F aan ang Rt F
AT BT |
14. sfETh sy sfm—fordw aftmtat #r afeeft Rt v & fea 5 aqar
AT FT Safer & S 2 F g gn |
15. T AT AT —37 HIHE $1 arad s e § g affe=rs Iuaer 98 a7 70 § Sege a1 5=
T} 1 44t F Raydr @ odt & gafda gt i Fe qewr F @iy ® o gy s, st
arfrTor A Tt sfvereor gren fAEfam B smod, i Fei avr &1 39 ue Rffa awer gem )

16. TRe w3 ft afts —F=5ra g #1374 FAgat Bl sgayg v G a5t a1 yast F safeat famEa
farfarer e it orfzr gft
[#. 12-25025/05/2013-HTU7TH-2]

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(l) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015,

(2)  They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(a) ““Act” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);

Avnarwre I
3



Annexwre L

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(b) “Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4. Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/- (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
Jjudges.

(2) The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) - Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(ii) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
(1ii) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450
per month inclusive of gross pension, pension equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer. who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding vlTicers ol National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals, the cily compensatory
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courts.

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable (o the Group =A” Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operation, they shall be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Auendance) Rules, 1944.

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilitics shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-"* A” Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.—(l) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government.

9.  House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“A" Officers of the Central Government.

10. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.




‘Q(y\nz_)(u re =

(¥ I-avs 3(i)] R =1 TSYA : STHHERY 5

11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2)  For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a
staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance
shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14.  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

15. Other Conditions of Service.—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the
Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the
Central Government thercon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-11]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi- 110054,



Annexure-III

Check-list for each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, Dhanbad-1I

Name of the Officer:

Sl. | Document Status of enclosure
No. of document
Y —Yes
N —No
NA — Not Applicable
1 Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer
during the last five years
2 Vigilance clearance of the officer
3 Integrity certificate of the officer
4 Annexure-IV
(Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)
5 Annexure-V
(Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer)

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General

of the concerned High Court)



Proforma for Bio-data
(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Annexure-IV

Name (in full)

Date of Birth

Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
Additional District Judge or equivalent post

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details
in
respect
of last/
current
post
held

Name of the last/current post

Date of appointment to
last/current post

Date of retirement

Scale of pay

Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no.

(Office)

(Residential)

(Mobile)

E-mail address

Date:

Place:

Signature:

Name:



Annexure-V

Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years
of each judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
Central Government Industrial Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Dhanbad-I

Name of the Officer:

Sl. | Year/Period | Details of Details of | Details of

No. Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
Authority & | Authority & | Authority &
Grading Grading Grading

1

2

3

4

8

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)




