No. A-11016/8/2016-CLS-I1I
Government of India

Ministry of Labour & Employment
Fokokok kK

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.

Dated 19.12.2016
To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Ernakulam.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC) at Ernakulam is to be filled up shortly in accordance
with the provisions contained in Sections 7 & 7A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (relevant
extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to these provisions, the post can be held
by a judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court or who has rendered not less
than three years’ service as an Additional District Judge or a District Judge. A serving Judge can
be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term. A retired Judge can be appointed
on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of appointment of a Judge to the post of
Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The Presiding Officers of the Labour Court,
Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions
of Service) Rules, 2015].

2 The scales of pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC are as
follows:

(i) Distt. Judge (Entry Level) - Rs.51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070/-
(i) Distt. Judge (Selection Grade) - Rs.57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210-1540-70,290/-
(iii) Distt. Judge (Super time Scale) - Rs.70,290-1540-76,450/-
3. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who are willing to be appointed

as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC, Ernakulam and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may
please be furnished to this Ministry within a period of two months from the date of issue of this
letter i.e. by 18.02.2017 for selection of a suitable officer. A set of three (03) proformas
(Annexure-III, IV & V) is to be included with each application. A check-list (copy placed at
Annexure-III) regarding the documents/copies enclosed may be sent with each application.
The Bio-Data of each of the officers may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-IV
to be filled by the concerned officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General. The
nomination of each of the officers may be forwarded along with an abstract of ACRs (if
applicable to the officer) of the last five years duly certified in the proforma placed at
Annexure-V, along with verified copies of ACR dossiers and vigilance clearance (if applicable).

Continued on Page 2
Q‘/&«Q/




e

4, It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the requirements, as
mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on terms and conditions mentioned
in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be furnished to this Ministry along with the
proformas (Annexure-III, IV & V) enclosed with each application.

5, It is urged that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas and the
last date of sending of applications may strictly be adhered to. It is informed that only the
nominations with complete proformas (Annexure-III, IV and V) and verified copies

of ACR dossiers (if applicable) received on/before 18.02.2017 will be considered by
the Ministry. The matter may kindly be treated as urgent.

6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours fa{it‘rTfuIIy,

g~
(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India
Tel. No. 011-23766903
Copy to: ‘

1. Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC,
Ernakulam may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2 All Deputy Chief Labour Commissioners (Central) with the request to take up the matter
with the Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

Encl: Annexure-I, II, III, IV & V. (/\\
\ MQ/

(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India

C;pj b - Detuckor NIC, Mimctry of Labgtd d E””f’b{f/ TW}
Wi hegmist o ”73@@-0/ U2 cecmdar oh oIy

heb s ili




faber

PPV S B

Sec. 7]

The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 19

(2) A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for a limited period.

5. Boards of Conciliation.—(1) The appropriate Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Board of
Conciliation for promoling the settlement of an industrial dispute.

(2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four other members, as
the appropriate Government thinks fit.

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and any person appointed to represent a party shall be appointed on the
recommendation of that party:

Provided that, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the appropriate Government shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent thal parly.

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding the
absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that if the appropriate Government notifies the Board that the
services of Lhe chairman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the’
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has
been appointed.

6. Courts of Inquiry.—(1) The appropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Court of Inquiry for -
inquiring inlo any matter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute. )

(2) A Court may cousist of one independent person or of such number of
independen! persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the
chairman. ‘ .

(3) A Courl, having the prescribed quorum, may act nofwithstanding
the absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its
number:

Provided that, if the appropriate Government notifies the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be available, the Court shall not act until
a new chairman has been appoinled.

*7. Labour Courts.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by nolification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour Courts for the adjudication ;"

of-industrial"disputes relating*to-any-matter.specified in the Second Schedule .

and for-performing-such.other functions as may be assigned-to-them-under this #
Aet—

(2) A-Labour Court shall- consist of_one person only to be appointed by the ~
appropriate Government.

L Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 7 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951). ;

[
i




AN\J;__‘\:’_V\ e = _L

20 The Industiial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

(3) A pexson shall not be qualified for appointment as. the presiding officer -

of.a Labour Court, unless=5="——""

I{(a) _he iy, or has been, a Judge of a High _C.op:{t_;‘(r-:mi_

. (b) hehas, fora period af not ess.than thras.years, heen a District Judge

ouan Additional District Judge; or,

2peer)) BT .

3{(d)]_he has held any judicial office in India for not less than seven yeags;

i
or

3[(’?))_! he has been the presiding officer of a Labour Court cohsﬁtuted/

““{inder any Provincial ‘Act or State*Act for-not Jess'than five years.]
4{(f) he is_or has been a Deputy Chief.Labour Commissioner.(Central) or
Joint Commissioner of the  State Labour Department, havipg ‘a
degree -in-law--and.at least seven years’:experience in the labour
doﬂélf)l?l“m?!}t including three years of experience..as-Conciliation
CEI-:-“"‘"‘.L"""&:""* - AN AR Y SR R P e
Provided thal no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or

Joint- Labour Commissioner-shall be*appointed: unlessthe. resigrs/

from-the-service-of- the-Central Government.or State Government, 4s
the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding office; orl
(g) he is an officer of Indian Ig‘:gt;a.]‘dSc'{-\‘r'iéé JﬁGrade T with three years’
expgriem:c; .Ll"l the grade,.]"“" —-i&&-n—-—-:,:-—ll.n-——r_ :
“"STATE AMENDMENTS _
Andaman and Nicebar Islands,—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-
lettered as clause (d)), for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”.
[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.f.29-4-1964).] - - . . oo
Goa—In section 7, in sub-section (3), afler clause (d), insert the following clauses,

T i i v

“(d1) he has practised as an advocate or altorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force; or g

(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Depuly Registrar of any Industrail Court or ‘Tribunal or Labour

Court constituted under any law for the time being in force for not less than five -

ears; or -
(d3) Kc holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner of Labour under a State Government or a
Union territory administration for not less than five years; or”.
(Vide Goa Act’5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).] ° -~
Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),— A
i) in clause (b), after the words “Additional District Judge®, insert the words “or a
Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”; ' g S
(iig in clause (d), for the words “seven years” substitute the words *five years”;
(iii) in clause (e}, for the words “five years” substitute the words “three years” and at
the end af the clause, insert the word “or”; . 7
(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:— : )
“(f) he has practised as an advocale or attarney for not less than seven years in a
. v .. High C[(;u.rt or any Court subordinate thereto or in any Industrial” Court or
Iny l'ueria! Tribunal or Labour Court constituted under any law for the time being
in force.” 2 ' Ty ¢

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964). :

2. Clause (c) omilted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.l 21-8-1984).

3. Clauses (a) and (b) reletlered as clauses (d) and (e) respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.c.f.
15-12-1964). B =

4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

e e et g T N SIOL 0 o

Sec. 7) n The Industrial Disputas Acl, 1947 21

[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—
(Is for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(b) he is qualified for agpoinlruenl as, is'or has been, a District Judge or an
© " Additiona! District Judge or; and” . ;
(i) after ¢lause (c), insert the following clause, namely:—
. *(cc) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
. Government or anofficer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a Joint
Labour Comumissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana .Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).] : )
- Madhya Pradesh.—In section-7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— : * e b = ' ' :
4 “(1A) In addition to Lhe functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall
" try offences punishable under this Act and the Acts specified in Part B of the
Second Schedule.” : .
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, see. 3 (w.e.f. 26-1-1982)]
In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted

. above), has been omilted.

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellancous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003)] -
j h{ialmrashtra.—-—-ln section 7, iy sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— ' 12 e i
ay-"(dl) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the
High Court, or any court subordinate thereto, ar any Industrial Court or Tribunal
" or Labour Court, constituted under any law for the time being in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in'law of a university established by law in‘any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fjyg.years; or”,
{Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2.] ’ .
After clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely:— e
“(d3) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
Commissionar of Labour under the State Government for not less than five
" years; or”. ' ; T ik
[Vide Magamahm Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-5-1976).]
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh,—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namely:—

“(c) he is'or has been a District Judge; or } : -

(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate
Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Dispytes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two years.” ;
[Vide Punjab Act B of 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab Kct 31 of 1966 (w.e,f. 1-11-1966).]

Ed. The above said amendments were made prior Lo the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, -sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1084). -
L!Inar Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following sub-secton,
namely:— » H
E “(3A) In relation to industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i) of
.clause.(a) of section 2 or in secton 4 of the Industrial Dispules (Banking and
lrf\isumncefCompmﬂes) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shaull have
effect as if— - " - . ‘ :
(a) after clause (c) the following new clauses (d) and (¢) had been added:—
“(d) is or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding two
ears; :
(e) i a person possessing more than two_years’ practical experience of
) adjudicating or settling industrial disputes™; © "~
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)” the words "or clause (d) or clause
(e)"-had been' added"”, © " 0 P e mif
[Vide Utlar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f. 26-6-1951).] L .
Ed.—The aboye said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for'clause (b) substitute the following
clause, namely:— sl b -
“(b) he’is, or has been, a District Judge or an  Additional District Judge; or”. -
« [Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec§ (w.e.f. 22-1-1989).] £ r # s




Roane Xinre

22 The Industial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

COMMENTS
Right of Labour Court
The Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest of justice to seck
prope assistance and grant ‘leave’ to a party before it is represented by a legal
practiioner; T.K. Varghese v, Nichimen Corporation, (2002) 1V LL] (Supp) Bom 1018.

7A=Tribunals.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification in: .,

the--Official -~ Gazette;~constitute * one* or ~ more~Industrial - Tribunals —for- the
adjudication- of-industrial disputes relating to any matter, whether specified in

the-Second--Schedule-or.. the Third Schedule ?[and for gc;r_fprrqing such other
~functons-as-may be-assigned-to- them™ tinder” this"Act] = !

(2)- A- Tribunal-shall-consist-of-one- person-only-to-be_appainted _by_the: .

appropriate Government.
(3 A person shall.not be qualified for appointment as the presiding officer
of a Tribunal-unless— ' '
(a).-he is;or-has been,-a-Judge-of a-High Court; or"-
?I(aa) .. he.has, for a period of not less than three-years, been a District Judge
or.an.Additional District.Judge; 4[**]):. RIS
*[(b)._he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or
< Joint .Commissioner of the State” Labour Department,_having.a
degree in law and at least seven years' experience in the labour
department--including «three~years—of -experienceas~Eonciliation
Officer: ;
Provided..that no. such_Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.or
Joint Labour Commissioner-shall-be.appointed_unless he resigns

from the service of the Central Government or State Government, -as-

the case may be, before being appdinted as the presiding officer; or]
‘I(c) he is'an officer.of Indian Legal Service-in-Grade IlL-with-three- years’
experience-in-the-grade’]’ ; wonie ad e g B R

(4 The"appropriate-Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons..

-a3 assessors-to.advise-the_Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]...

STATE AMENDMENTS
;?ssam.—ln section 7A, in sub-seclion (3), after clause (a) insert the fallowing clause,
namely.— :
“(aa) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court: fusi
Provided that the appointnent to a Tribunal of an person qualified under this
clause shall not be made -without consultation with the Assam High Court; or”.
[Vile Assam Act 8 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f, 30-4-1962).) PG
I?iha{.—ln section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert’ the following clause,
namely:—- - ; et Sl
“{aa) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years: o ;
Provided that the appointment to'a Tribunal of any person qualified under this
clause shall be made in consultation with the High Court of the State in which the
Tribunal has or is intended to have, its usual plage of sitting; or”. -
[Viée Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 7-7-1959).] s

L Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

2, Ins. by Act 46 of 1982, sec, 4(a) (w.e.f. 21-8-1984),

3. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).

4. The word “or” omilted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.L. 21-8-1984).

5. Ins, by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010). Earlier clause (b) was omitted by Act 46 of 1982,
see. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e£. 15-9-2010).

Sec. 7A] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23

Goa—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitute the following clauses,
namely:— i i
“(b) he is, or has been, a District Judge; or
(¢) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
, or an Assistant Judge; or oy
(d) he is-qualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
[Vide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.e.f, 21-10-1987).]
Gujarat.—In section 7A, in sub-section 3)—
(i) in clause (aa), after the words “an ‘Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or
a Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge"”; '
(ii) in clause (b) [Ed. clause (b) has beeq omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)), insert the word “or” at the end; ‘
(iii) after clause (b), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(c) he has for not less than five years heen the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force.
[Vidde Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.)
In section' 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (c), insert, the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years"”.
|Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 1-8-1981).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). Z
Haryana.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3),—
- (i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge; or”; and :
" (i) after'clause (aa), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(aaa) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a
Joint Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).) '
Kerala.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), substitute the following clause,
name!y:— ; )
“(a) he is, or has been, a judicial officer not below the rank of a District Judge, or is
qualified for appointment as a Judge of a High Court; or”.
[Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-7-1961)]. )
Madhy._{ Pradesh.—In section 7A, for sub-section (3), substitute the following sub-section,
namely.— ' 1 - ; y .
“(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the Presiding Oificer of a
Tribunal unless— 7
(a) he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or
(b) he is eligible for being appointed a Judge of a High Court; o
(e) 'he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or ) .
(d) he has worked as a member of the Board of Revenue for a period of not less
than three years; or 3 | :
- (¢) he has worked as Comumissioner of Labour for a period of not less than three
years; or : i




Annaxiire

The Industiial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7A
(f) he has worked as a member of the Industrial Court constituted under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),

for a period of not less than five years,” ‘ .

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec, 3 (w.e f. 15-1-1989).]

Maharashlra.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “Judge of a
High Court”, inser! the words “or a District Judge or a person qualified for appointment as a
Judge of a High Court”.  * S ed e ks

[Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 4-1-1963).] ~ -

In section 7A, in sub-gection (3), in clause (aa), for the words “an Additional District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an Assistant Judge or”.

After clause (b), [Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)), insert the following clause, namely:— por 2 . .

“(c) he has for not less than five years been a presiding officer of ‘a Labour Court,
constituted under any law for the bme being in force.” & . Ty 0y

[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3.] .

Aller clause (¢) insert the following clause, namely:—

“(d) he holds degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank’ than that of
Assistant Commissioner of Labour under the State Government [or not less than ten

: years.” i i ) i = L

[Vidde Maharashira Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3,] ol ' d

Mysore (Karnataka).—(1) In secton 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insext the
following clause, namely:— ‘ B g

“(aa) he is, ar has been, a District Judge, or”.

[Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 31-1-1963) ] ;

(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, after the words “District Judyge”,
insert the words “for a period of not less than three years.” - ' L. :

" [Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f 12-12-1963).]

Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984). ' ‘ : ' d

Orissa.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:— =~ ) SR it G ' ' '

“(aa) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of not
less than seven years.” ‘ -

[Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960).] - 3 o

West Bengal.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), afler the words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a Dislrict Judge or an Additional Districl jm_ige".

[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-9-1958).]

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following clause, namely:—

“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4.] .

COMMENTS
Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal )

Section 7A empowers the appropriale Government to constitule one or more
Industrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any matter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matjers which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the maltters which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Sharina y, Rajasthan Patrika Lid., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

*
L &
:
.-,
;. .
=

= s ]
Sec. 7C) ) The Industrial. Disputas Act, 1947 25

* .. Y[7B, National Tribunals.—(1) The Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Industrial Tribunals for
the ‘adjudication of industrial disputes  which, in the opinion of the Central
Government, involve questions of national importance or are of such a nature
that industrial establishments 'situated in more than one State are likely to be
interested in, or affected by, such disputes. : TR PR

(2) A Ngtion'enllfl‘:'ibunal shall consist of one person only to be appointed by

the Cenltval Goyernment. - | e e el

.. (3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the presiding officer

of -a National Tribunal 3Iunless he is, or has heen, a Judge of a High Court].
' (4) The Central Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons as

assessors to adyjse the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

H7C. Disqualifications for’ the presiding officers of Labour Courts,
Tribunals ‘and” National Tribunals.—No person shall be appointed to, or
continue in, the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or
National Tribunal, if— -~ i i e e 5

¢~ (3 he is'mot an independent person; or
(b) he has attained the age of sixty-five years.)

= “i+ STATE AMENDMENTS - .

Asgsam.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely;— <
“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal a ppointed by the State
Government “attains, the age. of sixty-five years before the completion of any
proceedings pending before him, the State Government may, if in_ the opinion of
sueh Government public interést so requires, order his continuance in office for a

* . period not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.” e
. [Vide Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec, 3 (w.ef. 30-4-1962).) .
Punjab, H.}ry;mc Fh:_mgli_gaﬂn_%h\ seclion 7C, for clause (b), substitute the following
clause, namely:— LT T e RN ¥ 7 E EWE SIS P I

“(b) he has attained the age qf sixty-seven years”. ¥ LI - :

[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the Central Act 31 of 1966] ** -

West Bengal.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namiely:—""
“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before completion of a.njr proceedings
pending before him, the State Government may, if in ‘the opi.nion‘ of .such
Govemmment public interest so requires, order his continuance in office for a period
not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”

[Vide West Bengal Apl '1‘1 of 1959, sec. 3 (w.e.f, 27-10-1959).]

£ ' " SECTION 7D
Gujarat.—After section 7C, insert the following section, namely:— .

“7D. Certain District Judges qualified Jor appointments on Tribynal constituted
by State Government.—Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) of
section 7A,— s ' ‘ c ¥ -

: (}) The State Government may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
section for performing such other functions as may be assigned to it under this Act.
(2) Where (he State Government constitutes a Tribunal under section 7A, the
Tribunal may consist of a person who is, or hag been, for a peripd r'.;f,notlless than

_ % Jus. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).- :
" 2. 'Subs. by Act.46 of 1982, sec. 5, for ‘certain words (w.e.f 21-8-1984). -




26 Tha Industrial Dispules Act, 1947 [Sec. 7C

5 years, a District Judge or an Additional or Juint District Judge and
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appointment as the
presiding officer of the Tribunal. ‘

(3) The appointment of a person qualified under clause (2) shall be made after
consultation with the High Court.”

[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 9-8-1962).]

'[8. Filling of vacancies.—If, for any reason a vacancy (other than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal or National Tribunal or in the office of the Chairman or any other
member of a Board or Court, then, in the case of a National Tribunal, the Central
Government and in any other case, the appropriate Government, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Act to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is filled.] : :

(9. Finality of orders constituting Boards, ete—(1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appoinling any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or National Tribunal shall be called in
question in any manner; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court
shall be called in question in any manner on the ground merely of the existence
of any vacancy in, or defect in the constitution of, such Board or Court.

(2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason only of the fact that such settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in sub-section (6) of section 12 or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be.

(3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course of conciliation
proceeding before a Board is signed by the Chairman and all the other members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or
unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the Board
during any stage of the proceeding.] ’

3[CHAPTER IIA

NOTICE OF CHANGE

“ 9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes to effect aﬁy change in
the conditions of service applicable to any workman in respect of any matter
specified in the Fourth Schedule, shall effect such change,— .

(a) without giving to the workmen likeliy to be affected by such change
a nolice in lhe prescribed manner of the nature of the change
proposed to be effected; or e
(b) within lwenty-one days of giving such notice: |
Provided that no notice shall be required for effecting any such change—

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.E. 10-3-1957). Earlier section B was substi |
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951). « . T

2. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 9 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951). ’

3. Chapter lIA (containing sections 9A and 9B) ins, by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (w.e.f: 10-3-1957).

b
b




Avine Yeuwire —iL

5=t o Elo TH0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

ASUA

AP g m -
Che Gazette of India

l’\_

EXTRAORDINARY
WA [1—@Ug 3 IT-TUE (i)
PART I1—Section 3 Sub-section (i)
wifgst ¥ venifira
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 275] % faeelt, Sewfaar, sl 30, 2015/4vm@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

qH A ASEE HATAT
sl
7% faeeft, 6 adier, 2015

... 336(1).—F=17 g, denfis Fae afdfiag, 1947 € gwr 38 & sg-awy (1) F
T (1) g Y= AafRdl F1 G0 Fd gu fAwtataa A aqrdt g, s —

1. dftm a7 T A —(1) 57 st #1 dfem Jr g e, denfie st g g aftemor
(3, 9 AT wvg Far & Feraq iz o) Fgg, 20152 1

(2) T TSt H I W19 F GG F qgd 219 |
2. gRmmTg—(1) 27 Fagi § sa 9% & gad § gy sifea 92—
(&) “afafRay & denfis Pare aRfag, 1947 (1947 #1 14) afdvea 2

(@) “fizrefia afdwrd § afafgq & g 7, g 746 a1 g 79 F adfiT ST aftwd F 59
¥ fAger =afew afstia €

(2) 37 @r=at T et %, o g gt & vy @ qar ainfue wgf & wig afdfay & efvarfia 2
Ik agl o4 g S I arfafeasy § #He 39§ |

3. wrdwre Rt Jarea =t f o sftwrd F w0 § wiaRafe & zar 4, gfafagfe £ aafe
ATETUEET i av 6t gt A Jarfage raraedier 6 gar § Fgfe Gae ad £ smy a6 % forg gnft

1926 GI/2015 (1)



ane_‘zﬂw‘?— ‘“E

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

4. da.—(1) g stEsr F Qe sfawrd &7 aq= 80,000 =. (Fad) wiiwg i Faq = & g
& forge siasla Gama mrsdial £ ear § wlAffgRe war siv fafge e & a1 § gea o7
dT g

(2) == =arverd v e st F fzeia aftamrd & G e e —

(i) Torer =araefter (wfaf® w<) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 =.

(ii) ForaT =aranefter (w9+ Avft) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 %.

(iii) freT Faradier (sifasrer daw) - 70,290-1540-76,450 =.

wfd 91g ¥ a9 & @et Yo, Yo aaqed a1 o7 AarfAghy ¥ wrag ft § aR fE are

yig ag B Frerfia afdsd F w0 9 w8 sl 6 Rgle i gar J, s sarfas @9 a1 97 geg 99
G (F219) AT TG G F G AYE F IS § ga1i4ga g i e Yom 1 GfF gro = aafHgf
& FIgS F WIT 34T & 47 W ST T@T € A7 WTH #39 & WU ga g1 g, derdiy sftwrd ¥ g
Fraa Fa7 F aoet o9 F g0 £ g #9 ST {491 S |
5. ¥gITs WAT—Eg sAfersor &7 fereia Afdasrd Hgars waT S6 &€ F WIH H4T off 999 4Ead §
Faa =iy #1371 ‘
(2) =¥ =ETEd A7 senfis afwr F fiereiy aftsiEl 1 98 auged 2es §9 9" FH1 F
THSTL BT &1 Fes 19 TXHT F GYg ‘F ATUH11ET g gHa-g97 U< Agia &Far o @1 g S
qARATS #1 S=EiE % S Agia Suafeddi ¥ Wgd Y & #7 ¢ RY S F 99 F seaedia

ol
6. R gy gur—(1) Ui aftwon F ferd aftmiat # ag ar siows 991 37 Qe st 5=
ATATAG] F FATATEN T 3T |

(2) =9 =ararag a1 dienfs afdaon, F ferdld aRsRa F wi ufduss 99 T4 aw F
qyg ' Affariat i a97 w Faat & @i RAiafag g
7. e Rama—adig afteor % derfiv gt o S g e arsar 61 giagnd
SAF AATAT F T YT It LT ST gl Feald veeq AT wared ¥ Al g, 987 i d FRig 940
(Rt wfaat) fam, 1944 § 7o swdfig glawie «i9 & g gaam € |
(2) =9 =raed ar @i sifeor % el s % fg, R glagie F07 ear
F HE 'F Atuwdl & 91 A Hant & gdiw Aftatg g
8. git—gi aftawer ¥ derdia aftwmiiat ¥ oy, gft 9 wdftg ama oy =mmwaEl & 4ana
Fraefier &1 a9T ATE] Ei |
(2) w9 @ 41 d@enfiE e F fHerfin afdmfaEr § e, gh § 44t sme F=a
LI & gyg 'F el & aur an) Rt & i EfRafaa g
9. w&m A war—(1) vy wfar & ferfia aftmfiar & Fo o s galse am-gEe
a7 FuTiRafd g& Ja= #7 a1 wiaad £t g § g oA a9 #1 wdy Bt e |

(2) =w =g T SEnfF aftwr F fenfe afeiat ¥ o Sy aw) § g T
FHATRET % forg a9t sag g T s w1 way Rt s | '



A—nnt_?kwfﬁ— —1L

(9 [I-EvE 3(i)] Y ST 99 ¢ SRR 3

10. AT wRAT— T sfaiiat i o0 Qe F awg 97 a6 & 9 a9 gHArEd F Aqar arEr
qT & gHard gl |
1. ggt aran Rama.—(1) agia afgewr ¥ dewfia aftafat F o = g F sgag oft ¥ fag
T ST &4 A7 Fgr T forg gt avn famana 2
(2) = =Ty A e st F $or aftefat F o g2 amn R o atgafat
#I g A F e 9T Wy ¥ araq ywiHaie st @1 gar an FaEt F adw ffaafie g
12. aTga waT.—(1) e Atdshor F dizreia sfgafat & o s g g g aar w
&¥ 5 Ao o F =9 § argd w1 99y B s |
(2) =5 T 41 A afdwor & Herdia afgsiat 51 ag Feey o & a1 3 amdm
FTAT F TGS & fory €26 #1X W a1 99+ a1eq #1990 wfagg yam fFu v veegas e i
ERT &Y |
13. SIGCr AT HAT—(1) S=aaq At F aeardt Gaai & o sag waaiaeor war aga senfis
ATAFLT AT 97 AT FT FAUZT F4 & U (@ & Gearag a5 7 aadaad F qaured gid ut
qEATAd & g L qeh BT AT AT AT T |
(2) =% =grEeg 47 denfis aftwor F feew aftsfat F o sraEor geEr g9
S F e 97 RgRe F aea @wiiaRe afe o Fa g F 791 avg [ad F
AFHTL G |
14. sferft wRw-ffRr efm—forda aftmiEt @ afeef s = F FE F aqan
ST T srafdr & S R A e e
15. &+ AT AT —37 HATAG 51 d[ad (o a1 § H15 Al Iude Ag) a410 T § qeqE q7 4+
et 1 a1 F Mgyt i ot ¥ gailq gt 11 Fa g & Al F e aw mmarem, et
st a7 T srfoor gy AR fave SR, sl el a1 s ue fAfRea areasrd g

16. Rrfrer st Y afRh 3wl e &1 o Rt  Feft gwde A Bl o ar vt F safwat $i aew
forferer s ofr arfew EfY

[€. §€-25025/05/2013-HTue1#-2)

it FHIE, G749 afsa

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(1) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(a) ‘*Act’” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);




A@,\MJLUU"@- T

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(b) "Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4.  Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/~ (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2) The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) - Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(ii) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
(i1i) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450
per month inclusive of gross pension, pension equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer, who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Ai]owance.—-(l) The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A" Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.——(1) For presiding nﬁ'cus of National Tribunals, the city cumpv:mawry
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courts.

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —A" Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
vperation, they s'hal] be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944.

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilities shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-" A” Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.—(l) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matters relaling to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A™ Officers of the Central Government.

9. House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-"A” Officers of the Central Government.

10. Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers §hall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment. »



Arngxure AL

[9m I-@vg 3(i)] ORd &1 TSYA : STHHR 5

11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a
staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance
shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14.  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

15. Other Conditions of Service—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the
Labour Court. Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the
Central Government thereon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-11]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



Annexure-III

Check-list for each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, Ernakulam

Name of the Officer:

SI. | Document Status of enclosure
No. of document

Y -Yes

N —No

NA — Not Applicable

1 Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer
during the last five years

2 Vigilance clearance of the officer

3 Integrity certificate of the officer

4 Annexure-IV
(Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)

5 Annexure-V
(Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer)

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General
of the concerned High Court)




Proforma for Bio-data

(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Annexure-1V

Name (in full)

Date of Birth

Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
Additional District Judge or equivalent post

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details Name of the last/current post
i Date of appointment to
respect | ast/current post

oflast/  Mpate of retirement

current

post Scale of pay

held Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no. (Office) - -

(Residential)

(Mobile)

E-mail address

Date:

Place:

Signature:

Name:



Annexure-V

Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years of each
judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
Central Government Industrial Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Ernakulam

Name of the Officer:

Sl. | Year/Period | Details of Details of | Details of

No. Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
Authority & | Authority & | Authority &
Grading Grading Grading

1

2

3

5 .

5

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)



