No. A-11016/9/2016-CLS-II
Government of India
Ministry of Labour & Employment

Aok kokok

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.

Dated 02.01.2017
To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Jaipur.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC) at Jaipur is to be filled up shortly in accordance with
the provisions contained in Sections 7 & 7A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (relevant
extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to these provisions, the post can be held
by a judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court or who has rendered not less
than three years’ service as an Additional District Judge or a District Judge. A serving Judge can
be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term. A retired Judge can be appointed
on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of appointment of a Judge to the post of
Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The Presiding Officers of the Labour Court,
Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions
of Service) Rules, 2015].

2 The scales of pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC are as
follows:

(i) Distt. Judge (Entry Level) - Rs.51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070/-
(ii) Distt. Judge (Selection Grade) - Rs.57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210-1540-70,290/-
(iii) Distt. Judge (Super time Scale) - Rs.70,290-1540-76,450/-
3. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who are willing to be appointed

as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC, Jaipur and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may please
be furnished to this Ministry within a period of two months from the date of issue of this letter
i.e. by 01.03.2017 for selection of a suitable officer. A set of three (03) proformas (Annexure-
IIT, IV & V) is to be included with each application. A check-list (copy placed at Annexure-
III) regarding the documents/copies enclosed may be sent with each application. The Bio-
Data of each of the officers may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-IV to be
filled by the concerned officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General. The
nomination of each of the officers may be forwarded along with an abstract of ACRs (if
applicable to the officer) of the last five years duly certified in the proforma placed at
Annexure-V, along with verified copies of ACR dossiers and vigilance clearance (if applicable).

| Continued on Page 2




s

4, It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the requirements, as
mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on terms and conditions mentioned
in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be furnished to this Ministry along with the
proformas (Annexure-III, IV & V) enclosed with each application.

5. It is urged that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas and the
last date of sending of applications may strictly be adhered to. It is informed that only the
nominations with complete proformas (Annexure-III, IV and V) and verified copies
of ACR dossiers (if applicable) received on/before 01.03.2017 will be considered by
the Ministry. The matter may kindly be treated as urgent.

6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

Yours faithfully,

[)/&l imai

(Raj Kumar)
Deputy Secretary to the Government of India
Tel. No. 011-23753079

Copy to:

1, Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC, Jaipur
may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2 All Deputy Chief Labour Commissioners (Central) with the request to take up the matter
with the Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

Encl: Annexure-I, II, III, IV & V. .
mar
(Raj Kumar)
Deputy Secretary to the Government of India



wre —L

u
v

Sec. 7] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 19

(2) A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for a limited period.

5. Boards of Conciliation.—(1) The appropriate Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Board of
Conciliation for promoling the settlement of an industrial dispute.

(2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four other members, as
the appropriate Government thinks fit. ’

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and any person appointed to represent a party shall be appointed on the
recommendation of that party:

Provided that, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the appropriate Government shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent thal party.

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwilhstanding the
absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that if the appropriate Government notifies the Board that the
services of the chairman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has
been appointed.

6. Courts of Inquiry.—(1) The appropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Court of Inquiry for -
inquiring into any matter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute.

(2) A Court may consist of one independent person or of such number of
independent persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the
chairman.

(3) A Courl, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding
the absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its
number:

Provided that, if the appropriate Government notifies the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be available, the Court shall not act until
a new chairman has been appointed.

7. Labour Courts.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour.Courts for the adjudications”

of-industrial"disputes’ relating“to-any-matter.specified in the Second Schedule

and for-performing such.other functions as may be assigned-to-them-under this *
Aet—

(2)-A-Labour Court ‘shall-consist of.one person only to be appointed by.the #
appropriate -Government.

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 7 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951).

e e T




1.

Azt i e

of.a Labour Court, unless—?w—f—f-‘

The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

(3) A persen shall not be qualified for a oingngx_\t__as,_mg_gggggl;u_\_g officer »

e

}[{a) _he is, or has been, a Judge of a High ,Co{l_;i_; Or#

. (b) hehas, fora period of not less than thrée years, been a District Judge .

eran_Additional District Judge; or,

2[..1-1} Bt SRR L

*[(d)]_he has held any judicial offic

e in
i LA™ e e S S L S G LT et e e

India for not less than seven years;
3[(¢)] he has been the presiding officer of a Labour Court constituted,
©7indér any Provincial ‘Act or State“Act for not'less’ thanfive years.]
4[(f) he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.(Central) or

Joint Commissioner of the State Labour Department, having a
degree -in-law-and.at least seven years’ experience in the labour
deﬁal‘tm?’“t including three years of experience .as Conciliation
Offfpet A aI= Wil il « e b W R
Provided that no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or
Joint- Labour Commissioner.shall be®appointed unless-he. resigris/
from-theservice-of-the Central Governiment or State Government, as
the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]
4|(g) he is an officer of ndian Legal Service in Gradeé III with three years’

experience in the grade/] et S T U
S A A T .
STATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-

lettered as clause (d)), for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”.

[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 29-4-1964).] - ~ : )
Goa—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,

& “(d1) he !\as‘.é)ractised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in lwo or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force; or h

(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university es';aElishud by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not’ lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of any Industrail Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituted under any law for tie time being in force for not less than five *

ears; or
(d3) Ke holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
; or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner of Labour under a State Government or a
Union territory administration for not less than five years; or”.
[Vide Goa Act’5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).] - i ;
Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),— # ! e
i) in clause (b), after the words “Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or a
Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”; « 0 = =4 AL
(ii; in clause (d), for the words “seven years” subslitule the words “five years”;
(iii) in clause (e}, for the words “five years” substitute the words “three years” and at
the end of the clause, insert the word “or”; -
(iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(f) he has practised as an advocate or attarney for not less than seven years in a
__High Court or any Court subordinate thereto or in any Industrial Court or
In Iuslrial Tribunal or Labour Court constituted under any law for the time being
in force.” i gy

"1, Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.c.f, 15-12-1964).

2. Clause (c) omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f 21-8-1984).

“3. Clauses (a) and (b) relettered as clauses (d) and () respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.c.f.

15-12-1964).
4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

Sec. 7] - The Industrial Disputes. Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.]

Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—

(‘3 for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namegee—

“(b) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has n, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge or; and” )
_(ii) after ¢lause (c), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(cc) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
. Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a Joint
Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.

[Vide Haryana -Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]

Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— - .
¥ “(1A) In addition to the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall

try offences punishable under this Agt and the Acts specified in Part B of the

Second Schedule.” ‘

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-1-1982).]

In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted
above), has been omitted. \

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellancous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).] e _

7 Maharashtra,—In section 7, iry sub-section (3), afler clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— - ailk 4 y i g '

4 “(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the

High Court, or any court subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal
or kiabuur Court, constituted under any law for the time being in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India

and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fiyg:years; or”.

[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 2.] .

Alter clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely:— '

“(d3) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than five
years; or”,

[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-5-1976).]

Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namely:—
£ "(3 he is or has been a District Judge; or :

(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate
Tribunal constituted under the Industrial Dispytes (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two years.”

[Vide Punjab Act B of 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f, 3-6-1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1966 (w.e,f. 1-11-1966).)

Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.l. 21-8-1984}.

Uttar. Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— g

s “(3A) In relation to industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i) of
clause . (a) of section 2. or in secton 4 of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shall have
effect as if— - . i o% ‘

(a) after clause (¢) the following new clauses (d) and (e) had been added:—
“(d) is or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding two
£ars; g ;
(e) is a person possessing more than two years’ practical experience of
adjudieating or settling industrial disputes™; - ' ;
(b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)” the words “or clause (d) or clause
(e)” had been added”. i e e

[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f. 26-6-1951),] £

Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior to the amendmenls made.by Lhe
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for'‘clause (b) substitute the following
clause, namely:— ] B — <

“(b) he’is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”. -

« [Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-1-1989).] '




Ar\ nexure—\

22 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

' COMMENTS
Right of Labour Court
The Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest of justice to seck
proper assistance and grant ‘leave’ to a party before it is represented by a legal
practiioner; T.K. Varghese v. Nichimen Corporation, (2002) IV LLJ ( pp) Bom 1018.

'I7A+Tribunals.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification in® ..

the - Official“Gazette; - constitute - one*"or * more-Industrial-Tribunals -for - the
adjudication-of-industrial disputes relating to any matter, whether specified in
the-Sezcond-Schedule-or_the Third Schedule 2[and for _performing such other

LS -

“functions as-may be-assigned-to-them nder” this Act].

(2- A- Tribunal-shall-consist-of-ene- person=only-to be_appainted _by_the-

appropriate Government.
(3 A person shall.not he_qualified for appointment as the presiding officer
of a Tribunal-unless—
(a).~he is; or-has been,-a-Judge-of a.High Court;-or*~
%(aa) . he has, for a period of not less than threge-years, been a District Judge
) or.an Additional District-Judge; 4[**4]]".
“[(b)._he.is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or
: Joint ,Commissioner. .of the State” Labour Department,_ having .a
degree in law and at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department--including~three~years™of-experience—as~Conciliation
Officer:
Provided..that_no. such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner..or
Joint Labour. Commissioner-~shall..be appointed unless he resigns

from the service of the Central Government or State Government, -as-

the case may be, before being appainted as the presiding officer; or]
I{c) he isan officer.of Indian Legal-Service in-Grade-1[I-with-three- years’
experience-in-the-grade’] O ‘

as_assessors-to.advise-the.Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

STATE AMENDMENTS

J;Lssa.m.-w—-ln section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the following clause,

namely—

"Kn) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court:

Provided that the appointment to a Tribunal of any person qualified under this
clause shall not be made without consultation with the Assam High Court; or”.
[Vile Assam' Act 8 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962).] 1D
I%ihm_‘.—ln section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the following clause,
namely:— - - ¥ . vty
“(aa) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years: i
Provided that the appointment to a Tribunal of any person qualified under this
clause shall be made in consultation with the High Court of the State in which the
Tribunal has or is intended to have, its usual place of sitting; or”,
[Vide Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 7-7-1959).]

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

2. Irs. by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4(a) (w.e.f. 21-8-1984),

3. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964),

4. The word “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

5. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010). Earlier clause (b) was omitted by Act 46 of 1982,
sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.ef 15-9-2010).

(4) The appropriate-Government.may, if it 5o thinks fit, appoint two persons.

Sec. 7A]

The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23

Gua.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitute the following clauses,
namely:—
“(b) he is, or has been, a District Judge; or
(c) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
, or an Assistant Judge; or :
(d) he is-qualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
[Vide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.e.l. 21-10-1987).]
Gujarat.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3),—
(i) in clause (aa), after the words “an Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or
a Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”;
(ii) in clause (b) [Ed. clause (b) has beeq omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)], insert the word “or” at the end;
(iii) after clause (b), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(c) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force”.
[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.]
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (c), insert, the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of Assistant
Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years”.
[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 1-8-1981).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.l. 21-8-1984).
Haryana.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3),—
. (i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge; or”; and
(ii) after'clause (aa), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(aaa) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a
Joint Labour Commissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, se'c. 3 (w.ef. 12-8-1976).]
Kerala.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), substitute the following clause,
namely:— .
“(a) he is, or has been, a judicial officer not below the rank of a District Judge, or is
qualified for appointment as a Judge of a High Court; or”.
[Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 (w.ef. 27-7-1961)).
Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7A, for sub-section (3), substitute the following sub-section,
namely:— i
“(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the Presiding Officer of a
‘Tribunal unless—
(a) he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or -
(b) he is eligible for being appointed a Judge of a High Court; o
(c) he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or
(d) he has worked as a member of the Board of Revenue for a period of not less
than three years; or
(e) he has worked as Commissioner of Labour for a period of not less than three
years; or



,Q.W.\Q_}(“r‘a o

24 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7A

(f) he has worked as a member of the Indusirial Court constituted under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),
for a period of not less than five years.” :

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec, 3 (w.e.f. 15-1-1989).]

Maharashtra.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “Judge of a
High Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or a person qualified for appointment as a
Judge of a High' Court”. o ;

[Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 4-1-1963).] ;

In section' 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (aa), for the words “an Addilional District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an Assistant Judge or”.

After clause (b), [Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-B-1984)), insert the following clause, namely:— AL K

“(c) he has for not less than five years been a presiding officer of a Labour Court,

constituted under any law for the time being in force.”
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3.]
Alter clause (¢) insert the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank’ than  that of
Assistant Commussioner of Labour under the State Gavernunent for not less than ten
years.”” : 3 - =
[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3. :
Mysore (Karnataka).—(1) In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the
following clause, namely:— ) ;
“(aa)-he is, or has been, a District Judge, or”.
[Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 31-1-1963).]
(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, afler the words “District Judge”,
insert the words “for a period of not less than three years.” = J
[Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-12-1963).]
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984), -
Orissa.—In section 74, in sub-section (3), alter clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:— : ' :
“(an) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of not
less than seven years.” ; : 3
[Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960).] : :
West Bengal.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a Districl Judge or an Addilional District Judge”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-9-1958).)
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following clause, namely: —
“(aa) he.is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”..
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4.

COMMENTS
PPower to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal .

Seclion 7A empowers the appropriate Government to constitute one or more
Industrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any matter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Sharina v, Rajasthan Patrika Ltd., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

Sec. 7C] ) The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 25

1[7B. National Tribunals.—(1) The Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more National Industrial Tribunals for
the adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opinion of the Central
Government, involve questions of national importance or are of such a nature
that industrial establishments situated in more than one State are likely to be
iplcrested in, or affected by, such disputes. ol

(2) A National Tribunal shall consist of one person only t6 be appoi
the Central Government. : i Yiss ety

(3) A person shall not be qualified for apﬁohtment as the presid,ihg officer

-of a National. Tribunal ?[unless he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court].

(4) The Central Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint tlwo persons as
assessors to advise the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

7c. Di'squalifica.tions‘for the presiding officers of ' Labour 'Courts,

- Tribunals and’ National Tribunals.—No person shall be appointed to, or

continue in, the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or
National Tribunal, if— v R S '

(a) hg is not an independent person; or :

(b) he has attained the age of sixty-five years.]

STATE AMENDMENTS .
Assam.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—
“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
- Government attains  the age of sixty-five years before the completion of any
proceedings pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of
such Government public interést so requires, order his continuance in office for a
: period not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.” )
[Vide Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962) ] ' '
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7C, for clause (b), substitute the following
clause, namely:— i : J ¥ ik :
“(b) he has attali.ne'cl the age of sixty-seven years”. =
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec: 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the Central Act 31 of 1966.]
West Bengal.—In section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following proviso, namely:—
“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before completion of any proceedings
pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of such
Government public interest so requires, order his continuance in office for a period
; not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”
[Vide West Bengal Act 11 of 1959, sec. 3 (w.e.f, 27-10-1959).] '

_ . SECTION 7D i
Gujarat.—After secton 7C, insert the following section, namely:—

“7D. Certain District Judges gualified for appointments on Tribunal constituted
by State Government.—Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) of
section 7A,— ) A . -

(1) The State Government may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
seclion for performing such other functions as may be assigned to it under this Act.

.(2) Where the State Government constitutes a Tribunal under section 7A, the
Tribunal may consist of a person who is, or has been, for a period of not less than

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957),

" 2. 'Subs, by Act.46 of 1982, sec. 5, for certain words (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).




Annexure —1

26 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Sec. 7C

5 years, a District Judge or an Additional or Joint District Judge and
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appointment as the
presiding officer of the Tribunal.

(3) The appointment of a person qualified under clause (2) shall be made after
consultation with the High Court.”

[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 9-8-1962).]

8. Filling of vacancies.—If, for any reason a vacancy (other -than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribuna! or National Tribunal or in the office of the Chairman or any other
member of a Board or Court, then, in the case of a National Tribunal, the Central
Government and in any other case, the appropriate Government, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Act to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is filled.]

2[9. Finality of orders constituting Boards, etc.—(1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appointing any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or National Tribunal shall be called in
question in any manner; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court
shall be called in question in any manner on the ground merely of the existence
of any vacancy in, or defect in the constitution of, such Board or Court.

(2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason only of the fact that such settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in sub-section (6) of section 12 or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be.

(3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course of conciliation
proceeding before a Board is signed by the Chairman and all the other members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or
unforeseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the Board
during any stage of the proceeding.]

3[CHAPTER IIA
NOTICE OF CHANGE

- 9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes to effect any change in
the conditions of service applicable to any workman in respect of any matter
specified in the Fourth Schedule, shall effect such change,— :

(a) without giving to the workmen likely to be affected by such change
a notice in the prescribed manner of the nature of the change
proposed to be effected; or
(b) within twenty-one days of giving such notice:
Provided that no notice shall be required for effecting any such change—

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 8 was substituted

by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951). - ¥

2. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). FJ!rlier section 9 was amended §

by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951).
3. Chapter IIA (containing sections 9A and 9B) ins, by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

Ll
H
i
i



Amu_)t Wwre —1

=T o EBlo Udo-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

ASTUA

d ShT
Che Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
A [1—a@vg 3 3IU-GUe (i)
PART I1—Section 3 Sub-section (i)
yifereRTt | WeRTiyT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| 275] 7§ faeelt, agwafaam, ade 30, 2015/4vm@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

T 3L TS HATHT
afagEaT
7% faeeft, 6 ardier, 2015

ar.#1.MA. 336().—F=T T, et fAaw afaftas, 1947 £ gy 38 $ v-amr (1) #
T () I Waw Afehat F1 940 F3d gu Awtafad Fa aardt g, saiq —

1. dfRm 7 R e —(1) 3+ Rt i dfEn ar aw merrer, et afiwer she gt it
(Fa9, 9 T v AT F Aaeaq i o) Fam, 2015 2

(2) F 75T H I WHAH F @ F wgd i |
2. qftarerg.—(1) =7 Fast § st 7 & gt § svrar sfea 9 81—
(%) “affaay” ¥ sienfas B g, 1947 (1947 #714) sfdvia €

(@) “Frarfta afdswrd & afaffoag & g 7, o 7% a1 gy 79 F il ferdia afiwrd F =9
¥ fAer =rfee arfea &

(2) 37 @3t @7 9t ¥F, o g9 Fawt § wyen @ qar afvafie 98 @ wiq sfefam § ofonfia 2
I aat o & S 3 afaffay § e s

3. sl — fara At 61 fierie aftwr F =1 § gt £ g §, afafaie £ ot
araTeoradT €19 a9 £ 2rft i Farfage Frredver £t zen # Fafts Saz ot £ srg o F oo geft )

1926 GI/2015 (1)



A,mu(u.re -1

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

4. Faa.—(1) ug afgwror F fizrfia afgwrd @1 397 80,000 = (Fa«) wfdar & Fua s & e
& o siafa fare =madtar $i zar § afafgie war s darfdga amade 6 2o § a5q@ do7
i

(2) =¥ ~TATAT AT ATSAF SATerFor o Frordia sAfaa &1 aaq [fw g —

(i) forar =arerefier (wfafe ww) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 =.

(i) fSret =ravefter (s=w 9vft) — 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 %.

(iil) FSrert =araefisr (@i Faw) - 70,290-1540-76,450 .

ufer 91 ¥ Jav § aeer Yom, o7 auqeq a1 a7 farfAgfy F wgg oft € aR FE e

gig 78 ¥ flerfia afdsrd ¥ =7 § vF s £ Rgfe & zon F, s =l dar a1 99 qeg 99
ST (F41) AT ST HLHTT F G4 g + U2  qarfage g & e Gaa 4 OfF gra Bl el
& FTgS T WTH AT & I7 T T TEr & AT Wi F4 & oy gaere g1 w4 g, fenita sfderd ¥ fou 9w
FRaa 399 & dae Yo F aua? ft @w &9 w5 Rar s

5. HEATE WAT—Eg ditEr & faraid @fdm qeeg w6 9" 5T § 9w #30 §l 999 A §
AT A # T E |
(2) =y FrrTey 4r senfis sfgwor F derfia afdmfE #1 ag aagea qgms 99 9w #9 F
THAIL B ST FedlT 99FR F 9ug ' AAEal g aug-a9g uT agia B ar @ g .
gAfaeH 1 wafa & S agfa suaferat § vga 9u9 F #9 5 Ru 99 & ad & qegdia

gt
6. AR wiqaE war.—(1) gt afteeor F ferfia sttt @ ag 7 afoqgs w7 27 g Sy 3=
AT F FATarete F#13T E |

(2) 9| e 47 dentid afdwor, & feonfa aftefat ¥ q gfigs 99 30 saw F
ayg ‘& aftsfat 1 291 e [Faat ¥ adia Afaataa g
7. Tl fama—dtg sl & ferdia aftrmfat oo g aoer @ Dear $i giaemg
IFF AT F I 9T IS AT AT FgT FA g T AT TG § A8 g, 98f U F Feaig a41
(ﬁﬁwﬁaﬁ)ﬁmwﬁﬁawmﬁmgﬁmaﬁ%%qwaﬁl
(2) =9 =rared g1 s affsor F feondia aftmfa F o, Rl gRui 36 @
F aqg ' AfdawfEt 1 a1 an Fat F adfia A gl
8. gi—dig wftaw F derdia aftwfat & v, gf & @&5fde ama 9g =naedt § a9
=TT T TAT I €T |
(2) =5 AT 4t gt aftmor ¥ ferfim aftmtaEr 5 o, gt & ddfta ames 3=
U F 99 ‘F digwar £ q47 an) Rt F sefia @Rt g
9. wF fRET war—(1) g afdEe ¥ fenftn aftmfat F o G g gafsa am-giEe
a1 garfeafd gor daq &1 fw sfaaa Fi a2 & g o 9= &1 yde B s )

(2) =g =mared |7 srenfiE afterr & derdm aftwiE & o s g § a9g F
FHATTAT & foro 297 937 g Grorar s &1 gay fEar s |



Avnexure =T

. [wT 1I-|vg 3(i)] R T T9A : SEERI] 3

10. ImET war—fterdT afgwiat 1 37 @A F q997 97 6] 2720 9 999 gFAET F SHAT JrAT
ST F gHATE B |

1. g 3 Ramaa.—(1) ot stz & et sttt % o el avwe & agay aoft F oo
7T AT T4 7 Ferd F forg gt aran R gt

(2) =/ =TaTEd i s E attEr F denfa afmta F oo g2t aen fara derfta afeemfat
#t qaftare F s o Fafe F amEa wiata ==t # 5 g anp Faet F sfia @Rt gem
12. AT wT.—(1) g srfaraeor & farim afearfon & o =t avse g auy aug a AfEfEa
1 7€ e ww F 59§ argT ww= #1 99w B s

(2) =9 =rarag Av et atawr & ferfa sttt #1 gg Bwer @ & ar 3 aad
1T % TATST F oo w206 w1 o A1 a9 rEA w1 9Anr gfdEe ge e e gugee e e
BT FL |
13. TATIGLOr ATAT WRT.—(1) I=94a9 Avff F AT Fa1 F &0 aqe saEEer 997 ag st
HTAHTOT AT AW AT FT FEALT FA F (A0 W T GATAT TF AT AHARAT F THIA 2 9T
HEATA & g A qF & SATATALI ATAT AT 2T |

(2) == =rTed ar senfiE aftwer F ferim safimiar & o eraiEor aEr s=n
A % areame w FgfRE % araq qatta =i % o Fede e F qar ang At §
ALHTL BT |
14. et wfRw-fRE v —ferfm gttt #1 afveel sfeefRE =i a B 5 aqae
qAfaaTe i srafar F S e #1 aw 2n |
15. 97 qAT AL —37 FATHA H1 arad Bk Ay § FrE ASIE ITSY AL A9 AU F qLAT AT A
et i a1 F Payat s gt & qafia qraet #1156 awe # @A 5 fo gy s, i
sttt ar Tt arfereor g FETor i stTaar, e i aeare 1 3 o fafeas arersrd g

16. TRy s Y e —F=dr wreaTe 1 5 et ¥ R e #1 fft 3 an vt % =it f aEa
farferer sver it orfer 2nfy |

(/. S=-25025/05/2013-FTUe1H-2]

efrest FHTe, Fgad af=e

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (¢) of sub-section(1) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules, 2015.

(2)  They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazetle.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(a) “*Act’ means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947);



ﬂmexw«; -—I[

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(b) *Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned 1o them in the Acl.

3. Duration.—In case of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4. Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/- (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2) The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) - Rs. 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(ii) the District Judge (Selection Grade) —~ Rs. 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
(iii) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450
per month inclusive of gross pension, pension equivalent or other retirement benefits, if any:

Provided that in the case of an appeintment of a person as a presiding officer, who has retired from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals, the city compensatory
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courts. ‘

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —"A” Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operation, they shall be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944.

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilities shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-* A" Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave—(l) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the matiers relating to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government.

9. House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“A” Officers of the Central Government.

10.  Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.




Amnexure —IC

[H=m [1-Evs 3(i)] WA =hT TS : SAAHR 5

11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a
staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance
shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14,  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

15. Other Conditions of Service.—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the
Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision, and the decision of the
Central Government thercon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to relax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z2-25025/05/2013-CLS-II]
DHEERAJ KUMAR, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager. Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



Annexure-III

Check-list for each judicial officer to be considered for the post
of Presiding Officer, CGIT-cum-Labour Court, Jaipur

Name of the Officer:

Sl. | Document Status of enclosure
No. of document

Y -Yes

N —-No

NA — Not Applicable

1 Copies of Annual Confidential Reports of the officer
during the last five years

2 Vigilance clearance of the officer

3 Integrity certificate of the officer

4 Annexure-IV
(Proforma for Bio-Data of the Officer)

5 Annexure-V
(Proforma for ACR Gradings for the last five years of the
Officer)

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General
of the concerned High Court)




Annexure-IV

Proforma for Bio-data
(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Name (in full)

Date of Birth

Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
Additional District Judge or equivalent post

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details Name of the last/current post

in Date of appointment to
respect | |ast/current post

of last/  "pate of retirement
current = —
Dok cale of pay

held Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no. (Office)
(Residential)
(Mobile)
E-mail address
Date: Signature:

Place: Name:




Annexure-V
Proforma for abstract of ACR Gradings for the ACRs of the last five years of each

judicial officer to be considered for the post of Presiding Officer,
Central Government Industrial Tribunal-cum-Labour Court, Jaipur

Name of the Officer:

Sl. | Year/Period | Details of Details of | Details of

No. Reporting Reviewing | Accepting
Authority & | Authority & | Authority &
Grading Grading Grading

1

2

3

4

5

(Sign and Seal of the
Registrar General)




